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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours Value
05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 

regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Officer Wellness sections (.30); document 
productions (.10); and draft IMT comments 
(.10).

0.50 197.50

05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50

05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed CPD document 
productions related to Data and Officer 
Wellness sections.

0.70 276.50

05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted IMT comments related to Data and 
Officer Wellness section.

0.50 197.50

05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data, Supervision, and Officer 
Wellness meeting.

0.50 197.50

05/01/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed IMR-10 report timeline, 
deadlines, and guidance.

0.20 79.00

05/01/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting periods

1.20 540.00

05/01/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.20 990.00

05/01/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Impartial Policing section

0.70 315.00

05/01/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

0.60 270.00

05/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise and supplement draft 
correspondence to City re OEMC 
compliance assessments in IMR9

0.30 126.00

05/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Correspondence from B. Bryson re IMR10 
deadlines and specific guidance for 
forthcoming submissions

0.40 168.00
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05/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with A. 

Sepulveda and L. Clancey re draft 
response to City re OEMC training 
paragraph assessments in IMR9

0.40 168.00

05/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from J. Bagby re IMR9 
assessments for paragraphs 142 and 143

0.10 42.00

05/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from L. Clancey re recent 
productions for crisis intervention

0.10 42.00

05/01/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend monthly internal pilot sync-up with 
Officer Wellness, Use of Force, and 
Supervision.

0.40 150.00

05/01/24 Maggie Hickey IMT leadership meeting (1.0); 
communications with Coalition and 
Judge's chambers regarding settlement 
conference (.2); discussion regarding 
resolution of CIT IMR-9 issues (.5); and 
review of draft IMT comments (.8).

2.50 1,250.00

05/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting, 
including discussion of IMR9, 
Comprehensive Assessment Part II, 
monthly meetings (.60); DNC preparation 
(.50)

1.10 495.00

05/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT ISR meeting, 
including discussion of methodologies and 
expected deliverables.

0.80 360.00

05/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly internal IMT cross-sectional 
meeting regarding CPD pilots, including 
discussion of CPD productions and 
meetings.

0.40 180.00

05/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise UOF and Data comments 
on CPD policy and forms.

0.10 45.00

05/01/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency section 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

0.50 197.50

05/01/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Meeting with CPD regarding Daily 
Observation Reports.

0.30 118.50

05/02/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention section.

0.10 39.50

05/02/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 

1.00 450.00
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compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting periods

05/02/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.00 450.00

05/02/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

0.60 270.00

05/02/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

2.00 900.00

05/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with A. 
Sepulveda re historical assessments for 
paragraphs 142 and 143 in prior 
monitoring reports

0.50 210.00

05/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Conference with A. Sepulveda re IMR9 0.10 42.00

05/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with A. Sepulveda and J. 
Bagby re IMR9 and OEMC training 
paragraphs

0.50 210.00

05/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with L. Clancey 
re recent response received from the City 
re IMR9

0.20 84.00

05/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from A. Sepulveda re 
CPD directives issued in April 2024

0.10 42.00

05/02/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly Supervision call regarding 
methodologies.

1.00 375.00

05/02/24 Maggie Hickey Meetings with A. Sepulveda regarding 
draft IMR-9, comprehensive assessment 
and Coalition filing.

1.00 500.00

05/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/OAG meeting regarding Use of Force 
considerations.

0.80 360.00

05/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/CPD meeting regarding ISR 
deliverables and methodologies.

1.60 720.00

05/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 0.30 135.00

05/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly IMT/CPD/OAG UOF meeting. 1.00 450.00

05/02/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Revise IMT response to recruitment and 
training productions.

0.90 355.50
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05/03/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 

regarding Data and Use of Force sections 
(.10); document productions, draft IMT 
comments, and CPD directives (.10).

0.20 79.00

05/03/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed draft IMT comments related to 
Data and Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

0.50 225.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Community Policing 
section

0.50 225.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.80 360.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.90 855.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, the 
Chicago Police Department regarding the 
Accountability and Transparency section

0.30 135.00

05/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Data Analysis, Collection, 
and Management section

0.20 90.00

05/03/24 Brian J Hamilton Conference with A. Sepulveda and L. 
Clancey re IMR9 assessments for 
paragraphs 142 and 143

0.50 210.00

05/03/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise IMR9 appendix re paragraphs 142 
and 143 assessments and route to A. 
Sepulveda

0.50 210.00

05/03/24 Brian J Hamilton Analyze notes from H. Melendez re topics 
covered during most recent monthly 

0.60 252.00
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meeting with the City in preparation of 
discussing same during upcoming crisis 
intervention check in meeting

05/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD draft policy.

0.20 90.00

05/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise comments on CPD draft 
policy.

1.60 720.00

05/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze City/CPD proposed 
draft policy language in letter to Coalition.

0.20 90.00

05/03/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Revise draft IMT response to recruitment 
production.

0.80 316.00

05/04/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.20 540.00

05/05/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review and analyze recent productions. 0.80 300.00

05/05/24 Maggie Hickey Call with R. Monroe regarding issues with 
accountability paragraphs in IMR-9.

1.50 750.00

05/06/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City and CPD 
document productions.

0.20 79.00

05/06/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments related to 
Data and Officer Wellness sections.

0.30 118.50

05/06/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Officer Wellness sections (.30); draft IMT 
comments (.10); meeting scheduling with 
CPD (.10).

0.50 197.50

05/06/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

05/06/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communication from CPD 
related to Data section regarding meeting 
scheduling and draft directive.

0.10 39.50

05/06/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.00 450.00

05/06/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, the 

0.40 180.00
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Chicago Police Department, and the Office 
of the Illinois Attorney General's Office 
regarding the Community Policing section

05/06/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.90 855.00

05/06/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.50 675.00

05/06/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.40 180.00

05/06/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise most recent version of IMR9 and 
route to A. Sepúlveda

0.20 84.00

05/06/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from B. Bryson re recent 
productions from City

0.10 42.00

05/06/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review recent productions. 0.10 37.50

05/06/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/CPD weekly check-in (.5); 
communications and calls with City 
regarding IMR-9 issue (1); IMT leadership 
review regarding IMR-9 paragraphs at 
issue with CPD (1.5); IMT CET meeting 
(.5); and draft IMR-9 updates reviewed 
(.5).

4.00 2,000.00

05/06/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly City/CPD/IMT check-in meeting. 0.50 225.00

05/06/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.30 118.50

05/06/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal section meeting for 
recruitment and training.

0.40 158.00

05/06/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze training productions. 0.30 118.50

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections (.10); meeting scheduling with 
CPD (.10); document productions (.10); 
and draft IMT comments (.10).

0.40 158.00

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with City, CPD, and OAG 0.20 79.00
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regarding meeting scheduling.

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Attended internal IMT Use of Force 
section meeting.

0.40 158.00

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Crisis Intervention section meeting.

1.30 513.50

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50

05/07/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed CPD document 
production related to Data section.

0.20 79.00

05/07/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 5/2 productions.

0.90 175.50

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Supervision and Officer 
Wellness and Support sections

1.10 495.00

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.50 225.00

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.40 630.00

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.50 225.00

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.50 675.00

05/07/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Crisis Intervention section

0.80 360.00

05/07/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend weekly crisis intervention meeting 
to discuss recent productions, IMR9 
revisions, and revised methodologies

1.30 546.00

05/07/24 Brian J Hamilton Review agenda for upcoming call from L. 0.40 168.00
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Clancey and prepare salient points to 
discuss during weekly check-in meeting 
for crisis intervention

05/07/24 Brian J Hamilton Review document prepared by L. Clancey 
action items for drafting IMR10

0.50 210.00

05/07/24 Brian J Hamilton Review further revised IMR9 for crisis 
intervention section submitted to City

0.30 126.00

05/07/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Weekly Officer Wellness meeting 
regarding productions, compliance 
determinations, and methodologies.

1.10 412.50

05/07/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise methodologies for Officer 
Wellness.

3.00 1,125.00

05/07/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise methodologies for Supervision. 1.10 412.50

05/07/24 Maggie Hickey Check-in with Supt. Snelling (.5); and 
review IMT communications (.5).

1.00 500.00

05/07/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 0.40 180.00

05/07/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD draft 
policy and training materials.

0.10 45.00

05/07/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT no objection 
notice.

0.50 197.50

05/07/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Email correspondence with IMT members 
regarding the Accountability and 
Transparency section of Independent 
Monitoring Report 9.

0.40 158.00

05/07/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and finalize no objection notice to 
recruitment production.

0.30 118.50

05/07/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend monthly IMT/CPD/OAG recruitment 
meeting.

0.50 197.50

05/07/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Meeting with CPD and OPSA to discuss 
CPD hiring process.

0.30 118.50

05/08/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data section, document 
production, and draft comments.

0.10 39.50

05/08/24 Alex J. Becker Attended internal IMT attorneys meeting to 
discuss updates regarding monitoring 
reports, methodologies, issues pending 
judicial resolution, and other upcoming 
items.

0.50 197.50

05/08/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Attending internal IMT biweekly meeting 0.60 117.00
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regarding CPD productions, 
methodologies, and pending Court 
decisions.

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

2.30 1,035.00

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

1.10 495.00

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team and Chief Judge 
Rebecca Pallmeyer

0.50 225.00

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records provided to the 
Independent Monitoring Team from the 
City of Chicago

0.50 225.00

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, the 
Chicago Police Department, the Office of 
the Illinois Attorney General, and the 
Coalition regarding Chicago Police 
Department policies

2.00 900.00

05/08/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.70 315.00

05/08/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend bi-weekly internal AFS meeting to 
discuss IMR9, methodologies, and 
pending productions

0.50 210.00

05/08/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise methodologies for Supervision 
paragraphs.

0.70 262.50

05/08/24 Maggie Hickey Chicago IMT Leadership Team meeting 
(1); monthly Police Board and IMT/OAG 
meeting (.8); preparation for as well as 
attend meeting with Judge Pallmeyer and 
A. Sepulveda (1.8); preparation for as well 
as attend monthly meeting to discuss 
Multiple Arrest Policies – Coalition, City, 
OAG and IMT (3.6).

7.20 3,600.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.00 450.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Bi-monthly internal IMT AFS meeting. 0.50 225.00
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05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD draft 

policy and training materials.
0.60 270.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT ISR meeting. 1.10 495.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo City/CPD/Coalition meeting regarding 
coordinated multiple arrest policies.

1.90 855.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
meeting with Coalition and public hearing 
regarding traffic stops.

0.80 360.00

05/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet with J. Pallmeyer regarding search 
warrant order and Coalition/City/CPD 
negotiations.

0.40 180.00

05/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's AFS team 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

0.50 197.50

05/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly meeting with the Police 
Board, the OAG, and the IMT.

0.30 118.50

05/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency section 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

0.90 355.50

05/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
methodologies.

0.10 39.50

05/08/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal bi-weekly attorney meeting. 0.70 276.50

05/08/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and finalize IMT response to 
recruitment production.

0.60 237.00

05/09/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments related to 
Data section and prepared for submission 
(.40); revised/updated methodologies 
related to Data section (.40).

0.80 316.00

05/09/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Officer Wellness, and 
Crisis Intervention sections (.70); draft IMT 
comments (.30); upcoming meetings with 
City and CPD (.10); and updates to 
methodologies (.20).

1.30 513.50

05/09/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communication from City and 
CPD regarding upcoming meeting related 
to Data section.

0.10 39.50

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 

0.20 90.00
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reporting period

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing materials provided by the City 
of Chicago to the Independent Monitoring 
Team

2.30 1,035.00

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

1.80 810.00

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, the 
Chicago Police Department, and the Office 
of the Illinois Attorney General's Office 
regarding Chicago Police Department 
policies

1.20 540.00

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.80 360.00

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.20 90.00

05/09/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.00 450.00

05/09/24 Brian J Hamilton Analyze J. Solomon feedback on City 
production re CIT Recruit Concept 
Trainings and CIT recruitment efforts

0.80 336.00

05/09/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise methodologies for Supervision. 2.00 750.00

05/09/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly Supervision call regarding 
compliance, methodologies, and 
productions.

0.80 300.00

05/09/24 Maggie Hickey Chicago IMT Leadership Team and OAG 
meeting regarding CMA policy (1.6); 
review draft IMT comments (1.2) 
preparation for as well as give 
presentation at 15th District Council 
meeting (3.2).

6.00 3,000.00

05/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
UOF methodologies.

0.50 225.00
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05/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo City/CPD/OAG/IMT meeting to discuss 

coordinated multiple arrest policy 
discussions with the Coalition.

0.90 405.00

05/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD draft 
policies and training materials.

0.80 360.00

05/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD draft policy.

0.30 135.00

05/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Debrief within the IMT regarding 
City/OAG/IMT meeting regarding 
coordinated multiple arrest policy 
discussions with the Coalition.

0.50 225.00

05/09/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly meeting with COPA, the 
OAG, and the IMT.

0.80 316.00

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data section (.50); draft IMT 
comments (.60); methodologies (.30); 
document productions (.10); and meeting 
scheduling (.10).

1.60 632.00

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communications with City and 
CPD related to Data and Use of Force 
sections.

0.10 39.50

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed IMT and OAG 
comments related to Use of Force section; 
reviewed updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments related to 
Data section and prepared for submission.

0.20 79.00

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data section meeting.

0.70 276.50

05/10/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City and CPD 
document productions related to Data and 
Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team and the Office of the 
Illinois Attorney General regarding general 
updates

0.40 180.00

05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Impartial Policing section

0.50 225.00
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05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 

Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Community Policing 
section

0.30 135.00

05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.90 405.00

05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Office of the Illinois Attorney General 
regarding documents, requests, and 
productions

0.50 225.00

05/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.70 315.00

05/10/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from B. Bryson re most 
recent productions from City

0.10 42.00

05/10/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review production response with A. 
Becker.

0.40 150.00

05/10/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Submit production response. 0.20 75.00

05/10/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly OAG check-in (.5); 
communications regarding Search 
Warrant decision by Judge Pallmeyer 
(1.2); call with A. Sepulveda regarding 
upcoming June hearing (1.2); and review 
draft IMT materials (.5).

3.40 1,700.00

05/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT Data meeting. 0.50 225.00

05/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call. 0.50 225.00

05/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
public hearing on traffic stops and order 
regarding same.

0.20 90.00

05/11/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

1.30 585.00

05/11/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for the Chief Judge Rebecca R 0.60 270.00
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Pallmeyer's upcoming public hearings

05/12/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

0.50 225.00

05/12/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise Supervision methodologies. 4.30 1,612.50

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
related to Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections (.10); meeting scheduling (.10); 
technical assistance (.10); document 
productions and IMT comments (.10); 
Crime Lab report (.10); and IMR-10 
compliance assessments (.10).

0.60 237.00

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed materials related to 
Data section and University of Chicago 
Crime Lab Report related to early 
intervention system.

2.10 829.50

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.30 118.50

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed document productions 
related to Data section and technical 
assistance materials.

0.20 79.00

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Managed/organized files and document 
production materials related to Data 
section.

0.10 39.50

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend Teams 
meeting with IMT, CPD, and OAG related 
to Data section.

0.50 197.50

05/13/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted IMT comments related to Data 
section production.

0.50 197.50

05/13/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 5/9 productions and 
correspondence with team regarding 30 
day Consent Decree deadline for an 
outstanding production.

1.80 351.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

2.10 945.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 

0.20 90.00
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general updates

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

3.60 1,620.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team and Chief Judge 
Rebecca Pallmeyer

1.00 450.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.90 1,305.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

0.80 360.00

05/13/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for the Chief Judge Rebecca R 
Pallmeyer's upcoming conferences and 
public hearings

0.50 225.00

05/13/24 Brian J Hamilton Analyze City and OAG most recent 
comments to draft of IMR9

0.60 252.00

05/13/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly IMT/CPD/City check-in (.4); 
communications and meeting with J. 
Pallmeyer (.8); review of City and OAG 
responses to draft IMR-9 and meetings 
with A. Sepulveda and M. DeCarlo 
regarding same (2.2); review of BWC 
materials and meeting with A. Sepulveda 
and M. DeCarlo (1.5).

4.90 2,450.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise UOF methodologies. 0.60 270.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze Crime Lab report on 
CPD early intervention system.

0.30 135.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding UOF 
methodologies.

1.00 450.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet with Court regarding draft materials 
regarding body-worn camera policy.

0.60 270.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding draft 
materials for Court regarding body-worn 
camera policy.

1.10 495.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding 1.40 630.00
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coordinated multiple arrest training 
materials.

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding IMR9. 0.40 180.00

05/13/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding public 
hearing on Community Policing.

0.30 135.00

05/13/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.20 79.00

05/13/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Accountability and Transparency IMR10 
methodologies.

0.10 39.50

05/13/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze deliverables in preparation of 
drafting IMR10.

0.50 197.50

05/13/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal meeting for recruitment and 
training sections.

0.40 158.00

05/14/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City and CPD 
document production related to Data and 
Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/14/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed Parties' final 
comments to IMR-9.

0.80 316.00

05/14/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections (.30); and Parties' 
final comments to IMR-9 (.10).

0.40 158.00

05/14/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Crisis Intervention section meeting.

1.10 434.50

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for the Chief Judge Rebecca R 
Pallmeyer's upcoming conferences and 
public hearings

0.40 180.00

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.60 270.00

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Settlement Conference with Chief Judge 
Rebecca Pallmeyer and members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team, the City of 
Chicago, the Office of the Illinois Attorney 
General, and the Coalition

1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Settlement Conference with Chief Judge 0.50 225.00
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Rebecca Pallmeyer and members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team, the City of 
Chicago, and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.80 360.00

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

2.20 990.00

05/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Public Hearing with Chief Judge Rebecca 
Pallmeyer and members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team, the City of 
Chicago, and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General

1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Brian J Hamilton Examine City comments re paragraph 142 
and 143 assessments and cross reference 
same with IMR1 assessments in 
preparation of discussing same at weekly 
check in meeting for crisis intervention

0.80 336.00

05/14/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend weekly check-in meeting for crisis 
intervention to discuss methodologies and 
City's most recent comments to IMR9

1.00 420.00

05/14/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review City's response to IMR-9. 0.50 187.50

05/14/24 Maggie Hickey Preparation for as well as lead Consent 
Decree Settlement Conference with City, 
OAG, Coalition, and IMT and Judge 
Pallmeyer (2.5); preparation for as well as 
attend Consent Decree monthly status 
hearing (virtual) with Judge Pallmeyer 
(1.5); IMT leadership team meeting 
regarding follow-up assignments (.8); 
communications with City attorneys (.8).

5.60 2,800.00

05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise draft materials for court 
regarding search warrants resolution.

0.40 180.00

05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet within the IMT regarding public 
hearing and settlement conference.

1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Attend public hearing on community 
policing.

0.60 270.00
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05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Consent Decree settlement conference 
with Coalition regarding coordinated 
multiple arrest policies.

1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Settlement conference with parties. 1.00 450.00

05/14/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review and analyze the City's and the 
OAG's comments regarding Independent 
Monitoring Report 9.

1.20 474.00

05/14/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Independent Monitoring Report 9 and the 
City's corresponding comments.

0.40 158.00

05/14/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with IMT members 
regarding methodologies, reports, and 
productions.

0.80 316.00

05/14/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend TCAC meeting. 1.30 513.50

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Management of IMT file data related to 
Data and Crisis Intervention sections.

0.30 118.50

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed IMR-9 Report and 
Parties' Comments.

0.60 237.00

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, Use of 
Force, and Impartial Policing sections 
(.90); IMR-9 comments and revisions 
(.50); methodologies (.20); and document 
productions (.10).

1.70 671.50

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMR-9 Report related to 
Data section.

0.70 276.50

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City and CPD 
document productions related to Data and 
Impartial Policing sections (.30); reviewed 
redlined policies related to Use of Force 
section (.30)

0.60 237.00

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Attended internal IMT meeting with 
attorneys related to Crisis Intervention 
section, methodologies, and IMR-9 Report 
revisions.

0.50 197.50

05/15/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/revised updated methodologies 
related to Crisis Intervention section.

2.90 1,145.50
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05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 

Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.80 810.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.60 1,170.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.10 45.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Impartial Policing section

0.20 90.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Accountability and 
Transparency section

0.50 225.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

0.70 315.00

05/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.00 450.00

05/15/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise and supplement IMR9 in light of 
most recent comments from the City

0.40 168.00

05/15/24 Brian J Hamilton Conference with A. Sepulveda and A. 
Becker re revised methodologies and 
IMR9

0.60 252.00

05/15/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Analyze and revise IMR-9 for Officer 
Wellness.

3.60 1,350.00

05/15/24 Maggie Hickey IMT Leadership meeting (1.5); and review 
of IMT communications draft IMT 
responses (.5).

2.00 1,000.00

05/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD draft policy.

0.30 135.00
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05/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise IMR9. 0.30 135.00

05/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze draft CPD policy and 
response matrix.

0.30 135.00

05/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.20 540.00

05/15/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT no objection 
notices for Accountability and 
Transparency productions.

0.70 276.50

05/15/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
COPA training observations.

0.10 39.50

05/15/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency section 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

1.00 395.00

05/15/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend monthly IMT/OAG/CPD training 
meeting.

1.10 434.50

05/16/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention and Impartial 
Policing sections (.30); methodologies 
(.30); and IMR-9 Report (.20)

0.80 316.00

05/16/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/revised methodologies for Crisis 
Intervention section.

1.40 553.00

05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.20 990.00

05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.30 135.00

05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Officer Wellness and 
Support section

0.50 225.00

05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Supervision section

0.40 180.00
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05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 

Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Crisis Intervention section

0.10 45.00

05/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

3.70 1,665.00

05/16/24 Brian J Hamilton Conference with A. Becker re revisions to 
IMR9

0.20 84.00

05/16/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise and supplement crisis intervention 
methodologies and IMR9 in preparation of 
filing same with parties

0.90 378.00

05/16/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from A. Becker to 
leadership re most recent version of 
revised methodologies for crisis 
intervention

0.10 42.00

05/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise IMR-9 draft. 1.40 525.00

05/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review recent productions for Officer 
Wellness section.

0.60 225.00

05/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Conference call with A. R. Sepulveda 
regarding methodologies and recent 
productions.

0.70 262.50

05/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Conference call with A. R. Sepulveda and 
A. Durham regarding IMR-9.

0.30 112.50

05/16/24 Kacy Rayburn Load to Relativity Monitor Productions for 
attorney review.

1.50 225.00

05/16/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding 
preparation for public hearing on traffic 
stops.

0.60 270.00

05/16/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise methodologies 
memorandum.

0.30 135.00

05/16/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise the Accountability and 
Transparency section of Independent 
Monitoring Report 9.

0.60 237.00

05/16/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Independent Monitoring Report 9.

0.50 197.50

05/16/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Prepare for the monthly Accountability and 
Transparency meeting with the CPD, the 
OAG, and the IMT by reviewing the 

0.80 316.00
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PowerPoint presentation and reviewing 
methodologies for certain paragraphs.

05/16/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly Accountability and 
Transparency meeting with the CPD, the 
OAG, and the IMT.

0.60 237.00

05/17/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections (.60); 
methodologies (.40); document 
productions (.10); upcoming meetings with 
City, CPD, and OAG (.10); and IMR-9 
Report (.10).

1.30 513.50

05/17/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City document 
productions related to Data, Crisis 
Intervention, and Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/17/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data meeting.

0.50 197.50

05/17/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Creating different drafts of IMR 9 
methodologies report for attorney review.

0.90 175.50

05/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.20 540.00

05/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

2.30 1,035.00

05/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team and the Office of the 
Illinois Attorney General regarding general 
updates

0.50 225.00

05/17/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise and supplement IMR9 and send to 
A. Sepulveda

5.40 2,268.00

05/17/24 Maggie Hickey Call with S. Bedi (.4); call with A. 
Sepulveda and review and edit of IMR-9 
opening letter (.8); review of UChicago 
CrimeLab report and coordination of 
meeting with same (.9).

2.10 1,050.00

05/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT Data meeting. 0.50 225.00

05/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call. 0.40 180.00

05/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze CPD presentations 
for monthly meetings.

0.10 45.00
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05/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 

IMR9 opening memorandum.
0.30 135.00

05/18/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention section and 
IMR-9 Report.

0.10 39.50

05/18/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.50 225.00

05/18/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Finalize and submit written production 
response to CPD.

1.20 450.00

05/18/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise opening memorandum 
to IMR9.

0.10 45.00

05/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.70 765.00

05/19/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise UOF section of IMR9. 1.50 675.00

05/19/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise opening memorandum 
to IMR9.

0.60 270.00

05/20/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG (0.30); reviewed agenda 
and materials for Use of Force section 
meeting (0.10).

0.40 158.00

05/20/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data section meeting regarding IMR-
10 Report planning.

0.40 158.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.30 1,035.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.10 495.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with Superintendent of the 
Chicago Police Department, the 
Independent Monitoring Team, and the 
Parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago and the Illinois Attorney General's 
Office)

1.80 810.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 1.00 450.00
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Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Office of the Illinois Attorney General, 
and the Coalition

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.20 90.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the summary sections of the 
Independent Monitoring Team's 
monitoring report for the ninth reporting 
period

1.70 765.00

05/20/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for the Chief Judge Rebecca 
Pallmeyer's upcoming public hearing

1.60 720.00

05/20/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly IMT/CPD/City check-in (.4); 
meeting with A. Sepulveda, B. Bryson, L. 
Kunard, R. Monroe regarding revised 
Multiple Arrest policies (.8); preparation for 
as well as lead follow-up meeting with 
Coalition, CPD, and OAG regarding 
Multiple Arrest Polices (1.4); draft, review 
and revise opening letter of IMR-9 and 
meeting with A. Sepulveda regarding 
same (1.2); and preparation for as well as 
attend monthly 668 meeting (2.6).

6.40 3,200.00

05/20/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Attend portions of monthly 668 meeting. 0.50 225.00

05/20/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
IMR9 and meetings with parties and 
Coalition.

1.30 585.00

05/20/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise ISR section of IMR9. 1.40 630.00

05/20/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo City/CPD/IMT/OAG/Coalition meeting 
regarding coordinated multiple arrest 
policies.

1.20 540.00

05/20/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.60 237.00

05/20/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members re community 
concerns with an Accountability and 
Transparency paragraph.

0.40 158.00

05/20/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly meeting with the IMT and 
the OAG regarding the Accountability and 
Transparency section and methodologies.

0.90 355.50
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05/20/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Internal team meeting for Recruitment and 

Training.
0.30 118.50

05/21/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Use of Force and Crisis 
Intervention sections.

0.20 79.00

05/21/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed 668 meeting notes and 
materials related to Use of Force section.

0.30 118.50

05/21/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Use of Force section meeting.

0.60 237.00

05/21/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.60 270.00

05/21/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.50 675.00

05/21/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

2.80 1,260.00

05/21/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the compliance levels from 
the Independent Monitoring Team's 
monitoring report for the ninth reporting 
period

0.90 405.00

05/21/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with L. Clancey and J. 
Solomon re action items to develop this 
week in lieu of conducting weekly check-in 
meeting

0.20 84.00

05/21/24 Brian J Hamilton Review notes from H. Melendez re 
yesterday's 668 meeting

0.20 84.00

05/21/24 Maggie Hickey Call with R. Monroe (.4); meeting with 
Supt. Snelling, D. O’Malley, and A. 
Novalez (.5); Meeting with CPD and OAG 
regarding G03-06 (1); call with J. Bagby 
(.4); review final materials for IMR-9 filing 
and meeting with A. Sepulveda regarding 
same (3.2); communications with L. 
McElroy regarding IMR-9 (1.2).

6.70 3,350.00

05/21/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 0.90 405.00
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05/21/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise draft news release for 

IMR9.
0.10 45.00

05/21/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the CPD, the IMT, 
and the OAG regarding officer-involved 
shooting policies.

1.40 553.00

05/22/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend bi-
monthly IMT attorneys meeting.

0.60 237.00

05/22/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections (0.30); IMR9 Report 
revisions (0.20); and document 
productions (0.10).

0.60 237.00

05/22/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed IMR9 Report revisions 
to prepare for filing.

0.50 197.50

05/22/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT meeting with Data, Use of Force, and 
Accountability and Transparency sections.

0.80 316.00

05/22/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Attending internal IMT biweekly meeting 
regarding IMR 9 edits, methodologies, and 
upcoming productions.

0.70 136.50

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the appendices of the 
Independent Monitoring Team's 
monitoring report for the ninth reporting 
period

3.60 1,620.00

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the summary sections of the 
Independent Monitoring Team's 
monitoring report for the ninth reporting 
period

3.60 1,620.00

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the Independent Monitoring 
Team's news release and other materials 
related to the monitoring report for the 
ninth reporting period

1.20 540.00

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

1.10 495.00

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the compliance levels from 
the Independent Monitoring Team's 
monitoring report for the ninth reporting 
period

1.90 855.00

05/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 0.50 225.00
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Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

05/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Respond to J. Solomon question re 
productions for S05-15 and S04-20 as it 
relates to training section

0.50 210.00

05/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Confirm compliance numbers for each 
paragraph in crisis intervention section is 
correct in IMR9 introduction

1.70 714.00

05/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Analyze further edits from leadership to 
IMR9 crisis intervention section

1.00 420.00

05/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication to A. Sepulveda re edits to 
IMR9's crisis intervention section

0.10 42.00

05/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend internal bi-weekly meeting to 
discuss IMR9, IMR10, methodologies, and 
recent productions

0.80 336.00

05/22/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend bi-monthly internal ArentFox Schiff 
meeting regarding IMR-9, methodologies, 
public hearing, and general updates.

0.50 187.50

05/22/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise IMR-9. 1.30 487.50

05/22/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly IMT leadership meeting (1.2); 
meeting with Supt. Snelling, D. O’Malley, 
and A. Novalez (.5); review IMR-9 filing 
and calls with A. Sepulveda regarding 
same (3.8); communications with L. 
McElroy regarding IMR-9 (.5).

6.00 3,000.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.00 450.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Bi-monthly IMT AFS meeting. 0.60 270.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Internal IMT ISR meeting. 0.90 405.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
IMR9 and revisions to same.

0.90 405.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise IMR9. 1.10 495.00

05/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Internal IMT UOF/A&T/Data cross-over 
meeting.

0.80 360.00

05/22/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's AFS team 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

0.60 237.00
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05/22/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 

Accountability and Transparency, Use of 
Force, and Data teams.

0.80 316.00

05/22/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise the Accountability and 
Transparency section of Independent 
Monitoring Report 9.

0.80 316.00

05/22/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal bi-weekly attorney meeting. 0.60 237.00

05/22/24 Vyasa Babu Weekly Impartial Policing meeting 0.50 162.50

05/23/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/23/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data section meeting to discuss IMR-
10 deliverables and assessments.

0.70 276.50

05/23/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend monthly 
Use of Force section meeting with City, 
CPD, IMT, and OAG.

0.80 316.00

05/23/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed document production 
related to Data and Use of Force section.

0.10 39.50

05/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing materials provided by the City 
of Chicago to the Independent Monitoring 
Team

0.60 270.00

05/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing of the Independent Monitoring 
Team's final monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

3.80 1,710.00

05/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.10 45.00

05/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

0.30 135.00

05/23/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly call with Officer Wellness 
team regarding IMR-9 and IMR-10.

1.00 375.00

05/23/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly call with Supervision team 
regarding IMR-9 and IMR-10.

0.50 187.50

05/23/24 Maggie Hickey Monthly IMT/OAG: De-escalation, 
Response to Resistance and Use of Force 
(.8); call with A. Slagel re WFA scope (.5); 

3.10 1,550.00
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filing of IMR-9 and deal with questions and 
responses (1.8).

05/23/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within IMT regarding 
feedback on paragraph 835 needs 
assessment.

0.30 135.00

05/23/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise IMR9. 1.40 630.00

05/23/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly meeting with the CPD, the 
OAG, and the IMT regarding the 
Investigatory Stops section.

0.50 197.50

05/23/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Draft Accountability and Transparency 
methodologies in the new proposed 
format.

1.30 513.50

05/24/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Community Policing 
sections (0.60); draft IMT comments 
(1.00); review and analysis of materials 
related to Use of Force section (0.20); and 
document productions (0.10).

1.90 750.50

05/24/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed draft written materials 
related to Use of Force section.

1.40 553.00

05/24/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments related to 
Data and Community Policing sections.

0.60 237.00

05/24/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data section meeting.

0.40 158.00

05/24/24 Alex J. Becker Finalized, prepared, and submitted IMT no 
objection notice related to Community 
Policing section to City, CPD, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

05/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.50 225.00

05/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.40 630.00

05/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing materials provided by the City 
of Chicago to the Independent Monitoring 
Team

0.40 180.00

05/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 

2.70 1,215.00
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Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

05/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with Judge Rebecca Pallmeyer 
and members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team regarding Consent 
Decree updates

0.70 315.00

05/24/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG weekly check-in (.5); call with 
Judge Pallmeyer and A. Sepulveda (1.2); 
follow-up on traffic stop questions (.8).

2.50 1,250.00

05/24/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
Level 1 TRR analysis.

0.10 45.00

05/24/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding no 
objection notice.

0.40 158.00

05/24/24 Vyasa Babu Weekly Community Policing meeting 0.50 162.50

05/28/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections.

0.30 118.50

05/28/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Use of Force section meeting.

0.70 276.50

05/28/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Crisis Intervention section meeting.

1.00 395.00

05/28/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City and CPD 
document productions related to Data and 
Use of Force sections.

0.30 118.50

05/28/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed meeting agenda, notes, and 
materials related to Crisis Intervention 
section.

0.20 79.00

05/28/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 5/16 and 5/23 productions.

2.10 409.50

05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force sections

0.30 135.00

05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's methodologies for the tenth 
reporting period

1.80 810.00

05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 

1.30 585.00
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05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for the Chief Judge Rebecca 
Pallmeyer's upcoming public hearing

0.10 45.00

05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Crisis Intervention 
sections

0.80 360.00

05/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

3.30 1,485.00

05/28/24 Brian J Hamilton Prepare for weekly check in meeting for 
crisis intervention

0.60 252.00

05/28/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend check-in meeting with crisis 
intervention section to discuss 
methodologies, IMR9 filing, upcoming 
IMR10 deadlines, and recent productions

1.00 420.00

05/28/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from A. Sepulveda re 
IMR10 timelines and current draft of 
comprehensive assessment

0.40 168.00

05/28/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly Officer Wellness meeting 
regarding IMR-10, IMR-11, methodologies, 
and compliance determinations.

1.60 600.00

05/28/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend monthly meeting with CPD and 
OAG regarding IMR-10, paragraph 404, 
and data requirements.

1.00 375.00

05/28/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Draft IMR-10 compliance determinations. 3.90 1,462.50

05/28/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Meet with Supervision team regarding 
IMR-10 compliance.

1.00 375.00

05/28/24 Maggie Hickey Monthly IMT/OAG: Officer Wellness (1); 
monthly IMT/OAG: CIT (.8); review EIS 
report and Zoom meeting with U of C 
Crime Lab (1.5); Force Review (1.8); call 
with L. Kunard and A. Sepulveda 
regarding comprehensive assessment (.8); 
and review of Draft IMT comments (1.3).

4.50 2,250.00

05/28/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 0.70 315.00
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05/28/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 

firearm pointing incident reports.
0.90 405.00

05/28/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze materials relating to 
firearm pointing incident reports.

0.50 225.00

05/28/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise IMT no objection notice. 0.50 197.50

05/29/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with the City, 
CPD, IMT, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

05/29/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed/revised draft materials 
related to Use of Force section (2.20); 
reviewed published IMR-9 Report (0.20).

2.40 948.00

05/29/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding draft materials related to Use of 
Force section (0.20) and IMR-10 timelines 
and guidance (0.10).

0.30 118.50

05/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records and other materials 
provided by the City of Chicago to the 
Independent Monitoring Team

3.30 1,485.00

05/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with Judge Rebecca Pallmeyer 
and members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team regarding Consent 
Decree updates

0.50 225.00

05/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

1.30 585.00

05/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.20 990.00

05/29/24 Maggie Hickey IMT leadership meeting (1.1); preparation 
for as well as attend meeting with Judge 
Pallmeyer, A. Sepulveda and M. DeCarlo 
regarding BWC (1.4); and review of IMT 
communications and draft notices (.5).

3.00 1,500.00

05/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
firearm pointing incident reports and 
regarding draft materials for Court 
regarding body-worn camera policies.

0.90 405.00

05/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.10 495.00

05/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Debrief within the IMT regarding meeting 0.20 90.00
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with J. Pallmeyer.

05/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise materials for court 
regarding body-worn camera policy.

0.70 315.00

05/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet with J. Pallmeyer regarding draft 
materials about body-worn camera policy.

0.60 270.00

05/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency section 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

1.00 395.00

05/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT no objection 
notice.

0.20 79.00

05/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze training production. 0.30 118.50

05/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal section meeting for training 
and recruitment.

0.80 316.00

05/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze productions for compliance 
tracker for IMR-10.

0.20 79.00

05/29/24 Vyasa Babu Impartial Policing Weekly 
Meeting/Community Policing Monthly 
Meeting

1.50 487.50

05/30/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention and Use of 
Force sections.

0.20 79.00

05/30/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communications with City, CPD, 
and court related to Use of Force section.

0.10 39.50

05/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.20 90.00

05/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records provided to the 
Independent Monitoring Team by the City 
of Chicago

0.50 225.00

05/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

1.80 810.00

05/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.50 1,125.00

05/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication to J. Solomon re potential 0.20 84.00
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follow up requests to City for two 
additional trainings relevant to paragraphs 
126 and 127

05/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with crisis 
intervention section re rescheduling next 
internal meeting

0.30 126.00

05/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with J. Solomon re plan 
to review S05-14

0.10 42.00

05/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with J. Solomon re 
forthcoming trainings from CPD related to 
compliance for paragraphs 126-27

0.10 42.00

05/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Review recent S05-14 production 
materials from City and route to J. 
Solomon

0.90 378.00

05/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend monthly Supervision meeting with 
CPD and OAG.

0.80 300.00

05/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Weekly call with Supervision team 
regarding IMR-10 compliance 
determinations.

0.50 187.50

05/30/24 Maggie Hickey Attend meeting with CCPSA team 
including President Driver, J. Bagby, A. 
Slagel and R. Monroe regarding traffic 
stops.

1.00 500.00

05/30/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
Level 1 TRR data analysis.

2.10 945.00

05/30/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.80 316.00

05/30/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise IMT no objection notice. 0.20 79.00

05/30/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft no objection notice for training 
production.

0.40 158.00

05/30/24 Vyasa Babu Monthly Impartial Policing/OAG Meeting 1.00 325.00

05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.40 158.00

05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed Office of Inspector General 
Report related to Use of Force section.

1.20 474.00

05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections (0.90), and draft IMT comments 
(0.40).

1.30 513.50
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05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed CPD document 

productions related to Data section.
1.20 474.00

05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments related to 
Data section.

1.00 395.00

05/31/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for as well as attend internal 
IMT Data section meeting.

0.70 276.50

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.30 135.00

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

2.00 900.00

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Community Policing 
section

0.60 270.00

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Data Analysis, Collection, 
and Management section

0.50 225.00

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
methodologies for the tenth reporting 
period

0.90 405.00

05/31/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.50 675.00

05/31/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Analyze and draft IMR-10 compliance 
determinations.

1.00 375.00

05/31/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Discuss IMR-10 compliance 
determinations with Officer Wellness team.

1.10 412.50

05/31/24 Maggie Hickey Review communications from Coalition 
(.4); review and IMT communications and 
notices (.8).

1.20 600.00
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451895 Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involving the Chicago Police 
Department

Invoice Number 2340722

00000 CPD Monitor Page 37 of 40
June 28, 2024

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours Value
05/31/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 

firearm pointing incident reports.
0.30 135.00

05/31/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call. 0.40 180.00

05/31/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Submit IMT no objection notice. 0.10 39.50

05/31/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Zoom call with IMT members regarding 
new methodology format.

0.80 316.00

05/31/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and finalize no objection notice to 
training production.

0.30 118.50

05/31/24 Vyasa Babu Weekly Community Policing meeting 0.50 162.50

Fee Total 445.70 $193,125.00

Timekeeper Summary:

Hours Rate Value
Maggie Hickey Partner 75.60 500.00 37,800.00

Alex J. Becker Associate 53.50 395.00 21,132.50

Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Associate 147.50 450.00 66,375.00

Brian J Hamilton Associate 26.60 420.00 11,172.00

Gwendolyn H. Lemley Laurich Associate 38.40 375.00 14,400.00

Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Associate 57.70 450.00 25,965.00

Sarah M. Oligmueller Associate 22.60 395.00 8,927.00

Stella T. Oyalabu Associate 11.30 395.00 4,463.50

Vyasa Babu Associate 4.00 325.00 1,300.00

Kacy Rayburn Specialist 1.50 150.00 225.00

Ana Reyes Sanchez Project Assistant 7.00 195.00 1,365.00

Timekeeper Summary Total 445.70 193,125.00

Current Fees $193,125.00

For Disbursements:
Professional Service Fees

05/30/24 Security Global Collaborators, LLC - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (5.50 
hours)

907.50



ArentFox Schiff LLP
Attorneys at Law

451895 Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involving the Chicago Police 
Department

Invoice Number 2340722

00000 CPD Monitor Page 38 of 40
June 28, 2024

05/31/24 Paul F. Evans, Jr. - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (53.75 hours) 8,868.75

05/31/24 Julie Solomon - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (21.50) 3,547.50

05/31/24 Tipping Point Solutions, LLC - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (20.25 hours) 3,341.25

05/31/24 The CNA Corporation - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees and expenses 246,565.26

05/31/24 Theron L. Bowman - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (81.25 hours) 20,312.50

05/31/24 Alfred Durham - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (34.5 hours) 5,692.50

05/31/24 Denise Rodriguez - CPD - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (22 hours) 3,630.00

05/31/24 Stephen E. Rickman - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (47.50 hours) 7,837.50

05/31/24 MS Harrison Consulting LLC - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (1.75 hours) 288.75

05/31/24 Michael Anthony Dirden - Professional Service Fees May 2024 fees (48.50 hours) 7,275.00

Professional Service Fees 308,266.51

eDiscovery Support Services (LSH)
05/31/24 ArentFox Schiff LLP eDiscovery services 1,535.00

eDiscovery Support Services (LSH) 1,535.00

Disbursement Total 309,801.51
Current Disbursements $309,801.51

Total Amount Due This Invoice $502,926.51

Less Retainer Applied To This Invoice $(501,491.51)

Total Due after Retainer $1,435.00

Prior Balance Due $29,509.88

Total Balance Due Upon Receipt $30,944.88



ArentFox Schiff LLP
Attorneys at Law

451895 Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involving the Chicago Police 
Department

Invoice Number 2340722

00000 Page 39 of 40
June 28, 2024

          Due Upon Receipt

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.

Summary of Accounts Receivable:

Date Invoice # Amount Credits Balance
06/11/24 2335705 446,884.71 445,299.71 1,585.00

08/30/24 2357956 480,419.96 465,607.96 14,812.00

09/30/24 2367508 407,256.81 394,143.93 13,112.88

1,334,561.48 1,305,051.60 29,509.88

Aging:

0-30 31-90 91-180 181-365 366+
13,112.88 14,812.00 3,020.00 0.00 0.00





$907.50

Signature:

Date:

Certification:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, and the 
expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract. I am aware that 
any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, 
false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730.)

30-May-24

Vendor Name:  Security Global Collaborators, LLC
Remit to Address:  
City:       State:       Zip:  
Contact Name:  Kerr Putney

Bill to:  ArentFox Schiff; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100, Chicago, IL 60606; maggie.hickey@afslaw.com

Site visit billable hours
Total Travel 0

8-May-24

Travel/ODCs (Itemize and provide receipts)
Travel Date (From) Travel Date (To) Description Total

Total Hours 5.5
Total Labor

23-May-24 Weekly TRED meeting 1

Weekly TRED meeting 0.5

20-May-24

16-May-24 IMT Cross Section meeting 0.5

IMR-9 review & comments 0.5

2-May-24 IMT Cross Section meeting 0.5

IMT Weekly meeting 1

0.5Weekly TRED meeting9-May-24

Invoice Date

Billing Period From:
30-May-24

1-May-24

Invoice Number
5

Billing Period To:
30-May-24

Labor (Description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

1-May-24 IMT Weekly meeting 1

Date of Service Description Hours









Vendor Name: Stephen Rickman 
Remit to Address:  
Contact Name: Stephen Rickman 
Phone:  
Email:  
Invoice Date : 06/02/24 
Invoice Number: 61 
Billing Period: 05/01/24 to 05/31/24 
 
Bill to: ArentFoxSchiff; Wacker Drive, Suite 7100;Chicago, IL. 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com 
 
 

Chicago Consent Decree 
 
Date of service.                                  Description of work.                                                                      Hours  
 
05/01/24 Preparation and participation and Re-scheduled site visit mtg with DAC chairs 1.5 
05/02/24 Draft revisions for public hearing comments .5 
05/03/24 CP weekly updates meeting .5 
 Preparation and participation in data evaluation and measurement mtg. 2.0 
 Check in call with CPD sponsor .5 
05/06/24 Meeting with parties re preparation for May 14th meeting and follow up 1.0 
 Follow up call with Sponsor re comments re public hearing presentation .5 
 Preparation and meeting with CPD r& D site visit re-scheduling 1.5 
 Participation in CET meeting .5 
05/07/24 Updated IMR 10 methodologies and required assessment records 5.5 
05/10/24 Preparation and participation in Bi-weekly check in with CPD Sponsor et al. 1.0 
 Review of OCP Annual report 1.5 
05/13/24 Associate monitors bi-weekly meeting re IMR 10 1.0 
 Review of site visit notes in prep for de-briefing 2.5 
 Call and final review and prep for public hearing 1.0 
05/14/24 Court hearing panelist re community policing 1.5 
 Post hearing debriefing with staff .5 
05/17/24 CP weekly team meeting for updates .5 
05/20/24 AM meeting with deputy monitor re sponsorship mtgs 1.0 
05/21/25 Initial review of updated community engagement plan 1.5 
 Participation in 668 meeting re community engagement plan 1.5 
05/22/24 Preparation and participation in Interactions with Youth meeting 2.0 
 Update of IMR 10 compliance matrix for Sponsor discussion 2.5 
05/23/24 Preparation and participation in CP bi-weekly check in call 1.0 
 Continued review of community engagement plan and discussion with 

impartial policing AM re technical assistance 1.5 







Vendor Name:  Durham Security Consulting Services         Invoice Date          Invoice Number   
Remit to Address:            6/3/2024           2024-005
City:    State:     Zip:     Billing Period From:       Billing Period To:
Contact Name: Alfred Durham         5/1/2024           5/31/2024
Phone:    Email: Remittance Type Requested:      Check              EFT

Bill To:   Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100; Chicago, IL 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com

LABOR (The description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

0.75 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

0.5 Add Del

2.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.25 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

0.25 Add Del

Add

Add Del

Add

Add

Add

Add

Add

Add

0.25
Add

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

Add

Add Del

Add

Add

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

IMT ISR/Use of Force Monthly Crossover Meeting Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

0.5 Add Del

Review of Incident Debriefing Dashboard Training Video 0.5

0.5

Add Del

Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add

0.25 Add

5/14/2024

Reviewed Emails from Chief Rodney Monroe, Theron Bowman, Gwen Laurich, Heleana 
Melendez, Hannah Jurowicz and Sgt. Claire Sheehan  

Del
5/23/2024 Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision

5/24/2024 5/24/2024 CPD Supervision Management Log Discussion 
5/23/2024

5/14/2024

0.25

5/21/2024 5/21/2024

Reviewed Emails from Melissa Guiterrez, Bridgette Bryson, Gwen Laurich, Meredith 
DeCarlo, Anthony Sepulveda, Jennifer Nilles and Allan Slagel 

5/13/2024
5/13/2024

5/9/2024

5/15/2024
5/14/2024

5/16/2024
Call with Chief Kerr Putney Regarding ISR/Supervision Cross Section 

Reviewed Emails from Chief Rodney Monroe, Bridgette Bryson, Gwen Laurich, Meredith 
DeCarlo, Anthony Sepulveda and Allyson Clark-Henson  

5/13/2024

5/14/2024

5/16/2024

5/9/2024

5/15/2024

5/13/2024

5/15/2024 Supervision Bi-Weekly Check-In with CPD/IMT

5/15/2024

5/16/2024 5/16/2024

5/15/2024

Add/Delete

Del

5/7/2024

5/1/2024 5/1/2024 Call with Julie Solomon Regarding Crisis Intervention/Supervision Cross Section 
5/1/2024 5/1/2024 Weekly Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables

0.5 Del
5/8/2024 5/8/2024

5/2/2024 5/2/2024 Call with Chief Kerr Putney Regarding ISR/Supervision Cross Section 

5/8/2024 IMT/OAG Supervision Check-In 1.25

1.25

5/9/2024

5/9/2024 5/9/2024

5/8/2024

                                                            INVOICE

Date of
Service(From)

Date of
Service(To

)

Description Hours
(use .25 hr 
increments)

5/7/2024

5/3/2024 5/3/2024

5/2/2024 5/2/2024 Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision

Reveiwed CPD Policy E04-01-01 Personnel Transfers and Assignment Procedures 

Conference Call with Supervision Evaluation Committee5/6/2024
5/6/2024

IMT Briefing Call with Executive Sponsor D/C Daniel O'Connor

5/3/2024 5/3/2024 Reveiwed NBR Working Paper Series on CPD Police Officer Assignment and 
Neighborhood Crime 

5/3/2024

5/1/2024

5/4/2024

Del

0.5
1

0.75

0.5

Conference Call- Monthly Sync Up- CPD Pilots (OSS,PES, Unity of Command/Span of 
Control) 

Reviewed Emails from Bridgette Celments, Hannah Jurowicz, Monique Jenkins, Morgan 
Denlow, Office of Reform and Anthony Sepulveda

5/1/2024

5/3/2024 Reviewed Emails from Bridgette Celments, Hannah Jurowicz, Melissa Guiterrez, Morgan 
Denlow and Anthony Sepulveda

5/9/2024

Conference Call with Office of Reform to Discuss Supervision Management Logs

5/4/2024 Reviewed OAG Comments on WFA Scope of Work

Weekly Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables

5/6/2024
5/6/2024 5/6/2024

5/2/2024 5/2/2024 Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision Section Activities

5/6/2024

Del

Reviewed Materials for IMT/OAG EISS Check-In - Opportunities for Officer Support, CPD 
11.201 May 2024 EISS Cover Sheet, CPD Department Notice D20-04 Early Intervention 
and Support System-Pilot Program and CPD 11.202-EISS Comments Response

Del

Del

Del

0.5

0.25

2

Reviewed IMR-10 Timeline and Guidance

Reviewed Emails from Monique Jenkins, Ofc. Clair Sheehan, Hannah Jurowicz, Allan 
Slagel, Alex Becker and Anthony Sepulveda

Associate Monitor Bi-Weekly Meeting with Chief Rodney Monroe
IMT/OAG EISS Check-In

Del
Reviewed Blank CPD Form 201

1
0.5

1Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision

Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10

Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision IMR-10 Deliverables 0.25

0.75Reviewed Parties Final Comments to Independent Monitoring Report 9
0.55/16/2024

5/21/2024 5/21/2024

5/15/2024

5/20/2024 5/20/2024
IMT Briefing Call with Executive Sponsor D/C Daniel O'Connor

0.25

IMR-9 Supervision Call w/ Anthony Sepulveda and Gwen Laurich 0.55/16/2024

5/16/2024

5/22/2024

0.75

Del

Del

Del

5/16/2025 5/16/2024 Reviewed and Commented CPD's BOPSO 24-06.01 (District Tactical Teams) for 
Compliance with ¶366

0.5

5/20/2024 5/20/2024 0.5

5/16/2024

0.5

Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision Section Activities

5/22/2024

5/23/2024 5/23/2024 Call with CPD Regarding OAG WFA Scope of Work Comments
5/23/2024

5/22/2024

5/23/2024

Review of IMR-10 Prep Work Materials from Chief Rodney Monroe

5/24/2024 Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables Del

0.5

Call with OAG Hannah Jurowicz Regarding CPD WFA Scope of Work Response

5/23/2024

Call with D/C Daniel O'Connor Regarding BOPSO 24-06.1 (District Tactical Teams) Edits
0.25

5/22/2024 5/22/2024

5/23/2024

5/24/2024

5/22/2024



Add Del

0.25 Add

Add Del

Add Del

2.25 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.75 Add Del

1.25 Add Del

Rate $165
5,692.50

       Check here if you are not billing for any travel

Purpose of Travel: Chicago Site Visit 

Travel/ODC'S - (Itemize and provide reciepts as specified on your contract)

Travel 
Date(From)

QTY Rate Total

Add I  
DeleteAdd I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete

             Subtotal Travel/ODC's

Date of 
Expense

Add I 

6/3/2024
           Signature Date

$5,692.50

5/28/2024

5/29/2024 5/29/2024 Call with Tom Christoff Regarding Data Collection/Supervison Cross Section

                                                                                                                                   TOTAL LABOR:

Reset Form Save Form

Add/ 
Delete      

Privately Owned Vehicle Mileage Reimbursement

Description: (Include starting location and ending location) Miles Rate Total Add/           
Delete

Invoice Comments/Notes:

                                                                                                                            TOTAL TRAVEL:
       Subtotal Mileage 

CERTIFICATION:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, and the 
expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract. I am aware that any 
false, ficticious, or fraudulent information, or the ommission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false 
statements, flase claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730.) 

                                                                                                       INVOICE TOTAL DUE:

1

Description

34.5

Travel         
Date(To)

Expense  Type

$0

                                                                                                                                         Total Hours

5/28/2024 5/28/2024

5/28/2024
IMR-10 Supervision Check In with Analyst Monique Jenkins and Attorney Gwen Laurich
Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision IMR-10 Deliverables

5/30/2024 5/30/2024 Supervision IMT/OAG Monthly Call
5/31/2024 5/31/2024 Monthly Chicago IMT Associate Monitor Meeting

0.25
0.5

5/29/2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed Chicago Crime Lab Predicting Police Misconduct Working Paper

Del

5/30/2024 5/30/2024 Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision

5/29/2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed Emails from Morgan Denlow, Anthony Sepulved, Maggie Hickey, Bridgette 
Bryson, Allan Slagel, Claire Sheehan, Amanda Bond and Hannah Jurowicz  

X







Chicago Independent Monitoring Team Invoice 

Vendor Name: Paul F Evans 

Remit to Address:  

City:          

State:  

Zip:  

Contact Name: Paul F Evans 

Phone:  

Email:  

Remittance Type Requested: EFT  Check 

Bill To: Choose an item.
Labor (the description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it is necessary) 
Date of Service (From) Date of Service (To)  Description  Hours 
5/1/2024 5/1/2024 Review emails, check recent 

productionsand review 
dashboards

1 hour

5/2/2024 5/2/2024 Preparation for call with 
OAG Sam Kennedy, call with 
Sam Kennedy review site 
visit notes that Sam was not 
present for.

1 hour .75

5/5/2024 5/5/2024 Review UO1-13 Use of 
Sheilds during protest policy 
and review lesson plans

.75

5/6/2024 5/6/2024 Review methodologies .50
5/7/2024 5/7/2024 Prepare agendas and 

conduct two meetings with 
Commander Joyce and UOF 
weekly meeting with Deputy 
Monroe, Mr Sepulveda, Ms
DeCarlo, Melendez, 
Clements

2 hours

5/9/2024 5/9/2024 Review use of force 
methodology, meeting with 
Ms Melendez and DeCarlo on 
methodologies, conference 
zoom with IMT,CPD and OAG

2 hours .75

5/10/2024 5/10/2024 Review training and UOF 
dashboards, look at status of 
UOF paragraphs and what 
may be necessary to 
increase compliance level

1 hour .75

5/11/2024 5/11/2024 Review drafts 0f Officer 
Involved Shooting policy 
suite

1 hour

5/12/2024 5/12/2024 Attain access to CPD clear-
review and familiarize self 
and view reports and videos

1 hour

5/13/2024 5/13/2024 Review methodology with Ms 
DeCarlo PP153-199, with Ms 
Melendez 200-246, meeting 
with Associate Monitors and 
Deputy Monitor address 
deliverables for IMR10, 
review community 

3 hours .75

Invoice Date Invoice Number  
6/5/2024 Chicago#63
Billing Period From: Billing Period To:  
5/1/2024 5/31/2024

5 



engagement response on 
BWC policy, phone call with 
Deputy Monitor Monroe on 
DNC

5/14/2024 5/14/2024 Prepare agenda, conduct 
weekly UOF meeting with Ms 
DeCarlo and Melendez, 
review methodologies, OAG 
responses and CPD 
responses

1 hour .50

5/15/2024 5/15/2024 Review and amend 
methodology for 
166,186,187,201, review 
CPD changes to CMA policies
following Coalition review

1 hour

5/16/2024 5/16/2024 Review CMA policies, follow 
media accounts of protests 
and videos in Chicago and 
PD response as relates to 
UOF paragraphs, review 
accountability and 
supervision paragraphs, 
email Ms Clements, review 
TRRs 2024-02120, 2024-
02267,Chicago Police Board 
meeting- community input

3 hours .25

5/17/2024 5/17/2024 Repeated efforts 
unsuccessfully to access 
Supervisory dashboard, 
review methodology on 
certain paragraphs, review 
protest officer videos

1 hour .75

5/18/2024 5/18/2024 Explore Clear website, 
review latest CPD 
productions, reviewTRR 
reports and videos

1 hour 50

5/20/2024 5/20/2024 Reviewing 20 paragraphs 
that changed in IMR9 UOF 
section, and the narratives, 
review 2 recent Level 1 
TRR, report and video, take 
notes on various consent 
decree requirements, Zoom 
meeting -IMT,OAG, CPD 
discussion on CMA policy 
suitelanguage, phone call 
from Ms DeCarlo, analysis of 
SO6-06-03

3 hours

5/21/2024 5/21/2024 Preparation and weekly UOF 
call with Mr Becker, Ms 
Melendez and DeCarlo,
meeting and preparation for 
discussion with Commander 
Joyce and Ms Salgado on CD 
paragraph compliance, 
review UOF deadly force 
policy suite review, zoom 
with Deputy Monroe, 
Associate Monitor Dirden 
and Putney

4 hours .75

5/22/2024 5/22/2024 Read media report that 
deals with Firearm Pointing, 
review and respond to 
emails and scheduling,

1 hour 50



phone call with Daniel Casey 
regarding access to 
Supervisory dashboard

5/23/2024 5/23/2024 Attempt to work with 
Chicago tech people to get 
access to supervisory 
dashboard, review 
paragraphs for IMR10, 
monthly UOF meeting with 
CPD, OAG, IMT and 
preparation of questions on 
agenda, review multiple TRR 
taser videos, take notes on 
de-escalation etc

3 hours .75

5/24/2024 5/24/2024 Review GO3-06 OIS policy 
suite in preparation for 
discussion with Associate 
Monitor Dirden

1 hour

5/25/2024 5/25/2024 Review 2024 – 2 taserTRR 
incidents, take notes as 
torequrements of consent 
decree

1 hour 25

5/26/2024 5/26/2024 Review and take initial 
assessment of IMR 10 
paragraphs 153-157, look to 
COPA Quarterly and Annual 
reports for data and 
statistics

1hour 25

5/27/2024 5/27/2024 Review and take initial 
assessment of paragraphs 
157-164, also review Taser 
TRR report and video and 
take notes

1 hour 75

5/28/2024 5/28/2024 Discussion with Deputy 
Monroe on IMR10 
deliverables and 
methodology, preparation 
and execution of UOF 
weekly with Deputy Monroe,
Mr Sepulveda, Ms DeCarlo,
Ms Melendez, Mr Becker,
preparation and discussion 
with Commander Joyce, 
read new UOF productions

2 hours 50

5/29/2024 5/29/2024 Review email from Deputy 
Monitor on IMR10 
compliance, review 
additional 10 paragraphs for 
initial assessment for IMR10

1hour 50

5/30/2024 5/30/2024 Review 164&165,contact 
CPD technicians for 
continued efforts to gain 
access to supervisory 
dashboard, continued write 
ups of compliance initial 
assessments 153-173

3 2 hour 50 hours 75

5/31/2024 5/31/2024 Review and initial 
assessment for PP173-177, 
Associate Monitors meeting 
with Deputy Monroe

Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.
Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.

Total: 53.75 Rate: $165 
Check here if you are not billing for any travel:   



Purpose of Travel:Click or tap here to enter text.

INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $8,868.75
Invoice Comments/Notes:Click or tap here to enter text.

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, 
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the 
contract. I am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, 
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 
3729-3730.) 

 
 

                                                                                                                            Paul F Evans                             June 5,2024 
 

Signature Date 
 
 
 
 
 

Travel/ODCs (itemize and provide receipts as specified on your contract)  
Travel Date 
(From) 

Travel 
Date (To)  Expense Type  Description  Qty Rate Total 

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Choose an item. Click or tap here to enter text.

Click or 
tap here 
to enter 
text.

Click or 
tap here 
to enter 
text.

Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Subtotal Travel/ODC’s: 

Click or 
tap here 
to enter 

text. 

Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Privately Owned Vehicle Mileage Reimbursement 
Date of 
Expense 

Description (including starting location and ending location) Miles Rate Total:  

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text.

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text.

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Subtotal Mileage (rounded): 
Click or tap 
here to 
enter text. 

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text. 

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Total Travel:  Click or tap here to enter 
text.













Row Labels Sum of Hours
Amada Bond 40.5
Ana Genkova 11
Bridgette Bryson 101
Elliot Jordan 57.5
Heleana Melendez 85
Jessica Dockstader 19.5
Joseph Hoereth 4.5
Laura Kunard 48.5
Laura McElroy 21.5
Lindsey Clancey 20.5
Melissa Gutierrez 32.5
Monique Jenkins 15
Norma Ramos 14
Rodney Monroe 94.25
Stephanie Smith 17.5
Tammy Felix 35
Tom Christoff 17.5
Valerie Schmitt 18.5

Grand Total 653.75



Contractor Name Month/Year Date Description of Labor Hours
Amada Bond May 2024 5/1/2024 Weekly IMT ISR meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/1/2024 Reviewed CPD production. 1.00

Amada Bond May 2024 5/1/2024
Reviewed ISR paragraphs and identified training specific paragraphs to share with IMT leadership
and Training section analyst. 0.50

Amada Bond May 2024 5/2/2024
Prepared for meeting with Commander Joyce and sent AM status update on ISR deliverables and
relevant items for discussion. 0.50

Amada Bond May 2024 5/2/2024 Meeting with Commander Joyce and 4ASRU. 2.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/8/2024 Reviewed and edited ISR methodologies. 2.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/8/2024 Weekly IMT ISR meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/9/2024 Review ISR best practices. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/20/2024 Reviewed traffic stop best practices materials. 1.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewed ISR production. 1.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/21/2024 IMT ISR/UoF Crossover meeting. 1.00

Amada Bond May 2024 5/21/2024
Follow ups with ISR AM, leadership, and UoF analyst in preparation for crossover meeting and
regarding ISR production. 1.50

Amada Bond May 2024 5/22/2024 Finished ISR production review and updated tracker. 2.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/22/2024 IMT weekly ISR meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/22/2024 Prepared for IMR 10 discussion. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/22/2024 Cross referenced and finalized monitoring timeline. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/22/2024 4ASRU Technical Assistance Edited Needs Assessment. 6.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/23/2024 4ASRU Technical Assistance Edited Needs Assessment. 2.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/23/2024 CPD IMT/OAG monthly ISR meeting. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/23/2024 Call with ISR AM and cleaned up notes for dissemination. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/23/2024 Started drafting IMT Comments. 1.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/24/2024 Drafted IMT Comments. 1.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/26/2024 IMR 10 writing for ISR. 2.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/28/2024 Best practices review. 0.50
Amada Bond May 2024 5/29/2024 Worked on preparing IMR 10 materials for AM. 2.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/29/2024 Worked on IMR 10 writing. 1.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/30/2024 Worked on preparing IMR 10 materials for AM. 4.00
Amada Bond May 2024 5/31/2024 Monthly internal IMT analyst meeting. 1.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/13/2024 NORC Survey Meeting 1.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/14/2024 Survey Analysis Prep 2.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/16/2024 Survey Analysis Prep 2.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/21/2024 Survey Analysis Prep 2.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/23/2024 Survey Analysis Prep 2.00
Ana Genkova May 2024 5/30/2024 Survey data cleaning and analysis 2.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/1/2024 IMT Project Management 1.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/1/2024 Weekly call with Casey McKenzie 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/1/2024 IMT Leadership Weekly 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/1/2024 A&T weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/2/2024 A&T Training observation 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/3/2024 IMT Project Management 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/3/2024 G03 06 Discussion with CPD and debrief 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 IMT Project Management 2.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 City weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 Leadership check in 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 Training/RHP weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 Training paragraphs review 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 IMR9 revisions discussion 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/6/2024 No Objection Notice Drafting for COPA Training 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/7/2024 A&T check in 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/7/2024 IMT Project Management 2.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/7/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/7/2024 UOF weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/7/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT Project Management 3.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 Weekly with Casey McKenzie 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT Leadership Weekly 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT website review 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT website discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 A&T weekly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/8/2024 Coalition monthly call and debrief 2.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/9/2024 IMT Project Management 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/9/2024 COPA monthly call and debrief 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewing Judge Pallmeyer's Search Warrant Resolution 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 IMT/OAG weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 IMT Project Management 1.50



Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 CP weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 Bi Weekly Document and Requests call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 IMT Project Management 2.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 Bi weekly Associate Monitor Meeting 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 IMT/City weekly call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 UOF productions review 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 Public Hearing Prep 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/13/2024 A&T methodologies review 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 IMT Project Management 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 Settlement Conference with the Parties and the Coalition 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 Settlement Conference with the Parties and debrief 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 Public Hearing Prep 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 Public Hearing and Debrief 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 June Public Hearing Prep for website 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 Check in with Laura Kunard 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 No Objection Notice draft for COPA training 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/14/2024 IMR9 A&T review 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 Review and revise methodologies for all sections 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 Weekly call with Casey McKenzie 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT Project Management 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT Leadership Weekly 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 COPA Training Observation 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 A&T weekly team call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 Methodology discussion 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/15/2024 IMR9 revisions 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 IMR9 A&T review 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 Productions discussion with IMT 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 OWS production comment review 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 Accountability Monthly call and prep 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 IMT website updates 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/16/2024 IMT Project Management 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 IMT Project Management 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 IMT/OAG weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 CP weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 Call with Anthony Ray about methodologies 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 668 meeting prep 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/17/2024 Data weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 IMT Project Management 3.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 IMT/City weekly call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 IMR9 discussion 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 Meeting with CPD 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 IMT website discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 City/Coalition CMA policy discussion and debrief 1.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 OAG A&T monthly discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/20/2024 668 Meeting and Debrief 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/21/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/21/2024 UOF weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/21/2024 IMT website updates 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/22/2024 IMR10 prep with Rodney 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/23/2024 IMT website updates 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 IMT Project Management 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 OWS weekly team call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 BIA bi weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 OWS monthly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 Reviewing IMR10 deliverables for all sections 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 IMR10 productions review for A&T 2.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 UIC report discussion 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/28/2024 No Objection Notice Drafting for COPA Training 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 Weekly call with Casey McKenzie 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT website discussion 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT Leadership Weekly 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT Project Management 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 A&T weekly team call 1.00



Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 IP weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/29/2024 IMR10 deliverables review for A&T 1.00
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/30/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/30/2024 No Objection Notice drafting for CPD production 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/30/2024 A&T IMR10 deliverables review 3.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 IMT/OAG weekly call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 Call with Rodney Monroe 0.75
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 IMT Project Management 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 CP weekly team call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 Bi weekly Associate Monitor Meeting 1.25
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 Methodology discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson May 2024 5/31/2024 Analysts monthly call 0.75
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/1/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/2/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/3/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/6/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/7/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 5.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/8/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/9/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/10/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 5.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/13/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/14/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/15/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/16/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/17/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/20/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/21/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/22/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/23/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 0.50
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/24/2024 Website maintenance, updates, and new site development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/30/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan May 2024 5/31/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/1/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/1/2024 Review shield training production 1.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/1/2024 Review U01 13 policy production 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/1/2024 Track productions sent to UOF section in IMR 10 for report notes 1.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/1/2024 Review S03 05 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Attend UOF IMT/OAG meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Attend UOF IMT/OAG meeting debrief 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Review UOF methodologies 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Review CIT section notes for OEMC trainings 1.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Review updated monthly UOF meeting PPT 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Attend monthly CPD UOF meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/2/2024 Review and develop monthly UOF meeting notes 2.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/3/2024 IMT project management 1.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/3/2024 Review and develop monthly UOF meeting notes 1.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/3/2024 Draft UOF section information requests 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/6/2024 IMT project management 3.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/6/2024 Review Basic Law Enforcement Recruit training production 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/6/2024 Draft UOF section information requests 2.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/7/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/7/2024 Review previous UOF requests sent to CPD and COPA 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/7/2024 Attend weekly UOF section check in 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/7/2024 Compile and review CPD operational discussion notes to date 2.50

Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/7/2024
Review UOF methodologies for any changes as they relate operational compliance discussions with
CPD 2.00

Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/8/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT project management 2.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/8/2024 Attend IMT website discussion 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/8/2024 Develop and review UOF methodologies 1.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/8/2024 Review CPD progress towards operational compliance on UOF paragraphs 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/9/2024 Attend UOF methodologies discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/9/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/9/2024 Revise UOF information requests 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/9/2024 IMT project management 3.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/9/2024 Review IMT comments to S03 05 policy 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/10/2024 IMT project management 2.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/13/2024 IMT project management 2.50



Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/13/2024 Discuss UOF methodologies with AM 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/13/2024 Revise UOF methodologies 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/13/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/13/2024 IMT project management 3.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/14/2024 IMT project management 3.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/14/2024 Attend weekly UOF section check in 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/14/2024 Review City/OAG comments to IMR 9 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT project management 1.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/15/2024 Review G03 06 and IMT comments to policy 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/15/2024 Additional updates to revised UOF methodologies 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/15/2024 Review latest revisions to CMA policies 1.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/16/2024 IMT project management 3.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/16/2024 IMT project management 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review monthly UOF PPT and agenda with CPD and City 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review meeting notes on IMR 9 BWC meeting regarding community engagement 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review discussion on motion to strike on a civil rights lawsuit 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review CPD's response to proposed UOF evaluation for level 1 TRR reviews 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/17/2024 Review UOF production on IFAK/MFAK distribution and replenishment 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Review UOF CPIC notification 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Review IMR 9 UOF revisions 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Attend UOF/ISR/Supervision crossover meeting 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Review revised CMA policies 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Attend weekly UOF section check in 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 Review CPIC notification 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 Review May CMA policy versions 1.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 Attend UOF/Data/A&T crossover meeting 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 Attend CP youth forms meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/22/2024 Develop and review CP youth forms meeting notes 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/23/2024 IMT project management 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/23/2024 Develop and review CP youth forms meeting notes 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/23/2024 Attend monthly CPD UOF meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/23/2024 Develop and review monthly CPD UOF meeting notes 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/23/2024 IMT project management 3.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/24/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/24/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/28/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/28/2024 Attend weekly UOF section check in 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/29/2024 Review formal production on level 1 TRRs 0.50
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/29/2024 Review quarterly city wide Taser inspection production 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/29/2024 Review TRED SOPs 1.00
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/31/2024 Attend monthly IMT analyst meeting 0.75
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/31/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.25
Heleana Melendez May 2024 5/21/2024 Review 668 meeting notes 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/1/2024 Monthly crossover meeting with Data, OWS, and Supervision section 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/7/2024 Internal weekly OWS meeting with team and IMT leadership 1.00

Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/8/2024 Coordinating with OWS team and setting up meeting with Communications Director Miriam Sobh 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/8/2024 Review proposed IMR 10 methodologies 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/14/2024 Internal weekly OWS IMT meeting with AM Deck Brown and PM Bryson 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/14/2024 OWS IMT meeting with Mariam Sobh and Casey McKenzie 0.50

Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/14/2024 Updating list of IMR 10 OWS deliverables to cross reference what has and has not been produced 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/14/2024 Reviewing Parties' feedback on IMR 9 and preparing responses 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/15/2024 Reviewing Parties' comments to IMR 9 and preparing responses 0.50

Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/15/2024
Meeting with Gwen Lemley Laurich to review Parties' responses to IMR 9 and prepare OWS official
response 0.50

Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/15/2024 Drafting Cordico Wellness Application SOP no objection notice 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/16/2024 Reviewing and revising Cordico Wellness SOP No Objection 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewing IMR 10 productions and methodologies for compliance 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewing 668 Meeting Notes 0.25
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewing IMR 10 productions and methodologies for compliance 0.75
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/22/2024 Internal discussions and response to CPD about May monthly meeting agenda items 0.50



Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/23/2024 Preparing IMR 10 deliverable and compliance chart to aid in writing IMR 10 2.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/23/2024 Internal OWS weekly meeting with AM Deck Brown 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/28/2024 Internal weekly OWS meeting with AM Deck Brown and IMT leadership 2.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/28/2024 Monthly OWS IMT Meeting with CPD & OAG 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/29/2024 Clean and disseminate notes from May OWS IMT CPD monthly meeting 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/29/2024 Review OWS production TISMP e Learning refresher 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/31/2024 Discussion with supervision analyst 0.50
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/31/2024 Meeting with AM Deck Brown discussing IMR 10 compliance 1.00
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/31/2024 Monthly IMT analyst meeting 0.75
Jessica Dockstader May 2024 5/31/2024 Reviewing OWS informal data production 0.25
Joseph Hoereth May 2024 5/13/2024 Check in with NORC on Community Survey 1.00
Joseph Hoereth May 2024 5/6/2024 CET Meeting 0.50
Joseph Hoereth May 2024 5/9/2024 District Council Meeting 15th District 1.50
Joseph Hoereth May 2024 5/31/2024 Associate Monitor Meeting 1.50

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/6/2024

Weekly check in call with City: .5
IMT leadership team calls: 1.5
Public hearing prep meeting: .5
Community engagement team meeting: .5
IMR 9: 2 5.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/7/2024

Analyst meetings: 1.5
IMR 9: .5
Comprehensive Assessment: 1 3.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/8/2024

Weekly leadership team meeting: 1
IMT communications and scheduling: .5
IMT website updates: 1
Meeting with community groups: 2 4.50

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/9/2024

IMT website: 1
Meeting with Parties: 1.5
Community meeting: 2
IMT communications and scheduling: .5 5.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/10/2024

Weekly check in call with OAG: .5
IMR 9: 1
Methodologies: 1
Meetings with analysts: .5 3.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/13/2024

Calls with Associate Monitors: 1
IMT leadership meeting: 1
IMT Training meeting: .5
IMT website updates: .5
Public hearing prep: .5
IMR 9: .5 4.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/14/2024

Court hearing prep: .25
Settlement conference with Parties: 1
Settlement conference with Coalition: 1
Court hearing: .25
IMT leadership team meeting: 1
IMR 9: .5 4.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/15/2024

Weekly IMT leadership team meeting: 1
Methodologies: 1
IMR 9: 1
IMT website: 1 4.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/17/2024
IMT leadership team meetings: 1
IMR 9: 1 2.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/20/2024

Weekly check in call with City: .5
IMT leadership team calls: 1.25
IMT website revisions: 2.25
Monthly 668 meeting: 1 5.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/24/2024 Comprehensive Assessment: 2 2.00
Laura Kunard May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT leadership team call: 1 1.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/30/2024
CIR and FRB: .5
IMR leadership call: .5 1.00

Laura Kunard May 2024 5/31/2024

Weekly check in call with OAG: .5
IMT leadership team meetings:1
Associate Monitor meetings: 1.5
Methodology meetings: 1
Analyst meeting: 1 5.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/1/2024 PO 0023632 Call with Maggie regarding USS request regarding the DNC 0.50
Laura McElroy May 2024 5/2/2024 Call with Anthony Ray regarding USS request regarding the DNC 0.25

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/3/2024 Call with Rodney regarding USS request regarding the DNC and communication TA for CPD 0.50



Laura McElroy May 2024 5/6/2024

Drafted email with details of the USS JIC plans for the DNC and shared with IMT leadership. Texting
internal communication contact at CPD to set up call. Texting with Rodney. CET meeting regarding
IMR9, survey, community meeting planning (.5) 1.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/7/2024

Meeting with CPD Internal Communication Discussed Strategic Communication Plan, new
supervisor training classes, new podcast, DNC planning. Drafted email to leadership to share the
newsletter, podcast and training information. 1.50

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/14/2024 Consent Decree Monthly Status Hearing. Texting with internal communication coordinator 1.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/16/2024
Email from WTTW, call with Anthony Ray on specifics. Call with WTTW on investigative stops. Call
with Chicago Tribune 1.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/19/2024
Wrote quotes about DNC. Texted with leadership and received direction on how to edit the quotes.
Emailed Chief Deck Brown for content 1.50

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/20/2024 Rewrote DNC quotes and two other options. Email exchange with Chief Deck Brown 1.50
Laura McElroy May 2024 5/21/2024 Call with Maggie. Reviewed updated news release and provided edits 1.25

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/22/2024
Reviewed updated news release and provided additional edits, email exchange. Texting exchange
with CD communications cord. Call with Sun Times. 1.75

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/23/2024
Load up news release in constant contact, share for review, edits to news release, distribute to
media, call with Sun Times. 2.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/24/2024
Email and call with ABC7, call with Anthony Ray regarding traffic stops, background email for ABC7
to understand issue 1.75

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/28/2024 Email and reworking wording about traffic stops on flyer for public to attend next court hearing 0.50

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/29/2024

Began recreating flyer in English in Constant Contact on court hearing open tot he public. Call with
USS about the Joint Information Center tabletop for the DNC. Call with Chief Monroe about
technical assistance for CPD. Texting Maggie about JIC tabletop for DNC. 2.50

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/30/2024
Messaging Laura K, Anthony Ray, and Chief Monroe regarding someone attending the JIC tabletop
put on by USS for DNC prep. Emailing and call with USS regarding DNC JIC 1.00

Laura McElroy May 2024 5/31/2024

Worked on flyer for June public hearing. Spanish translation and updated English version. Set up to
distribute on Monday after lunch. Texting with CD communications POC. Call with Meredith about
firearm pointing article error in Tribune. Call and email to Chicago Tribune 2.00

Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/1/2024 Monthly IMT/OAG/CPD meeting follow ups 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/2/2024 IMR9 Follow ups (CIT Section) 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/2/2024 IMR10 writing CIT 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/6/2024 IMR10 CIT Section 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/7/2024 CIT Weekly Internal Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/7/2024 CIT IMR10 notes summary document 2.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/8/2024 CIT Section training notes 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/9/2024 CIT CPD training production history 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/13/2024 CIT production review and internal meeting prep 2.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/14/2024 CIT Weekly Internal Meeting and Notes 1.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/14/2024 IMR9 Final Comments Review 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/15/2024 CIT production updates & review 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/16/2024 CIT section production review 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/20/2024 IMR10 CIT section review 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/21/2024 CIT Section IMR10 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/22/2024 CIT Section IMR10 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/23/2024 CIT Section IMR10 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/24/2024 CIT Section production review 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/28/2024 CIT Section weekly internal meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/28/2024 CPD/OAG/IMT CIT Monthly Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/28/2024 CPD/OAG/IMT notes cleaning from monthly meeting 0.50
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/31/2024 IMT Analyst Monthly Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey May 2024 5/31/2024 CPD Production Review and Summary for IMR10 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/31/2024 Participated in IMT meeting with other analysts 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/31/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed IMR10 Training Requirements 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/24/2024 Discussion with Parties: Informal CPD call with Data team 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/24/2024 Reviewed best practices on law enforcement data systems 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/24/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/23/2024 Meeting with AM to discuss IMR10 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/23/2024 Reviewed TRR Level 1 Data 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/22/2024 Reviewed RFI's for IMR10 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/22/2024 Reviewed Supervision agenda 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/20/2024 Meeting with AM to discuss IMR10 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewed TRR Supervisory Dashboard with IDR eLearning production 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/17/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/15/2024 Reviewed and drafted updates to IMR9 1.00



Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/14/2024 Reviewed all Data productions received in IMR10 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/13/2024 Reviewed UoF TRR Level 1 Data Request 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/13/2024 Discussion with Parties: IMT/OAG EISS Check in 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/10/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewed S03 05 production and comments 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/8/2024 Reviewed D20 04 production and comments 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/7/2024 Reviewed recent Use of Force events 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/6/2024 Drafted and reviewed no objection notice for CPD U05 02 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/3/2024 Discussion with Parties: Informal CPD call with Data team 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/2/2024 Drafted RFI for Data team 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/1/2024 Reviewed Par. 606 final assessment 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/1/2024 Reviewed EIS/OSS paragraphs for training 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/1/2024 Reviewed FRB paragraphs for training requirements 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez May 2024 5/1/2024 Participated in IMT meeting with other sections 0.50
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/1/2024 Internal weekly meeting with AM Durham 1.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/1/2024 Internal OSW/Data crossover meeting 0.50

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/2/2024
Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items and
follow ups 1.00

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/6/2024 Supervision Evaluation Committee Meeting and follow ups 2.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/8/2024 Monthly Internal OAG/IMT Supervision Call 1.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/8/2024 Weekly Internal call with AM Durham and follow ups 1.50

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/9/2024
Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items and
follow ups 1.00

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/20/2024 Internal Call with AM Durham 1.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/20/2024 Review of policy production 1.00

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/23/2024
Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items and
follow ups 1.00

Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/24/2024 Call with CPD re: supervisory logs and Follow Ups 1.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/28/2024 Preparation and Internal Call to discuss IMR 10 2.00
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/30/2024 Monthly IMT/OAG Supervision call 0.50
Monique Jenkins May 2024 5/31/2024 OSW/Supervision Crossover meeting 0.50
Norma Ramos May 2024 5/13/2024 Survey meeting with NORC 1.00

Norma Ramos May 2024 5/6/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and potential meetings 2.00

Norma Ramos May 2024 5/13/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and potential meetings 2.00

Norma Ramos May 2024 5/20/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and potential meetings 2.00

Norma Ramos May 2024 5/28/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and hearing 2.00

Norma Ramos May 2024 5/13/2024 Attend IMT CET Bi Weekly meeting 1.00
Norma Ramos May 2024 5/14/2024 Attend IMT Public Hearing via Zoom. Topic community policing 1.50
Norma Ramos May 2024 5/9/2024 Community meeting with District Council 15 2.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/1/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/1/2024 ISR weekly report 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/1/2024 A&T weekly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/2/2024 Supervision weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/2/2024 Calls with Allan and Allyson 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/2/2024 Reviewed IMR9 3rd draft 2.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/2/2024 Calls w/Bridgette, Dirden, Aray, and Bowman to discuss revisions to IMR9 pars. 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/3/2024 Calls w/T and Allyson to discuss par436, 437, &389 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/3/2024 Reviewed COPA’s 2024/2025 Training Plan 1.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/3/2024 Prep for various IMT/CPD meetings 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/5/2024 Call w/Maggie to discuss CPD to various pars. 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/6/2024 Call w/Allan and Allyson 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/6/2024 Supervision meeting w/Evaluation Committee 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/7/2024 Meeting w/Superintendent 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/7/2024 Calls with Allyson and Allan to discuss CMA policy and training 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/7/2024 UOF weekly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/7/2024 Monthly RHP meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/8/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/8/2024 Meeting w/Coalition and City 2.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/9/2024 Supervision weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/9/2024 Meeting w/OAG/City to discuss CMA 2.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/9/2024 Reviewed CPD CP PPT presentation and agenda 0.75



Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewed notes from meeting w/Coalition 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewed and responded to various emails 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewed Judge Pallmeyer SW Ruling 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/10/2024 Reviewed various training par associated with all CD sections 3.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 AM bi weekly meeting and prep 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 Weekly meeting w/City 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 Weekly meeting w/Allyson and Novalez 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 Additional review of Training par for all CD sections 1.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 Reviewed agenda and responses for Settlement Conference 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/13/2024 Reviewed IMT comments and draft statement on CP for Public Hearing 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/14/2024 Reviewed CPD draft 201 revisions, call with Allyson to discuss 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/14/2024 Settlement Conference w/Judge Pallmeyer 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/14/2024 Status Hearing Community Policing 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/14/2024 TCAC Meeting 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/15/2024 Monthly Training meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/15/2024 Reviewed draft 668 meeting agenda 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/16/2024 Reviewed and discussed A&T Officer Interview Lesson Plan 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewed notes from OAG weekly meeting 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewed CPD weekly productions CP, CI, UOF, Supervision 1.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/17/2024 Reviewed and discussed Cit/OAG responses to draft IMR9 1.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/18/2024 Additional review of training paragraphs by section 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/19/2024 Reviewed CPD latest draft of WFA and OAG comments 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/19/2024 Reviewed CPD De escalation UOF PPT for 5/23 meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Reviewed and made notes to Coalition responses to CMA 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Meeting w/City 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Follow up IMT meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Weekly meeting w/Allyson and Novalez 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Meeting Laura to discuss methodologies. 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Meeting Coalition to follow up on Settlement Conference and IMT debrief 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 Reviewed and commented on IMT Introduction for IMR9 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/20/2024 668 meeting and debrief 2.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewed CPD pending IMR10 productions to discuss w/Ams 2.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 Meeting to discuss GO06 OIS 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 UOF/ISR weekly meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewed OAG WFA Scope comments and City responses 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 Prep for various IMT/CPD meetings 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewed Coalitions 5/20/24 response to CMA policy and notes from meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/22/2024 Prepared responses to CPD forthcoming productions in consultation with Ams. 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/22/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/22/2024 Meeting w/Data, UOF, and A&T crossover 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/22/2024 Weekly ISR meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/23/2024 Weekly Supervision meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/23/2024 WFA Scope meeting w/City and OAG 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/24/2024 Meeting w/OAG to discuss GO3 06 Policy Suite 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 OW weekly meeting 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 OW Monthly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 UOF weekly meeting, call with Paul 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 CIT weekly meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 CIT Monthly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/28/2024 Supervision meeting to discuss IMR10 deliverables 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed and comments on proposed methodologies 1.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed 5/24 CPD productions for IMR10 2.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed Coalition recent responses to CMA policies 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 A&T weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 Weekly IP meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 CP monthly meeting 1.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/29/2024 Reviewed City response to Coalition on latest draft. 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/30/2024 Supervision monthly meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/30/2024 Call w/Allan to discuss CIT 0.25
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/30/2024 Meeting w/CCPSA to discuss 1.00
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/30/2024 Monthly IP meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/30/2024 CCPSA Public meeting 1.75
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/31/2024 Meeting w/OAG 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/31/2024 CP weekly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe May 2024 5/31/2024 AM bi weekly meeting and prep 1.75
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/1/2024 Impartial Policing team meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/6/2024 Reviewed new CPD productions 1.00



Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/8/2024 Coordinated meetings for Impartial Policing Section 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/10/2024 Impartial Policing team meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/10/2024 Assisted with Impartial Policing team transition 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/15/2024 Reviewed CPD response to IMR 9 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/15/2024 Reviewed latest CPD productions 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT Analyst meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/15/2024 IMT Impartial Policing Team meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/16/2024 Impartial Policing meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/20/2024 Reviewed latest version of Community Engagement Plan 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/20/2024 Reviewed latest CPD productions 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/21/2024 Reviewed 668 meeting minutes 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/28/2024 Reviewed latest CPD productions 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/28/2024 Reviewed OAG notice of extension 0.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/28/2024 Reviewed materials for upcoming OAG meetings 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/29/2024 OAG IMT Monthly Meeting Community Policing 1.50
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/29/2024 Impartial Policing weekly meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/30/2024 Cleaned and distributed meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/30/2024 OAG IMT Monthly Meeting Impartial Policing 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/31/2024 Cleaned and distributed meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith May 2024 5/31/2024 Monthly IMT internal meeting 1.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/1/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and report. Held meeting
with District Advisory Council Chairs. 3.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/2/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/3/2024
Participated in weekly internal community policing status meeting. Worked with AM for
Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and report. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/6/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 3.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/7/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.50
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/8/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/9/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. Held meeting with OCPR
regarding IMT 10 productions and deadlines. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/10/2024
Participated in weekly internal community policing status meeting. Worked with AM for
Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and report. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/13/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/14/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/15/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/16/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/17/2024
Participated in weekly internal community policing status meeting. Worked with AM for
Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and report. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/19/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/20/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix May 2024 5/21/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/22/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. Documented meeting
highlights of the of rescheduled meeting with the City re: Youth Focused policies. 1.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/23/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00

Tammy Felix May 2024 5/24/2024
Participated in weekly internal community policing status meeting. Worked with AM for
Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and report. 1.50

Tom Christoff May 2024 5/3/2024 Phone conference with CPD members regarding check in. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/3/2024 Weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/6/2024 Prepare for and participate in weekly IMT/CPD/City meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/10/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/13/2024 Participate in Associate Monitors bi weekly meeting 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/13/2024 Prepare for and participate in IMT/OAG EISS check in 1.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/17/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/20/2024 Participate in IMR10 discussion with Data Team. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/21/2024 Review CPD use of force data production and have phone conversation with IMT team. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/22/2024 Participate in crossover meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/22/2024 Phone calls with IMT members. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/23/2024 Participate in IMR10 paragraph discussion. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/23/2024 Review IDR eLearning and provide comments. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/24/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/28/2024 Review CPD productions. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/28/2024 Participate in meeting with University of Chicago personnel. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/29/2024 Phone conversation with Supervision AM. 0.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/30/2024 Participate in meeting regarding CPD use of force data. 1.00
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/31/2024 Participate in monthly AM meeting. 1.50
Tom Christoff May 2024 5/31/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/1/2024 Compile comments for RHP production 1.50
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/2/2024 Finalize response for RHP productions 2.00



Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/6/2024 Finalize response for RHP productions 2.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/7/2024 Finalize response for RHP productions 1.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/14/2024 IMR 10 productions review 1.50
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/20/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call 1.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/21/2024 Review training related CD paragraphs 2.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/22/2024 IMR 10 productions analysis preparation 2.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/23/2024 Training communications with CD sections 0.50
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/29/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call 2.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/30/2024 Compile comments for training production 1.00
Valerie Schmitt May 2024 5/31/2024 Monthly CNA IMT meeting 2.00







Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Valerie Schmitt 4/8/2024 - 4/11/2024 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Other (Lodging) 792.48 792.48 0 
Other (Per Diem) 66.26* 60.79 5.47 
Parking (Daily) 113.00 50.00 63.00 
Mileage 225.72 225.72 0 
Total 1197.46 (Total Expenses) 1128.99 68.47 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 3 nights = $792.48  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 4 and 
$60 on days 2 - 3. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/9 - $18.43 ($12.96 direct; $5.47 unbillable due to non-itemized receipt) 
4/10 - $39.73 (all direct) 
4/11 - $8.10 (all direct) 
 



























Day 4/8/2024 4/9/2024 4/10/2024 4/11/2024
Max Per Diem Rate $45.00 $ .00 $60.00 $ .00
breakfast $5.47
lunch $12.96 $7.98
dinner $31.75 $8.10

total $0.00 $18.43 $39.73 $8.10 $66.26

IMR 10 Site Visit









Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Bridgette Bryson 4/7/2024 - 4/11/2024 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Airfare 376.96 376.96 0 
TA Fee 15.00 15.00  
Other (Lodging) 792.48 792.48 0 
Other (Per Diem) 197.63* 66.72 130.91 
Parking (Airport) 100 50 50 
Ground Transp. 269.54 0 269.54 
Total 1751.61 (Total Expenses) 1301.16 450.45 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 3 nights = $792.48  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 5 and 
$60 on days 2 - 4. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/7 - $50.41 ($19.77 direct; $30.64 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
4/8 - $22.00 ($22 direct) 
4/9 - $72.17 ($11.77 direct; $60.40 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
4/10 - $53.05 ($13.18 direct; $39.87 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
 

























































Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Heleana Melendez 4/7/2024 - 4/10/2024 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Airfare 469.20 469.20  
TA Fee 15.00 15.00  
Other (Lodging) 792.48 792.48 0 
Other (Per Diem) 182.15* 135.76 46.39 
Gr. Transp. 284.80 50.00 234.80 
Total 1743.63 (Total Expenses) 1462.44 281.19 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 3 nights = $792.48  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 4 and 
$60 on days 2 - 3. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/7 - $59.25 ($45 direct; $14.25 unbillable – capped at $59.25 GSA per diem allowance for travel day) 
4/8 - $62.56 ($30.42 direct; $32.14 unbillable due to non-itemized receipt) 
4/9 - $21.05 (all direct) 
4/10 - $39.29 (all direct) 
 
































































































