
Taxpayer Identification Number:            Due Upon Receipt

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.

Invoice Number 2335705
Invoice Date 06/11/2024
Client Number 451895
Matter Number 00000

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involving the
Chicago Police Department

Reference Number 17-CV-6260

For Professional Services Rendered From April 01, 2024 Through April 30, 2024

Re: CPD Monitor

Total Fees 215,799.00

Total Disbursements 231,085.71

Total Amount Due This Invoice $446,884.71
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours Value
04/01/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 

regarding Data and Use of Force sections, 
court filings, and staffing study.

0.50 197.50

04/01/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

0.50 225.00

04/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Analyze revised CPD workforce allocation 
scope of work in preparation of discussing 
same during internal crisis intervention 
meeting

0.70 294.00

04/01/24 Brian J Hamilton Review recent crisis intervention 
productions in preparation of sending 
same to J. Solomon

0.40 168.00

04/01/24 Kacy Rayburn Load to Relativity IMTSECURE042 
Production Volume

1.20 180.00

04/01/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly IMT/CPD/City check-in (.5); 
meeting with A. Sepulveda regarding BWC 
public safety questions research (.8); 
review BWC materials (1.2); and review 
IMT draft comments (.5).

3.00 1,500.00

04/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
public hearing preparation, CPD 
productions, and body-worn camera 
materials for J. Pallmeyer.

1.30 585.00

04/01/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/City/CPD check-in meeting. 0.40 180.00

04/01/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze training and recruitment 
productions.

0.50 197.50

04/01/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal section meeting for 
recruitment and training.

0.80 316.00

04/02/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Use of Force and Crisis Intervention 
section meetings.

2.20 869.00

04/02/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Use of Force, and Crisis 
Intervention sections.

1.00 395.00

04/02/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed IMT analysis and comments in 
response to CPD document productions 
related to Crisis Intervention section.

0.40 158.00
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04/02/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with City regarding 

document request related to Use of Force 
and Data sections.

0.20 79.00

04/02/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with the City, 
CPD, IMT, and OAG.

0.60 237.00

04/02/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 3/28 productions.

0.80 156.00

04/02/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

0.30 135.00

04/02/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with crisis 
intervention section re upcoming internal 
meeting and topics to cover during same 
(.2); communications with M. DeCarlo re 
upcoming public hearing (.2); attend 
internal crisis intervention meeting (1.2); 
multiple communications with the crisis 
intervention section re action items to 
prepare for upcoming public hearing and 
IMR 9 report (.5); prepare draft comments 
on S05-14 and no objection notice for CIT 
Coordinator training certifications (3.1)

5.20 2,184.00

04/02/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly internal Officer Wellness 
meeting regarding the Annual Report to 
the Superintendent, future monthly 
meeting agendas, and the Work Force 
Analysis Scope.

0.80 300.00

04/02/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review and analyze recent document 
productions for compliance.

1.70 637.50

04/02/24 Kacy Rayburn Import into Relativity Monitor Production 
Volume MONITOR1909 through 
MONITOR1953 for case team review.

3.50 525.00

04/02/24 Maggie Hickey IMR-9 RHP monthly meeting (.9); Zoom 
meeting re April 9 Public Hearing re CIT 
issues (1.4); and Zoom meeting / debrief 
re Public Hearing; and review IMT draft 
comments (.5).

2.80 1,400.00

04/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
preparation for public hearing.

1.90 855.00

04/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet with parties in preparation for April 9 0.50 225.00
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public hearing.

04/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting. 0.90 405.00

04/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT CIT meeting. 0.80 360.00

04/02/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.00 450.00

04/02/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.50 197.50

04/02/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend monthly CPD/OAG/IMT recruitment 
meeting.

0.50 197.50

04/03/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended meeting with 
IMT attorneys.

1.70 671.50

04/03/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections.

0.30 118.50

04/03/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
meeting related to Data, Supervision, and 
Officer Wellness sections.

0.40 158.00

04/03/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 3/28 productions.

1.90 370.50

04/03/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

2.90 1,305.00

04/03/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Analyze and draft comments regarding the 
Work Force Analysis Scope.

1.20 450.00

04/03/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend weekly IMT impartial policing call. 0.50 197.50

04/03/24 Maggie Hickey Meeting with IMT leadership regarding site 
visit and public hearing (1.2); meeting with 
M. DeCarlo, A. Sepulveda and A. Becker 
regarding BWC research and issues (2.3); 
and review of draft memo (.5).

4.00 2,000.00

04/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT in 
preparation for meeting regarding ¶835 
needs assessment, regarding comments 
on CPD productions, and regarding IMR9.

0.80 360.00

04/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/CPD meeting regarding ¶835 needs 
assessment.

1.10 495.00

04/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 2.30 1,035.00
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draft materials for Court for body-worn 
camera policy.

04/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT ISR meeting. 0.80 360.00

04/03/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly cross-sectional internal IMT 
meeting regarding CPD pilots.

0.50 225.00

04/03/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Zoom conference with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency team.

0.50 197.50

04/03/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft response to training production. 0.80 316.00

04/04/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed site visit notes and 
materials related to Crisis Intervention and 
Data sections.

1.30 513.50

04/04/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention and Data 
sections.

0.30 118.50

04/04/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend weekly internal 
Supervision call at which we discussed 
productions, monthly meetings, and future 
action items.

1.00 375.00

04/04/24 Maggie Hickey Supervision IMT/OAG monthly call (1.0); 
preparation for public hearing (.8); call with 
A. Slagel (.3); review of comments on 
Workforce Allocation study scope of work 
(.5); review draft IMT comments (.7); 
communications with M. DeCarlo and T. 
Christoff regarding TRED statistical 
sample (.5).

3.80 1,900.00

04/04/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
training requirements in UOF section in 
preparation for discussion with OAG (0.7); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
analysis of Level 1 TRRs (0.4); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
preparation for public hearing (0.3).

1.40 630.00

04/04/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise IMT responses to Accountability 
and Transparency productions.

1.20 474.00

04/04/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.30 118.50

04/04/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Zoom conference with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency team.

0.30 118.50

04/05/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed communications, 2.00 790.00
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materials, productions, and draft 
comments related to Data, Crisis 
Intervention, Use of Force, Training, and 
Accountability and Transparency sections.

04/05/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
meeting related to Data, Supervision, and 
Officer Wellness sections in preparation 
for site visit.

0.80 316.00

04/05/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, 
Training, Use of Force, and Accountability 
and Transparency sections.

0.90 355.50

04/05/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Data section meeting.

1.00 395.00

04/05/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for IMT Data section site visit. 0.80 316.00

04/05/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 4/4 productions.

0.60 117.00

04/05/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise S05-14 (2.2); multiple 
communications with M. Hickey and M. 
DeCarlo re upcoming public hearing and 
productions (.7); further revise S05-14 no 
objection and circulate to wider group (.4)

3.20 1,344.00

04/05/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for EISS site visit meeting. 0.70 262.50

04/05/24 Kacy Rayburn Load to Relativity IMTSECURE043 for 
case team review.

1.20 180.00

04/05/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG weekly check-in (.5); UoF 
discussion regarding para 245, 247, and 
248 with OAG (1); and review of IMT draft 
comments (.5).

2.00 1,000.00

04/05/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT Data meeting (0.4); 
communicate within the IMT regarding use 
of force training requirements (0.7); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
comments on CPD productions (0.1); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
FRB meetings (0.1); communicate within 
the IMT regarding secure document 
production (0.1); communicate within the 
IMT regarding Free2Move Coalition report 
on traffic stops (0.6).

2.00 900.00

04/05/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in meeting (0.5); 0.90 405.00
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IMT/OAG meeting to discuss use of force 
training requirements (0.4)

04/05/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
data needed to analyze Level 1 TRRs.

1.60 720.00

04/05/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT comments and no 
objection notices.

0.70 276.50

04/05/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft IMT responses to training and 
recruitment productions,

1.50 592.50

04/05/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Meeting with OAG and IMT to discuss Use 
of Force training.

0.50 197.50

04/06/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise comments on CPD 
production and communicate within the 
IMT regarding same.

0.40 180.00

04/08/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding site visits and Crisis Intervention 
section.

0.20 79.00

04/08/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed materials and draft comments 
related to Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

04/08/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise S05-14 no objection notice and 
circulate to leadership (.3); submit no 
objection notices to City (.3); review 
revised notes on public hearing from 
leadership (.2); multiple communication 
with crisis intervention section re 
upcoming public hearing and review 
revised materials for same (.6)

1.40 588.00

04/08/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review Annual Report to the 
Superintendent (1.00); draft comments 
regarding same (0.80).

1.80 675.00

04/08/24 Kaila D. Clark Virtually attend superintendent's 
community forum and discuss same with 
IMT members.

2.50 987.50

04/08/24 Maggie Hickey Prepare for and attend Monthly 668 
meeting (2.8); FRB discussion (UoF and 
Data) (1); site visit follow up meeting with 
R. Monroe (1.2).

5.00 2,500.00

04/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
¶668 meeting, site visits, and preparation 
for public hearing.

0.30 135.00

04/08/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly ¶668 meeting (1.2); communicate 
with parties regarding public hearing and 

1.40 630.00
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panelist access to same (0.2).

04/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.50 197.50

04/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with BIA and the IMT 
regarding training modules.

0.80 316.00

04/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Draft IMT comments regarding a COPA 
production.

0.90 355.50

04/08/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Email with IMT members regarding IMT 
comments.

0.10 39.50

04/09/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed materials related to Data 
section in preparation for site visit.

1.60 632.00

04/09/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections.

0.50 197.50

04/09/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended IMT Data 
section site visit.

6.00 2,370.00

04/09/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with IMT crisis 
intervention section and leadership re 
today's public hearing (.9); attend public 
hearing (1.5); further review OEMC 2019 
production in preparation of discussing 
same with leadership (.6)

3.00 1,260.00

04/09/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend internal Officer 
Wellness meeting regarding recent 
productions and compliance 
determinations.

1.50 562.50

04/09/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Draft comments relating to the Annual 
Report to the Superintendent.

1.20 450.00

04/09/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend EISS site visit meeting virtually. 0.40 150.00

04/09/24 Maggie Hickey Prepare for and lead Consent Decree 
monthly Settlement Conference (1.5); 
prepare for meeting with Judge Pallmeyer 
and attend Virtual Public Status Hearing 
Re: Crisis Intervention (2); site visit - 
Community Engagement Plan (IP & CP) 
(1.5); debriefs regarding site visits (1.8); 
and review of IMT materials (1.5).

8.30 4,150.00

04/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
settlement conference, public hearing, site 

1.00 450.00
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visits, and comments on CPD productions.

04/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate with parties and Coalition 
regarding panelist access to webinar for 
public hearing.

0.20 90.00

04/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions.

0.10 45.00

04/09/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Appear for and host Zoom webinar for 
public hearing (1.2); appear for and host 
Zoom for settlement conference (1.0).

2.20 990.00

04/09/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend IMR-10 site visit for Training and 
Recruitment, Hiring and Promotions 
sections.

6.70 2,646.50

04/10/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with the IMT, 
City, CPD, and OAG.

1.20 474.00

04/10/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections.

0.50 197.50

04/10/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended IMT attorneys 
meeting.

1.00 395.00

04/10/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Crisis Intervention section meeting.

1.00 395.00

04/10/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Attending bimonthly meeting regarding site 
visits, COPA footage for officer involved 
shooting, public hearing topics, and 
productions.

0.70 136.50

04/10/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

0.60 270.00

04/10/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend internal AFS meeting to discuss 
consent decree updates and action items 
(.9); attend internal crisis intervention 
section weekly check in to discuss case 
updates (1.0)

1.90 798.00

04/10/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Meeting with H. Grosch-Jurowicz, A. 
Durham, and M. Jenkins relating to recent 
productions.

1.00 375.00

04/10/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend bi-weekly internal ArentFox Schiff 
meeting regarding productions, site visits, 
and methodologies.

0.90 337.50
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04/10/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 

Laurich
Draft comments relating to the Annual 
Report to the Superintendent and D20-02.

3.40 1,275.00

04/10/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend biweekly IMT attorneys meeting. 1.00 395.00

04/10/24 Kylie S Wood Reviewed notes and materials to send 
summary to M. DeCarlo of shared D. 
Rudovsky materials.

0.40 158.00

04/10/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly CompStat meeting (1.5); IMT 
leadership meeting (1); debriefs regarding 
site visits (2.8); and review of IMT draft 
comments for Judge Pallmeyer and CPD 
(2.5).

7.80 3,900.00

04/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT meetings for CIT and 
ISR sections.

2.10 945.00

04/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise data requests and 
feedback on CPD productions.

1.10 495.00

04/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze research on Fourth 
Amendment review protocols.

0.50 225.00

04/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting. 1.00 450.00

04/10/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate in-firm regarding Fourth 
Amendment review protocol research 
(0.2); communicate within the IMT 
regarding comments on CPD productions 
(0.2); communicate within the IMT 
regarding requests for data to analyze 
Level 1 TRRs (0.3).

0.70 315.00

04/10/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Zoom conference with the IMT's AFS 
team.

0.80 316.00

04/10/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT comments. 0.30 118.50

04/10/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend bi-weekly attorney meeting. 0.90 355.50

04/10/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend site visit for IMR-10. 2.50 987.50

04/11/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data section.

0.20 79.00

04/11/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

3.00 1,185.00

04/11/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed draft materials related to Data 
and Use of Force sections.

0.30 118.50

04/11/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 

1.00 450.00
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period

04/11/24 Brian J Hamilton Review 2019 production from city and 
closely analyze OEMC 2018 Mental 
Health Training therein in preparation of 
drafting response to City re IMR9 
assessments for crisis intervention section

2.60 1,092.00

04/11/24 Brian J Hamilton Draft response to City and OEMC re IMR9 
assessments for crisis intervention section

1.50 630.00

04/11/24 Brian J Hamilton Revise response and send to M. Hickey 
and leadership for review

0.30 126.00

04/11/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Communicate with M. DeCarlo regarding 
comments on the Annual Report to the 
Superintendent (0.80); communicate with 
C. Deck-Brown regarding same (.50).

1.30 487.50

04/11/24 Maggie Hickey Site visit follow-up (1.5); monthly COPA 
check-in (1); IMR-9 discussion (1.5); 
review of draft IMR-9 (1.2).

5.20 2,600.00

04/11/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
anticipated revisions to IMR9 and strategy 
regarding same (2.0); communicate within 
the IMT regarding feedback on CPD 
production for OWS (1.8).

3.80 1,710.00

04/11/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions.

0.40 180.00

04/11/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly meeting with COPA, the 
OAG, and the IMT.

0.90 355.50

04/11/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend site visit for IMR-10. 1.90 750.50

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed materials and draft comments 
related to Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention and Data 
sections.

0.40 158.00

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention and Data sections.

2.30 908.50

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/organized notes from Data 
section site visit meetings.

0.50 197.50

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City document 
productions related to Data, Crisis 
Intervention, and Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

04/12/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 1.20 474.00
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Data section meeting.

04/12/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

3.60 1,620.00

04/12/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force and 
Accountability and Transparency sections

1.40 630.00

04/12/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from M. DeCarlo re draft 
response to City and OEMC re IMR9 
assessments for crisis intervention section

0.10 42.00

04/12/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from J. Solomon re edits 
to draft correspondence to City and OEMC 
re IMR9 assessments

0.20 84.00

04/12/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from B. Bryson re crisis 
intervention productions, review same in 
preparation of routing to J. Solomon

0.30 126.00

04/12/24 Brian J Hamilton Review of revised methodologies, cross 
reference edits with prior methodologies in 
preparation of routing same to J. Solomon 
and leadership

1.80 756.00

04/12/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise comments regarding Annual 
Report to Superintendent (1.10); 
communicate with M. DeCarlo, J. 
Dockstader, R. Monroe, and C. Deck-
Brown regarding same (.90).

2.00 750.00

04/12/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend impartial policing team site visit 
debrief.

0.50 197.50

04/12/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG weekly check-in (.5); IMR9 – 
UoF meeting (1); and preparations of 
communications to Judge Pallmeyer(2.6).

4.10 2,050.00

04/12/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
tracking sheets and updates to same (0.8); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
UOF training requirements (1.1); weekly 
internal IMT Data meeting (0.5); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
comments on CPD productions (0.9).

3.30 1,485.00
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04/12/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call. 0.50 225.00

04/12/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review motion filed by Coalition regarding 
coordinated multiple arrests policies and 
training.

0.20 90.00

04/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

3.50 1,575.00

04/14/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force and 
Accountability and Transparency sections

1.20 540.00

04/15/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed and edited draft materials 
related to Use of Force section.

1.30 513.50

04/15/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding draft materials related to Use of 
Force section.

0.30 118.50

04/15/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed site visit notes related 
to Data section and materials related to 
Use of Force section.

0.30 118.50

04/15/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, IMT, 
CPD, and OAG.

0.50 197.50

04/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

2.30 1,035.00

04/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.30 135.00

04/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

3.00 1,350.00

04/15/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 

3.90 1,755.00
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and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

04/15/24 Maggie Hickey Weekly IMT/CPD/City check-in (.5); call 
with Judge Pallmeyer (.8) meetings with R. 
Monroe, L. Kunard, M. DeCarlo, B. Bryson 
to prepare for meeting with Judge 
Pallmeyer (2.3); meeting with IMT and 
Judge Pallmeyer (1).

4.60 2,300.00

04/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
IMR9, feedback on CPD productions, and 
draft materials for Court regarding body-
worn cameras.

1.40 630.00

04/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/J. Pallmeyer meeting. 0.70 315.00

04/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise email to parties regarding 
data requested to analyze Level 1 TRRs.

0.20 90.00

04/15/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/City/CPD check-in meeting. 0.30 135.00

04/15/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Independent Monitoring Report 9.

0.20 79.00

04/15/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review outstanding Accountability and 
Transparency productions.

0.20 79.00

04/15/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze training and recruitment 
productions.

0.60 237.00

04/15/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft no objection notice for recruitment 
production.

0.60 237.00

04/15/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal training and recruitment 
meeting.

0.40 158.00

04/16/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed draft materials related 
to Use of Force section.

0.20 79.00

04/16/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50

04/16/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communications from City 
related to Data requests.

0.10 39.50

04/16/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
related to Data and Use of Force sections.

0.20 79.00

04/16/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Use of Force section meeting.

1.10 434.50

04/16/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Compliance tracker with 
productions from 4/11.

0.80 156.00

04/16/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 4/11 productions.

1.30 253.50
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04/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 

Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

2.50 1,125.00

04/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the tenth reporting 
period

1.40 630.00

04/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force section

1.00 450.00

04/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the Coalition 
regarding Chicago Police Department 
policies and practices related to responses 
to protests

0.40 180.00

04/16/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.20 540.00

04/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend weekly Officer 
Wellness call regarding productions and 
compliance determinations.

1.50 562.50

04/16/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend meeting with UoF, ISR, and 
Supervision relating to compliance 
strategy and internal CPD processes.

1.00 375.00

04/16/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend crossover meeting between 
impartial policing and investigatory stops 
sections.

0.80 316.00

04/16/24 Maggie Hickey IMT discussions regarding comprehensive 
assessment (1.2); and review and follow 
up on IMT draft comments(1.3).

2.50 1,250.00

04/16/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting (1.0); 
weekly internal IMT CIT meeting (0.7); 
monthly cross-sectional internal IMT 
meetings with ISR, Supervision, UOF, and 
impartial policing teams (1.5); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
draft materials on body-worn cameras for 
the Court (1.5).

4.70 2,115.00
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04/16/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise draft materials for Court 

regarding body-worn cameras (2.0); draft 
and revise feedback on CPD productions 
(0.2); revise UOF section of IMR9 (0.1).

2.30 1,035.00

04/16/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze CPD productions. 0.20 90.00

04/16/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and finalize no objection notice to 
recruitment production.

0.30 118.50

04/17/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

04/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.60 270.00

04/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

2.20 990.00

04/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

3.10 1,395.00

04/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force and 
Accountability and Transparency sections

1.50 675.00

04/17/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, the 
Chicago Police Department, and the Office 
of the Illinois Attorney General regarding 
the comprehensive assessment

1.00 450.00

04/17/24 Maggie Hickey Chicago IMT leadership team meeting (1); 
weekly CompStat meeting and Chief Hein 
meeting following (2); prepare for and lead 
continued Comprehensive Assessment 
Discussion Zoom meeting (1.5).

4.50 2,250.00

04/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions.

0.60 270.00

04/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting 2.40 1,080.00
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(1.0); communicate within the IMT 
regarding Comprehensive Assessment 
discussions with the parties (1.0); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD productions and 
accountability measures (0.4).

04/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Meet with parties regarding 
Comprehensive Assessment Part II.

1.30 585.00

04/17/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze CPD productions. 0.40 180.00

04/17/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise Independent Monitoring Report 9. 0.50 197.50

04/17/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.10 39.50

04/17/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Zoom conference with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency team.

0.80 316.00

04/18/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed revised materials related to Use 
of Force section.

0.50 197.50

04/18/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

04/18/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records from the City of 
Chicago and the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General related to the Use of 
Force and Accountability and 
Transparency sections

3.20 1,440.00

04/18/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with member of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
the tenth reporting period

1.60 720.00

04/18/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Officer Wellness and 
Support section

1.20 540.00

04/18/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.30 135.00

04/18/24 Brian J Hamilton IMT communications with Julie et al. 0.30 126.00

04/18/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Call with internal Supervision team 
regarding methodologies and IMR-10 

1.00 375.00
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deliverables.

04/18/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for meeting with CPD regarding 
recent productions by communicating with 
Officer Wellness team, reviewing case file, 
and drafting compliance assessments.

2.80 1,050.00

04/18/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise comments on D20-02. 0.30 112.50

04/18/24 Maggie Hickey IMR-10 monthly IMT/OAG meeting: 
Accountability (1); IMR9 discussion with L. 
Kunard and B. Bryson (1); follow-up 
regarding draft comments (.5).

2.50 1,250.00

04/18/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD productions and 
preparation for monthly OWS meeting.

2.30 1,035.00

04/18/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/CPD UOF meeting. 0.60 270.00

04/18/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions.

0.30 135.00

04/18/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze COPA analysis of 
draft coordinate multiple arrest policy 
suite.

0.20 90.00

04/18/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise IMT comments and no objection 
notice.

0.50 197.50

04/18/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review materials provided in advance of 
the monthly Accountability and 
Transparency meeting.

0.20 79.00

04/18/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend monthly Accountability and 
Transparency meeting with the CPD, the 
OAG, and the IMT.

0.70 276.50

04/18/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Observe monthly Police Board meeting. 1.60 632.00

04/19/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.20 79.00

04/19/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed City document 
productions.

0.10 39.50

04/19/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

04/19/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Data section meeting.

1.00 395.00

04/19/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Responses and Deadlines 
trackers with 4/18 productions and 

2.10 409.50
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productions that don't require responses 
following correspondence with various 
team members.

04/19/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Requests and Compliance 
trackers with productions from 4/11.

0.80 156.00

04/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Chicago Police Department regarding 
general updates

0.50 225.00

04/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.80 810.00

04/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

1.20 540.00

04/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Data Analysis, Collection, 
and Management section

1.00 450.00

04/19/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.60 270.00

04/19/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend conference with A. 
R. Sepulveda and M. DeCarlo in 
preparation for meeting with CPD 
regarding Annual Report to the 
Superintendent.

0.50 187.50

04/19/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend meeting with CPD regarding 
Annual Report to the Superintendent.

1.60 600.00

04/19/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Debrief internally regarding meeting with 
CPD regarding Annual Report to the 
Superintendent.

0.50 187.50

04/19/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Schedule internal meeting regarding 
Supervision methodologies.

0.20 75.00

04/19/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend IMT weekly community policing 
call.

0.50 197.50
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04/19/24 Kaila D. Clark Meeting with S. Smith to discuss over 

methodology process and anticipated 
changes for IMR-10.

0.50 197.50

04/19/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG weekly check-in (.5); review 
Coalition and City materials on Multiple 
Arrest Policies (1.2); and draft of materials 
for Judge Pallmeyer (1.8).

3.50 1,750.00

04/19/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT in 
preparation for monthly OWS meeting with 
the parties and debrief regarding same 
(0.4); weekly internal IMT ISR meeting 
(1.0); weekly internal IMT Data meeting 
(0.7).

2.10 945.00

04/19/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call (0.4); 
monthly OWS meeting with the parties 
(0.5).

0.90 405.00

04/19/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions, and review of same.

0.30 135.00

04/19/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.20 79.00

04/19/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Revise and submit IMT responses for 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.30 118.50

04/20/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Transmit D20-02 comments to CPD and 
upload to Shared Site.

0.20 75.00

04/20/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise IMR9 UOF section. 0.10 45.00

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed site visit notes related to Data 
section (.30); reviewed/analyzed technical 
assistance policy revisions related to Data 
section (.70).

1.00 395.00

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
related to Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections, upcoming comment 
deadlines, and methodologies.

0.80 316.00

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
meeting related to Data, Supervision, and 
Officer Wellness sections.

1.00 395.00

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed communications with City 0.10 39.50
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regarding IMT data request.

04/22/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed IMR-10 
methodologies related to Crisis 
Intervention section.

0.30 118.50

04/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

3.30 1,485.00

04/22/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.40 630.00

04/22/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with A. Becker re 
methodologies and recent productions for 
crisis intervention section

0.30 126.00

04/22/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review recent productions. 0.30 112.50

04/22/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend debrief of EISS site 
visit call with Data, Officer Wellness, and 
Supervision teams.

1.10 412.50

04/22/24 Maggie Hickey Bi-weekly IMT CET meeting (.8); review 
Multiple Arrest Policy materials (1.2); 
discussions regarding DNC (1.5).

3.50 1,750.00

04/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT internal meeting to debrief EISS site 
visit (1.0); communicate within the IMT 
regarding IMR9 and feedback on CPD 
productions (1.0).

2.00 900.00

04/22/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise UOF section of IMR9 
(1.0); draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions (1.4).

2.40 1,080.00

04/23/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections.

1.10 434.50

04/23/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

1.00 395.00

04/23/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Use of Force section meeting.

1.50 592.50

04/23/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50
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04/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 

Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Officer Wellness and 
Support section

0.80 360.00

04/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force section

1.50 675.00

04/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

2.60 1,170.00

04/23/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

1.00 450.00

04/23/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with B. Clements 
and L. Clancey re potential additional site 
visit and comments from J. Solomon on 
outstanding training production

0.40 168.00

04/23/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Review recent productions in preparation 
for weekly Officer Wellness meeting.

0.50 187.50

04/23/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Attend weekly Officer Wellness meeting 
regarding productions, future production 
requests, and future meetings with CPD.

1.00 375.00

04/23/24 Kaila D. Clark Hosting transitional meeting with A. 
Sepulveda, D. Ross, and V. Babu re: 
community and impartial policing sections.

1.00 395.00

04/23/24 Maggie Hickey Review of IMT materials for revised 
comprehensive assessment and IMR-9 
(3.1); and discussion with A Sepulveda 
regarding same (.9).

4.00 2,000.00

04/23/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
IMR9 (0.5); weekly internal IMT UOF 
meeting (1.0).

1.50 675.00

04/23/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise UOF section of IMR9. 0.50 225.00

04/23/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze City's response to 
Coalition's Notice regarding coordinated 

0.80 360.00
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multiple arrest policy suite and training.

04/23/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.60 237.00

04/23/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review and analyze IMR10 methodologies 
for the Accountability and Transparency 
section.

1.00 395.00

04/24/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections, City and CPD 
productions, updates to methodologies, 
and draft IMT comments.

1.10 434.50

04/24/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

3.40 1,343.00

04/24/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
attorneys meeting regarding updates, IMR 
9 filing, and methodologies.

1.30 513.50

04/24/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/drafted IMT comments on CPD 
policy related to Data and Use of Force 
sections.

0.60 237.00

04/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting period

2.80 1,260.00

04/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Officer Wellness and 
Support section

1.50 675.00

04/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Use of Force and 
Accountability and Transparency sections

1.30 585.00

04/24/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.50 225.00

04/24/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend internal AFS meeting re case 1.40 588.00
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updates, methodologies, IMR9, and recent 
productions

04/24/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with A. Becker re 
crisis intervention methodologies

0.20 84.00

04/24/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from A. Guevara re CIT 
draft slide deck and agenda

0.10 42.00

04/24/24 Brian J Hamilton Review draft CIT deck and agenda in 
preparation of next week's meeting with 
City

0.30 126.00

04/24/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend biweekly ArentFox 
Schiff meeting regarding billing, IMR-9 
drafts, and methodologies.

1.40 525.00

04/24/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend meeting with CPD 
regarding the Annual Report to the 
Superintendent.

1.80 675.00

04/24/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Debrief internally regarding call with CPD 
regarding the Annual Report to the 
Superintendent.

1.10 412.50

04/24/24 Kaila D. Clark Update and circulate impartial policing 
internal production tracker to AM 
Rodriguez and S. Smith.

1.00 395.00

04/24/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend biweekly IMT attorneys meeting. 1.10 434.50

04/24/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend weekly impartial policing call. 0.50 197.50

04/24/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend monthly impartial policing call with 
the City, the CPD, the OAG, and the IMT.

1.00 395.00

04/24/24 Kaila D. Clark Observe District 11 meeting with DCOs 
and CAPS officers.

1.00 395.00

04/24/24 Maggie Hickey Chicago IMT leadership team meeting (1); 
monthly IMT/OAG: Impartial (.5); prepare 
for, attend, and present at District Council 
Meeting for the 9th District (3).

4.50 2,250.00

04/24/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT leadership meeting 
(0.9); bi-monthly internal IMT AFS meeting 
(1.0); weekly internal IMT ISR meeting 
(1.0); communicate within the IMT 
regarding OWS meeting with parties (0.8).

3.70 1,665.00

04/24/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo OWS meeting with parties. 0.70 315.00

04/24/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's AFS team 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

1.30 513.50
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04/24/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review, analyze, and revise IMR10 

methodologies for the Accountability and 
Transparency section.

1.00 395.00

04/24/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Attend meeting with the IMT's 
Accountability and Transparency section 
regarding productions, methodologies, and 
reports.

1.40 553.00

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data, Crisis Intervention, and 
Use of Force sections (.30); draft IMT 
comments (.10); technical assistance 
(.20); City and CPD document productions 
(.10); methodologies (.20); and 
outstanding site visit meetings (.10).

1.00 395.00

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT comments on CPD 
production related to Data and Use of 
Force sections.

0.20 79.00

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed materials related to Crisis 
Intervention, Data, and Use of Force 
sections (1.20); reviewed Use of Force site 
visit meeting notes (.20); reviewed 
technical assistance comments (.10).

1.50 592.50

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended meeting with 
IMT attorney regarding methodologies 
related to Crisis Intervention section.

0.30 118.50

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

0.80 316.00

04/25/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended portion of 
internal IMT Crisis Intervention section 
meeting.

0.70 276.50

04/25/24 Alexandra M. Romero Attend labor updates meeting. 0.50 247.50

04/25/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting periods

2.70 1,215.00

04/25/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

3.20 1,440.00

04/25/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 

0.30 135.00
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requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Crisis Intervention section

04/25/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing materials provided to the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the City 
of Chicago by the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General

0.80 360.00

04/25/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend weekly crisis intervention meeting 
to discuss methodologies, forthcoming and 
recent productions, and IMR9

1.40 588.00

04/25/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend monthly 
Supervision meeting with CPD regarding 
status of IMR-10 deliverables and other 
outstanding requests.

0.80 300.00

04/25/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Prepare for and attend weekly internal 
Supervision meeting regarding status of 
production requests.

0.30 112.50

04/25/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG monthly ISR meeting (1); 
Supervision IMT/OAG monthly call (1); CD 
labor issues update (.5); review of draft 
IMT comments (1.1).

3.60 1,800.00

04/25/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
CPD productions and feedback about 
same.

0.90 405.00

04/25/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly ISR meeting with parties (0.8); 
meet with parties regarding CPD foot 
pursuit audit (0.3).

1.10 495.00

04/25/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze CPD productions. 0.10 45.00

04/25/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review, analyze, and revise IMR10 
methodologies for the Accountability and 
Transparency section.

3.20 1,264.00

04/25/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Email correspondence with IMT members 
regarding IMR10 methodologies for the 
Accountability and Transparency section.

0.20 79.00

04/25/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Analyze training and recruitment 
productions.

1.00 395.00

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Preparation for meetings with City, CPD, 
IMT, and OAG.

0.10 39.50

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed notes from meeting related to 
Use of Force and Data sections.

0.10 39.50
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04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 

regarding Data, Supervision, Officer 
Wellness, and Crisis Intervention sections 
(.90); draft IMT comments and technical 
assistance (.30); and methodologies (.20).

1.40 553.00

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention and Data sections.

3.20 1,264.00

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed and drafted/revised 
IMT technical assistance comments 
related to Data section.

2.00 790.00

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal Teams 
meeting with Data section to discuss 
updates to methodologies.

1.00 395.00

04/26/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Data section meeting.

1.20 474.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing materials provided to the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the City 
of Chicago by the Office of the Illinois 
Attorney General

0.60 270.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.60 270.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team regarding compliance 
efforts in the tenth reporting period

1.60 720.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting periods

0.70 315.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team, the City of Chicago, and 
the Office of the Illinois Attorney General 
regarding documents, requests, and 
productions

0.60 270.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Data Analysis, Collection, 
and Management section

0.80 360.00
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04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 

Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 
responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Recruitment, Hiring, and 
Promotions and Training sections

1.40 630.00

04/26/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Call with members of the Independent 
Monitoring Team and the Office of the 
Illinois Attorney General regarding general 
updates

0.30 135.00

04/26/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with H. Melendez 
and L. Clancey re possible additional site 
visit to discuss CARE team

0.20 84.00

04/26/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications with S. Oyalabu 
re 2024 Annual In-Service Supervisor 
Training no objection notice

0.20 84.00

04/26/24 Brian J Hamilton Multiple communications from S. Oyalabu 
and M. DeCarlo re draft no objection 
notice to 2024 Annual In-Service Training

0.10 42.00

04/26/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Revise methodologies relating to the 
Supervision paragraphs.

1.80 675.00

04/26/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Meet with A. Durham and M. Jenkins 
regarding potential revisions of 
Supervision methodologies.

1.50 562.50

04/26/24 Kaila D. Clark Attend weekly community policing call with 
AM Rickman and T. Felix.

0.50 197.50

04/26/24 Maggie Hickey IMT/OAG weekly check-in (.5); monthly 
Chicago IMT Associate Monitor meeting 
(1.5); follow-up calls with A. Sepulveda 
regarding upcoming status hearing and 
listening sessions and materials for Judge 
Pallmeyer (1.6).

3.60 1,800.00

04/26/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Monthly Associate Monitor meeting (0.8); 
weekly internal IMT Data meeting (0.5); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
feedback on CPD productions and 
preparation for June public hearing (1.6).

2.90 1,305.00

04/26/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly IMT/OAG check-in call (0.3); meet 
with Associate Monitors and CPD 
regarding CPD Audit Division (0.5)

0.80 360.00

04/26/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise feedback on CPD 
productions.

0.20 90.00
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04/26/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review, analyze, and revise IMR10 

methodologies for the Accountability and 
Transparency section.

1.00 395.00

04/26/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and revise no objection notice for 
training production.

1.70 671.50

04/28/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

1.00 395.00

04/28/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.30 135.00

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections (.20); draft IMT technical 
assistance comments (.20); IMR9 Report 
(.30); document productions (.20); and 
methodologies (.20).

1.10 434.50

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/updated methodologies related 
to Crisis Intervention section.

3.90 1,540.50

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed document productions 
related to Data section.

0.30 118.50

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted/revised IMT technical assistance 
comments related to Data, Supervision, 
and Officer Wellness section (.30); 
prepared comments for submission to City 
and CPD (.10).

0.40 158.00

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Drafted communication and submitted IMT 
technical assistance comments to City and 
CPD.

0.20 79.00

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Managed IMT files related to technical 
assistance comments and Data section.

0.20 79.00

04/29/24 Alex J. Becker Reviewed/analyzed draft communications 
to City and materials related to IMR 9 
Report and Crisis Intervention section.

0.20 79.00

04/29/24 Ana Reyes Sanchez Update Requests, and Compliance 
trackers with productions from 4/25/24.

1.00 195.00

04/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 

3.60 1,620.00
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and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

04/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
compliance efforts in the ninth and tenth 
reporting periods

0.50 225.00

04/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

2.40 1,080.00

04/29/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.80 360.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication from S. Oyalabu re no 
objection notices for DHR Training SOP 
and S11-10 policy

0.10 42.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Review crisis intervention productions 
from City and route to J. Solomon

0.40 168.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with L. Clancey re 
tomorrow's check-in meeting

0.10 42.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Communication to crisis intervention 
section re tomorrow's check-in meeting 
and circulate revised invite for tomorrow's 
crisis intervention weekly check in meeting

0.10 42.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications with A. Becker re revised 
methodologies for crisis intervention 
section, review attachments in preparation 
of circulating to crisis intervention section

0.50 210.00

04/29/24 Brian J Hamilton Communications from J. Solomon re hiring 
update for CDPH

0.40 168.00

04/29/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Discuss IMR-9 compliance determinations 
internally.

0.50 187.50

04/29/24 Maggie Hickey Call with R. Monroe regarding DNC 
preparations (.50); review Search Warrant 
materials and communications with Judge 
Pallmeyer (2.25); and review of updated 
draft of IMR-9 and communications with 
IMT regarding same (2.25).

5.00 2,500.00

04/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Communicate within the IMT regarding 
court resolution of search warrant issues, 
IMR9, and feedback on CPD productions.

0.80 360.00

04/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and revise draft resolution for 
search warrant issues (0.1); draft and 

1.10 495.00
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revise ISR section of IMR9 (1.0).

04/29/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Review and analyze CPD productions and 
letter from Coalition regarding coordinated 
multiple arrest training.

0.70 315.00

04/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review, analyze, and revise IMR10 
methodologies for the Accountability and 
Transparency section.

1.50 592.50

04/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding 
IMR10 methodologies for the 
Accountability and Transparency section.

0.20 79.00

04/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Review new and outstanding 
Accountability and Transparency 
productions.

0.30 118.50

04/29/24 Sarah M. Oligmueller Emails with IMT members regarding IMR9 
compliance levels for certain 
Accountability and Transparency 
paragraphs.

0.30 118.50

04/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Attend internal section meeting for 
recruitment and training.

0.40 158.00

04/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Revise the recruitment section for IMR9 
report.

0.90 355.50

04/29/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft no objection notices to recruitment 
and training productions.

0.90 355.50

04/30/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Use of Force section meeting.

1.00 395.00

04/30/24 Alex J. Becker Prepared for and attended internal IMT 
Crisis Intervention section meeting.

0.60 237.00

04/30/24 Alex J. Becker Communications with IMT members 
regarding Data and Crisis Intervention 
sections (.10); IMR-9 Report (.10); and 
document requests (.10).

0.30 118.50

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Meeting with the Court and members of 
the Independent Monitoring Team 
regarding the Consent Decree

0.80 360.00

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's responses to records and 
information from the City of Chicago

0.20 90.00

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Communications with members of the 
Independent Monitoring Team regarding 
requests for, productions of, and 

2.00 900.00
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responses to records from the City of 
Chicago for the Officer Wellness and 
Support section

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Preparing for meetings with the 
Independent Monitoring Team and the 
parties to the Consent Decree (the City of 
Chicago, the Chicago Police Department, 
and the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

0.60 270.00

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing the Independent Monitoring 
Team's monitoring report for the ninth 
reporting period

3.30 1,485.00

04/30/24 Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Reviewing records provided to the 
Independent Monitoring Team by the City 
of Chicago

1.40 630.00

04/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend crisis intervention section weekly 
meeting to discuss IMR9 revisions, 
methodologies, and recent productions

0.80 336.00

04/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Review revised methodologies for crisis 
intervention in preparation of routing to 
leadership

0.70 294.00

04/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Attend monthly meeting with the City, 
CPD, and OEMC to discuss updates re 
staffing, the CIT report, data, CIT 
applications, the OEMC, and the CCMHE

0.80 336.00

04/30/24 Brian J Hamilton Prepare draft correspondence to City and 
OEMC re IMR9 assessments for crisis 
intervention section, route to A. Sepulveda 
and leadership for review

1.60 672.00

04/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Conference call with Officer Wellness 
team and A. Durkin regarding compliance 
discussions.

0.50 187.50

04/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Conference call with internal Officer 
Wellness team in preparation for call with 
CPD and OPSA.

0.50 187.50

04/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Conference call among Officer Wellness 
team, OPSA, and CPD regarding fitness 
for duty determinations.

0.50 187.50

04/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley 
Laurich

Debrief with Officer Wellness team 
regarding call with CPD and OPSA 
regarding fitness for duty determinations.

0.50 187.50

04/30/24 Gwendolyn H. Lemley Review and analyze draft production 0.70 262.50
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Laurich requests.

04/30/24 Kaila D. Clark Draft and circulate appendix write-up for p. 
32 after consultation with AM Rickman.

1.00 395.00

04/30/24 Maggie Hickey CIT monthly meeting (.7); Officer Wellness 
meeting (.5); meeting with Judge 
Pallmeyer, A. Sepulveda, and M. DeCarlo 
(1.5); review Search Warrant issues (1.5); 
and review of draft IMR-9 (1.2).

5.40 2,700.00

04/30/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Weekly internal IMT UOF meeting (0.5); 
communicate within the IMT regarding 
IMR9 and DNC preparation (0.8).

1.30 585.00

04/30/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Draft and revise comments on CPD 
productions.

1.30 585.00

04/30/24 Meredith R.W. DeCarlo IMT/Court meeting regarding draft 
resolution of search warrant issues.

0.70 315.00

04/30/24 Stella T. Oyalabu Draft and finalize no objection notices for 
recruitment and training productions.

0.40 158.00

Fee Total 505.30 $215,799.00

Timekeeper Summary:

Hours Rate Value
Alexandra M. Romero Partner 0.50 495.00 247.50

Maggie Hickey Partner 93.20 500.00 46,600.00

Alex J. Becker Associate 77.50 395.00 30,612.50

Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Associate 97.00 450.00 43,650.00

Brian J Hamilton Associate 33.00 420.00 13,860.00

Gwendolyn H. Lemley Laurich Associate 43.30 375.00 16,237.50

Kaila D. Clark Associate 13.40 395.00 5,293.00

Kylie S Wood Associate 0.40 395.00 158.00

Meredith R.W. DeCarlo Associate 82.20 450.00 36,990.00

Sarah M. Oligmueller Associate 25.10 395.00 9,914.50

Stella T. Oyalabu Associate 23.80 395.00 9,401.00

Kacy Rayburn Specialist 5.90 150.00 885.00

Ana Reyes Sanchez Project Assistant 10.00 195.00 1,950.00
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Hours Rate Value
Timekeeper Summary Total 505.30 215,799.00

Current Fees $215,799.00

For Disbursements:
Professional Service Fees

04/30/24 Security Global Collaborators, LLC - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (13.75 
hours)

2,268.75

04/30/24 Paul F. Evans, Jr. - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (72 hours) and site visit 
travel  expenses

13,301.75

04/30/24 Medlock Enterprises - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (1.5 hours) 247.50

04/30/24 Michael Anthony Dirden - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (40.75 hours) 6,112.50

04/30/24 Julie Solomon - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (28.50 hours) 4,702.50

04/30/24 The CNA Corporation - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees and expenses 145,293.96

04/30/24 MS Harrison Consulting LLC - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (2.45 hours) 404.25

04/30/24 Stephen E. Rickman - Professional Service Fees April fees (32 hours) and travel 
expenses

6,661.95

04/30/24 Tipping Point Solutions, LLC - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (33.25 hours) 5,486.25

04/30/24 Denise Rodriguez - CPD - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (36.75 hours) and 
travel  expenses

8,115.17

04/30/24 Theron L. Bowman - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (114.75 hours) and 
travel  expenses

30,603.63

04/30/24 Alfred Durham - Professional Service Fees April 2024 fees (38.50 hours) 6,352.50

Professional Service Fees 229,550.71

eDiscovery Support Services (LSH)
04/30/24 ArentFox Schiff LLP eDiscovery services 1,535.00

eDiscovery Support Services (LSH) 1,535.00

Disbursement Total 231,085.71
Current Disbursements $231,085.71

Total Amount Due This Invoice $446,884.71





Signature:

Date:

Invoice Date

Billing Period From:
30-Apr-24

1-Apr-24

Invoice Number
4

Billing Period To:
30-Apr-24

Labor (Description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

3-Apr-24 Weekly IMT ISR team meeting 1.00
Paragraph 835 - Needs Assessment feedback session 1.00

Date of Service Description Hours

10-Apr-24 Weekly IMT ISR team meeting 1.00

4-Apr-24 Cross team meeting - Supervision 0.50

15-Apr-24 IMT Associate Monitors meeting 1.00

16-Apr-24

12-Apr-24 Traffic Stop review & Cross team meeting - Supervision 1.50

IMT ISR/UOF Cross teams meeting 1.00
IMT ISR/Impartial Policing Cross teams meeting 0.75

18-Apr-24 Cross team meeting - Supervision 1.00

25-Apr-24

24-Apr-24

IMT/OAG monthly meeting 1.00
Weekly TRED update call 0.50

Weekly TRED update call

Travel/ODCs (Itemize and provide receipts)
Travel Date (From) Travel Date (To) Description Total

Total Hours 165 13.75
Total Labor  $                       2,268.75 

Certification:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, and the 
expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract. I am aware that 
any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, 
false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730.)

30-Apr-24

Vendor Name:  Security Global Collaborators, LLC
Remit to Address:  
City:       State:       Zip:  
Contact Name:  Kerr Putney

Bill to:  ArentFox Schiff; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100, Chicago, IL 60606; maggie.hickey@afslaw.com

Site visit billable hours
Total Travel 0

Weekly IMT ISR team meeting 1.00
Phone call w/ Allan Slagle 0.50

0.50

19-Apr-24 Weekly IMT ISR team meeting 1.00

30-Apr-24 IMR-9 draft review 0.50





2

4/30/24
Monthly CIT Mee ng with CPD/OAG +prep+ biweekly mee ng with
Execu ve Designee + Internal CI Team Mee ng + internal email 3.5 $ 577.50

$

Julie Solomon, LSCSW, MBA
Law Enforcement Consultant
Crisis Intervention, Response to Persons in Mental and Behavioral Health Crisis, Officer Wellness
Clinical Therapist|Coach





Vendor Name: Stephen Rickman 
Remit to Address:  
Contact Name: Stephen Rickman 
Phone:  
Email:  
Invoice Date : 01/05/24 
Invoice Number: 056 
Billing Period: 04/01/24 to 04/30/2024 
 
Bill to: ArentFoxSchiff; Wacker Drive, Suite 7100;Chicago, IL. 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com 
 
 
 
 
                                                            Chicago Consent Decree     
 
Date of service.                                  Description of work.                                                                      Hours  
                                                                                                                                             .                                                                 
04/01/24                   Call with sponsor tr # 46 and 48 seeking clarification, scheduling meeting – 1.0                  
                                              
04/03/24                   Review of community engagement materials and relevance to CP paragraphs – 2.0 
 
04/5/24                      Team CP meeting re site visit updates and follow – ups – 1.0 
                                     Review of CP productions re CP – 1.5 
 
04/8/24                      Review of site visit updates including District 11 meetings - .5 
                                     Preparation for site visit OCP/ leadership mtg 
                                     and District 11 meetings –-   2.5                                                                                                                            
                                        
04/9/24                      Meeting with Executive Members OCPR/OCP - 2.0 
                                     Observe TOC meeting – 1.5 
                                     Preparation for community engagement discussion- 1.0 
                                     Community Engagement Plan meeting TA discussion -2.0 
 
04/10/24                    Preparation and meeting with District 12 leadership – 2.0 
                                     Observed mayor’s cabinet meeting – 1.5 
                                                  
04/17/24                    Call with Commander re -rescheduling - .5 
 
04/18/24                    Submission of Proposed re-rescheduling of site meetings – 1.0 
 
04/19/22                    CP weekly team meeting and follow up – 1.0 
 
04/22/24                   Participation on monthly CET meeting - .5 
                                    Follow up on proposed scheduling of DAC and CAP meetings - .5 
 
04/24/24                   Preparation and participation in District 11 meeting with CAPs and DCOs – 2.0 
 



                        
 
04/25/24                   Coordination and scheduling bi-weekly meeting with sponsor and chief of staff - .5 
                                       
04/26/24                    Participation in monthly monitoring meeting – 1.5 
                                     Participation in CP team meeting - .5   
                                     Final review of supervisory training - .5    
 
 04/27/24                   Development of draft comments for upcoming CD court hearing – 2.5                                      
                                      
04/29/24                     Final review and changes for IMR compliance assessments - .5 
 
04/30/24                     Preparation and interview of area commander re site visit re-schedule – 2.0                                 
                                                                                                                                             
                                                                  
                                    ,                                                                                                                       
Labor Total hours:  32 
Rate: $ 165.00 
Total labor:   $ 5280.00 
 
Non- labor (site visit) 
Hotel – (3 nights) $792.48 
Airfare: Las Vegas to Chicago (roundtrip)$ 461.25 This amount should be $461.95 
Ground transportation: $88.68    This amount should be $85.58 
4/8/24 – home to airport – 55.68 (should be $55.58) 
                Airport to hotel – $30.00 
Meals: $46.94       Corrected amount is $41.94 
4/8/24. Dinner – $27.94 
4/9/24 breakfast – $19.00 (Breakfast is capped at $14) 
 
Non- labor total :  $1389.55    Non-labor total = $1,381.95 
 
Amount Due:  5280.00 + 1389.55 = $ 6669.55  Amount due = $6,661.95 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                         
  
Certification:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is 
true, complete, and accurate, and the expenditures, disbursements, and cash receipts are for the 
purposes set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract.  I am aware that any false, fictitious, or 





























05:50 PM 08:50 PM
Chicago, IL, US (ORD) Houston, TX, US (IAH)

Flight 4 of 4 UA5623 Class: United Economy (K)

Wed, Apr 10, 2024 Wed, Apr 10, 2024

09:40 PM 11:07 PM
Houston, TX, US (IAH) McAllen, TX, US (MFE)

Flight Operated by SKYWEST DBA UNITED EXPRESS.

Traveler Details

RODRIGUEZ/DENISE
eTicket number: Seats: MFE-IAH 05A
Frequent Flyer: UA-  Premier Gold IAH-ORD 11F

ORD-IAH 11A
IAH-MFE 08D

 

Purchase Summary

Method of payment: American Express ending in

Date of purchase: Wed, Mar 20, 2024

Airfare: 753.89
U.S. Transportation Tax: 56.54
U.S. Flight Segment Tax: 20.00
Passenger Civil Aviation Security Service Fee: 11.20
U.S. Passenger Facility Charge: 18.00

Total Per Passenger: 859.63 USD

Total: 859.63 USD

 

Fare Rules

Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed.

NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT

Cancel reservations before the scheduled departure time or TICKET HAS NO VALUE.

MileagePlus Accrual Details

Denise Rodriguez

Date Flight From/To Award Miles PQP PQF

Sun, Apr 07, 2024 4284 McAllen, TX, US (MFE) to 1304 163 1





































































Vendor Name:  Durham Security Consulting Services         Invoice Date          Invoice Number   
Remit to Address:            5/1/2024           2024-004
City:    State:     Zip:     Billing Period From:       Billing Period To:
Contact Name: Alfred Durham         4/1/2024           4/30/2024
Phone:    Email:  Remittance Type Requested:      Check              EFT

Bill To:   Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100; Chicago, IL 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com

LABOR (The description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

0.75
Add Del

0.25 Add Del

0.25
Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

0.5 Add Del

1 Add Del

1 Add Del

1 Add Del

0.75 Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

0.75 Add Del

Add

Add Del

Add

Add

Add

Add

Add

Add

Add

0.75 Add Del

1 Add Del

Add

Add Del

Add

Add

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

Add Del

0.5 Add Del

2 Add Del

Add Del

0.5
Call with AD Lekesha Royal Regarding PES

0.5

4/5/2024

4/12/2024
4/15/2024

4/11/2024

4/10/2024

4/18/2024

4/11/2024

IMT Briefing Call with Executive Sponsor D/C Daniel O'Connor

4/5/2024 Conference Call with OWS Section to Discuss CPD's Early Intervention and Support 
Systems Comments

Reviewed and Commented on CPD (D20-02) Unity of Command and Span of Control 
Schedule Pilot Program Policy

4/16/2024

Reviewed and Commented CPD's Updated Early Intervention & Support System Policy- 
Department Notice D20-04 and Response to IMT Comments

0.75

4/23/2024 4/23/2024
4/23/2024

0.75

4/12/2024 Call with Chief Kerr Putney Regarding ISR/Supervision Cross Section 

Del

Weekly Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables
14/18/2024

Del

Del

4/22/2024 4/22/2024
IMT Briefing Call with Executive Sponsor D/C Daniel O'Connor

0.75

Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision 1

4/19/2024 4/19/2024 Call with District 006 Executive Officer Captain John Dean Regarding Unity of Command 
& Span of Control 

0.75

4/22/2024 4/22/2024 1

4/18/2024

Del
4/16/2024 IMT ISR/UoF Monthly Crossover Meeting

4/16/2024

0.75
4/15/2024 Associate Monitor Bi-Weekly Meeting with Chief Rodney Monroe 1

Del
Call with AD Lekesha Royal Regarding PES

Del

Del

Del

1

0.5

1.25

Reveiwed Emails from Anthony Sepulveda, Jennifer Nilles, Ana Sanchez and Hanna 
Grosch-Jurowicz

4/10/2024 Conference Call with CPD Lieutenants Janel Sedevic and Seung Cho Regarding Pilot 
Districts Staffing and Details

                                                            INVOICE

Date of
Service(From)

Date of
Service(To

)

Description Hours
(use .25 hr 
increments)

4/9/2024

4/4/2020 4/4/2024

0.754/10/2024 4/10/2024

4/4/2024 4/4/2024 Supervision IMT/OAG Monthly Call

4/9/2024

4/4/2024

4/2/2024

4/4/2024 Reviewed CPD's Early Intervention and Support System Comments and Directive D20-04  
in Preparation for Technical Assistance Call 

Add/Delete

Del

4/9/2024

4/2/2024 4/2/2024 Reviewed CPD's Revised Version of the Work Force Analysis Study Statement of Work
4/2/2024 4/2/2024 Call with Lt. Janel Sedevic Regarding Pilot District Staffing and Details

1 Del
4/10/2024 4/10/2024

4/3/2024 4/3/2024 Weekly Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables

4/9/2024 Conference Call with EISS/OSS TA 2

1

4/2/2024

Del

Call with Attorney Gwen Laurich Regarding Work Force Analysis Study Statement of 
Work

0.5

0.25
4/22/2024 4/22/2024 Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision Section Activities 0.5

1

4/22/2024 4/22/2024

0.5

4/18/2024 4/18/2024

4/17/2024 4/17/2024

4/3/2024 4/3/2024 Monthly Sync-Up for CPD Pilot Programs (OSS, PES, UoC/SoC)

Call with Dr. Theron Bowman Regading Training and Supervision IMR-10 Deliverables

Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision

Reviewed Revised 2024 Supervisors In-Service Training from Taft Law4/5/2024
4/8/2024

Conference Call- EISS Site Visit Debrief

Call with Associate Cassandra Brown, Attroney Gwen Laurich and Sgt. Greenwood  to 
Discuss Future Call with CPD Communications Director 

4/4/2024 4/4/2024 Call with Chief Rodney Monroe Regarding Supervision Section

Call with CPD Lt. Patrick O'Donnell Regarding Evidence.com Set-Up and Tutorial

4/16/2024

4/15/2024

4/18/2024
Call with Chief Kerr Putney Regarding ISR/Supervision Cross Section 

Call with District 007 Executive Officer Captain Darwin Butler Regarding Unity of 
Command & Span of Control
Call with DC Daniel O'Connor- Upcoming Supervision Meeting Agenda Discussion 

IMT/OAG Monthly Supervision Check-In

4/15/2024

Reviewed Emails from Attorney Gwen Laurich, Analyst Monique Jenkins, James Burger, 
Lt. Janel Sedevic, Maggie Hickey and Alfonso Mybokwere

4/18/2024

4/8/2024
4/5/204

4/18/2024

4/5/2024 4/5/2024

Conference Call for Unity of Command and Span of Control Tableau Dashboard 
Walkthrough

4/24/2024 4/24/2024
Reviewed Emails from Attorney Gwen Laurich, Lt. Patrick O'Donnell, Morgan Denlow, AD 
Lakesha Royal, Thomas Christoff, Anthony Sepulveda and Meridith DeCarlo

4/23/2024 4/23/2024

4/23/2024



0.5 Add Del

1 Add Del

1 Add

0.75 Add

Add Del

0.25 Add

Add Del

1.5 Add Del

0.5

Add

0.25 Add Del

Rate $165
6,352.50

       Check here if you are not billing for any travel

Purpose of Travel: Chicago Site Visit 

Travel/ODC'S - (Itemize and provide reciepts as specified on your contract)

Travel 
Date(From)

QTY Rate Total

Add I  
DeleteAdd I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete
Add I  
Delete

             Subtotal Travel/ODC's

Date of 
Expense

Add I 
D l

5/1/2024
           Signature Date

4/26/2024 4/26/2024 Conference Call With Supervison Section Regarding Methodoligies Review

Del

Del

4/24/2024 Reviewed Supervision Paragraphs and Methodologies for Proposed Updates for ¶¶369-
376

Del

4/25/2024 Supervision IMT/OAG Monthly Call

4/26/2024
Reviewed Emails from Analyst Monique Jenkins, OAG Hannah Jurowicz, Julie Solomon, 
Cassandra-Deck Brown, Anthony Sepulveda Alex Becker and Stella Oyalabu

4/30/2024 Reviewed Emails from Bridgette Celments, Alex Becker and Anthony Sepulveda

4/26/2024

4/30/2024

Description

38.5

Travel         
Date(To)

4/23/2024

                                                                                                       INVOICE TOTAL DUE:

$0

4/24/2024 Call with District 007 Executive Officer Captain Darwin Butler Regarding Unity of 
Command & Span of Control

4/24/2024 4/24/2024 Weekly Call with Analyst Monique Jenkins Regarding IMR-10 Deliverables

0.75

4/24/2024

                                                                                                                                   TOTAL LABOR:
                                                                                                                                         Total Hours

Del

4/26/2024 4/26/2024 Monthly Chicago IMT Associate Monitor Meeting 1.5

4/24/2024

Expense  Type

Reset Form Save Form

Add/ 
Delete      

Privately Owned Vehicle Mileage Reimbursement

Description: (Include starting location and ending location) Miles Rate Total Add/           
Delete

Invoice Comments/Notes:

                                                                                                                            TOTAL TRAVEL:
       Subtotal Mileage 

CERTIFICATION:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, and the 
expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract. I am aware that any 
false, ficticious, or fraudulent information, or the ommission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false 
statements, flase claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730.) 

$6,352.50

4/23/2024 Conference Call for Unity of Command and Span of Control Tableau Dashboard 
Walkthrough Follow-up

4/25/2024 4/25/2024 Chicago IMT Internal Meeting- Supervision
4/25/2024

X





























































Chicago Independent Monitoring Team Invoice

Vendor Name: PaulF Evans 

Remit to Address:  

City:          

State:  

Zip:  

Contact Name: Paul F Evans 

Phone:  

Email:  

Remittance Type Requested: EFT  Check 

Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100; Chicago, IL 60606;MHickey@schiffhardin.com
Labor (the description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it is necessary) 
Date of Service (From) Date of Service (To)  Description  Hours 
4/1/2024 4/1/2024 Review materials for site 

visit interviews
.75

4/2/2024 4/2/2024 Prepare agenda for UOF 
weekly,UOF weekly Ms
DeCarlo, Melendez,Kunard 
and Mr Becker, view COPA 
officer involved shooting

2 hours

4/3/2024 4/3/2024 Review proposed audit on 
foot pursuits and Force 
review Board policy, review 
article on problem officers 
and review paragraphs 
245,247,248, draft email on 
training paragraphs and 
conversation weith Ms 
DeCarlo, review and provide 
comments on CPD workforce 
allocation process

2 hours 50

4/4/2024 4/4/2024 Perform research on CPD 
Shield policy, review POPS 
production on Shields, 
preparation and meeting 
with Associate Monitor
Bowman on training 
paragraph’s compliance 
levels

2 hours 50

4/5/2024 4/5/2024 Review training paragraphs 
288&289 and UOF training 
paragraphs, discussion with 
OAG on compliance levels in 
particular 245,247,248, 
Deputy and Associate 
Monitor Monroe and 
Bowman, follow up 
assessment call with Ms 
Kunard, Melendez and 
DeCarlo

1 hour 50

4/7/2024 4/7/2024 Review paragraphs in 
preparation for interviews 
with Officers and 
Lieutenants

2 hours

Invoice Date Invoice Number  
5/6/2024 Chicago#62
Billing Period From: Billing Period To:  
4/1/2024 4/30/2024

 



4/8/2024 4/8/2024 Site visit preparation for 
today’s events-Interviews 
with officers District3- 
interview with Lieutenants 
District 3- Interviews with 
Lieutenants District1, 
Interviews officers, District 
1, de-brief following 
668 meeting CPD 
headquarters, Force Review 
Board Discussion 
Superintendent Snelling and 
attend community meeting 
with Superintendent 
Snelling, speaker at CPD 
headquarters

11 hours

4/9/2024 4/9/2024 Site visit- observe ABLE and 
Taser training, observe DNC 
training, attend Training and 
Oversight Committee 
meeting, , Body Worn 
Camera meeting, meet with 
Ms Melendez and Deputy 
Monroe to provide responses
to issues on IMR9 at Deputy 
Monroe’s request( 7 
paragraphs in question)

11 hours 25

4/10/2024 4/10/2024 Site visit- Firearm Pointing 
meeting,TRED background 
meeting, attend Compstat, 
meet with Captains and 
Commanders, discuss 
specific paragraph issues 
with Clark-Henson and 
Commander Joyce, review 
issues raised during visit and 
create to do list

6 hours

4/11/2024 4/11/2024 Review historic data on CPD 
dashboard on UOF TRRs ,
review media coverage of 
officer involved shooting as 
it relates to UOF section, 
review incident 2024 -01521

1 hour 75

4/12/2024 4/12/2024 Review and have 
conversation with 
Commander Joyce on UOF 
paragraphs that are 
impacted by upcoming DNC

1 hour 25

4/13/2024 4/13/2024 Review IN-Car video policy, 
revieq consent degree 
paragraphs impacted by 
protests

1 hour

4/14/2024 4/14/2024 Review Policy on In-Car 
Video and compare with 
BWC policy in particular as it 
relates to OIS

1 hour 50

4/15/2024 4/15/2024 Meeting Monthly of 
Associate Monitors

1 hour 25

4/16/2024 4/16/2024 Review In Service 
Supervisory training, 
preparation and weekly UOF 
meeting with MR 
Sepuleveda, Becker, Ms 
Bryson, Melendez, DeCarlo,

3 hours 75



meeting with ISR and 
Supervisor Monitors on 
crossover issues

4/17/2024 4/17/2024 Follow continuing media
coverage of OIS as it relates 
to UOF section, Ms Kirsten, 
ESPN and former Supt 
McCarthy, review videos of 
training for DNC in service, 
respond toemails,dealwith 
issue of BWC at protest

2 hours 75

4/18/2024 4/18/2024 preparation and Discussion 
with CPD Commander Joyce, 
Captain Alderon and Clark 
Henson regarding protest 
and UOF compliance and 
follow up call with IMT 
personnel, phone call with 
Deputy Monroe regarding 
protests

2 hours

4/19/2024 4/19/2024 Review letter fro COPA on 
protests, review productions 
on shields and provide initial 
response

1 hour 75

4/21/2024 4/21/2024 Read COPA 2024 1st Quarter 
report, review TRR reports 
and accompanying videos, 
review emails

1hour 75

4/22/2024 4/22/2024 Phone call with Deputy 
Monroe and resulting 
compilation of list of 
paragraphs/issues that the 
IMT may wish to monitor 
during the upcoming DNC, 
phoce discussion with Ms 
DeCarlo on PP245,247,248 
and further review of 
Shields policy, review briefs 
of Coalition and City on 
CMA/DNC policies

2 hours 75

4/23/2024 4/23/2024 Prep agenda and weekly call 
with Commander Joyce, 
weekly UOF call with Mr
Sepuleveda, Becker, Ms 
Melendez and DeCarlo

2 hour 50

4/24/2024 4/24/2024 Check emails, review foot 
pursuit audit proposal

.50

4/25/2024 4/25/2024 Review tape of 4/16/2024 
Chicago Police Board 
meeting with 
Superintendent Snelling, 
Administrator Kirstes and 
community activist and FOP 
head, preparation and 
meeting on foot pursuit 
audit

2 hours

4/26/2024 4/26/2024 Associate Monitors meeting 1 hour 50
4/27/2024 4/27/2024 Read, review and contrast in 

car video policy with BWC 
policy and provide 
comments

1 hour 75



4/28/2024 4/28/2024 Review recent productions, 
review notes on Dist 3 site 
visit, read summary 
punishment policy and 
review UOF and other 
dashboards

1 hour 25

4/29/2024 4/29/2024 Review pointing and force 
dashboard access Clear 
system and review 2024-
001898 TRR, respond to 
request to verify status of 
paragraphs 236,237,238 for 
IMR9

1 hour 50

4/30/2024 4/30/2024 Prepare agenda and engage 
in weekly UOF meeting with 
Deputy Monroe, Ms Bryson, 
DeCarlo, Melendez and Mr 
Becker

Click or tap here to enter text.

Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.
Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.
Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.
Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.
Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap to enter a date. Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap here to enter text.

Total: 72 hours Rate: $165 
Check here if you are not billing for any travel:   

Purpose of Travel:Click or tap here to enter text.

Travel/ODCs (itemize and provide receipts as specified on your contract)  
Travel Date 
(From) Travel Date (To)  Expense Type  Description  Qty Rate Total 

4/7/2024 4/10/2024
Air, Train, 
Baggage 
Fees

United Air Lines- one 
way 1 $306.00 $306

4/7/2024 4/10/2024
Air, Train, 
Baggage 
Fees

American Airline- one 
way 1 $200.10 $200.10

4/9/2024 4/9/2024 Rental Car UBER 1 $10.98 $10.98
4/9/2024 4/9/2024 Rental Car UBER 1 $12.31 $12.31

4/7/2024               4/10/2024                Hotel Expense             Marriott Marquis Chicago                              3 $225+tax 
$792.48

4/7/2024                 4/7/2024                  Per Diem                        Dinner                                                              1            
$28.00

4/8/2024              4/8/2024                   Per Diem                        Breakfast/Dinner  $39.18
4/9/2024               4/9/2024                  Per Diem                         Breakfast                                                                        $10.62
4/10/2024             4/10/2024                 Per Diem                        Lunch                                                                              $17.08
4/7/2024               4/7/2024                    CTA Train                                                                                                              $5.00
 TOTAL $1421.75
                                                                                                                                                                                                     

  

  



INVOICE TOTAL DUE $13,301.75
Invoice Comments/Notes:Click or tap here to enter text.

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate, 
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the 
contract. I am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, 
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections 
3729-3730.) 

 

                                                                                          Paul F Evans                           5/6/2024 
 

 

Signature Date 
 
 
 
 
 

Privately Owned Vehicle Mileage Reimbursement 
Date of 
Expense 

Description (including starting location and ending location) Miles Rate Total:  

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text.

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Click or 
tap to 
enter a 
date.

Click or tap here to enter text. Click or tap 
here to 
enter text.

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text.

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Subtotal Mileage (rounded): 
Click or tap 
here to 
enter text. 

Click or tap 
here to enter 
text. 

Click or tap here to enter 
text.

Total Travel:  Click or tap here to enter 
text.
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EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Austin, Baltimore, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth, 

Denver, Detroit, Fort Lauderdale, Greenville-Spartanburg, Guam, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kona, Las Vegas, 

Los Angeles, Maui, Miami, New York (LGA), Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Pittsburgh, 

Raleigh/Durham, Reno, San Diego, San Francisco, San Juan, PR (60 minutes), Savannah, Seattle, St. Louis, St. Thomas, U.S. Virgin 

Islands (60 minutes), Tampa, Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA), the check in requirement time for Passengers and Bags is 45 

minutes except where noted.  

Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding pass at least 

15 minutes prior to scheduled departure. 

Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding, removal of 

checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation. 

Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport. 

The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop computer, etc.) per 

passenger. The fare rules for your ticket may restrict your carry-on baggage allowance even further. 

For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in Spanish 1-800-

426-5561. 

If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the fare rules 

governing your ticket. 

For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page. 

Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare rules. 

Data Protection Notice
Your personal data will be processed in accordance with the applicable carrier's privacy policy and if your booking is made via a 

reservation system provider ("GDS"), with its privacy policy. These are available at http://www.iatatravelcenter.com/privacy or 

from the carrier or GDS directly. You should read this documentation, which applies to your booking and specifies, for example, 

how your personal data is collected, stored, used, disclosed and transferred 

Customer Care Contact Information
We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience. You may contact us 

using our Customer Care form  

Hazardous materials
Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A violation can 

result in five years' imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124). Hazardous materials include explosives, 

compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons, corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of 

hazardous materials/dangerous goods include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, 

pesticides, bleach and corrosive materials. Additional information can be found on:  

united.com restricted items page

FAA website Pack Safe page

TSA website Prohibited Items page

Refunds Within 24 Hours
When you book and ticket a reservation through united.com, the United mobile app, the United Customer Contact Center, at our 

ticket counters or city ticket offices, or if you use MileagePlus® miles to book an award ticket, we will allow you to cancel the 
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ticketed reservation without penalty and receive a 100 percent refund of the ticket price to the original form of payment if you 

cancel the reservation within 24 hours of purchase and if the reservation is made one week or more prior to scheduled flight 

departure. 

Disinsection Notice
Certain countries require that the passenger cabins of aircraft be treated with insecticides. For additional information and a list 

of those countries, please visit the U.S. Department of Transportation's disinsection website.

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES
Changes/Cancellations - Most tickets, other than Basic Economy tickets or those for travel originating outside the United States, 

other than for travel between the United States and Mexico or the Caribbean, may be changed to a different itinerary, or 

cancelled and the value of the ticket retained so that it can be applied to a new ticket, without a change fee. Such change or 

cancellation must be made prior to the scheduled departure time. Travelers making changes will be responsible for the fare 

difference if the new itinerary has a higher fare than the original ticketed itinerary. Regarding non-refundable tickets, if the new 

itinerary has a lower fare than the original ticketed itinerary, changes can be made without charge, but the traveler is not entitled 

to any residual value. United may, in its sole discretion, provide partial or full residual credit under certain circumstances. A 

change fee may apply for changes or cancellations made to tickets for travel originating outside the United States, other than for 

travel between the United States and Mexico or the Caribbean. Policies concerning your ability to make reservation changes and 

cancellations and any fees associated with such changes can be found at Important travel notices | United Airlines.

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States (except for domestic 

portions of international journeys), United's liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in delivery of a customer's checked baggage 

is limited to $3,800 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not 

applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices). For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, 

perishable, or otherwise excluded items; excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further 

information may be obtained from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the 

domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per 

passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the domestic 

portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,288 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or unchecked. For baggage 

lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that customers provide preliminary notice within 

24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days 

of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of 

international journeys), the Montreal Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) 

for damaged baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within 21 

days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of United's Contract of 

Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability. 

Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United's Contract of Carriage, which 

are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1. Limits on liability for personal 

injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or 

otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an 

action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, 

check-in times, and refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including 

schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United's Contract of Carriage is 

available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter. Passengers have the right, upon request at any 

location where United's tickets are sold within the United States, to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the 

full text of United's Contract of Carriage. 
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Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the fare paid, one or 

more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the ticket may not be refundable but 

can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the 

payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for changing/canceling reservations; or (3) select tickets may not be 

eligible for refunds or changes even for a fee; (4) select tickets have no residual value and cannot be applied towards the 

purchase of future travel; or (5) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum and/or maximum stay 

may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has acquired a ticket in violation of any United 

tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national, federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. 

Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure 

within 24 hours of purchase. 

Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled 

departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30 minutes prior to scheduled departure. 

The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may 

differ from airport to airport. Please visit united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the 

customer's responsibility to arrive at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening 

processes within these minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate 

and the departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of your seat 

without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and boarding pass. 

Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate destination or a stop 

in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties known as the Montreal Convention, or its 

predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof 

within a country. For such passengers, the treaty, including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and 

may limit the liability of the Carrier in respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, 

baggage, and for delay of passengers and baggage. 

Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat will not be available 

on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no one will be denied a seat until airline 

personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in exchange for compensation of the airline's choosing. If 

there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding 

priority. With few exceptions, including failure to comply with the carrier's check-in deadlines, which are available upon request 

from the air carrier, persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of 

compensation and each airline's boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding locations. Some 

airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries, although other consumer protections may be 

available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Copyright © 2024 United Airlines, Inc. All Rights Reserved 

E-mail Information
Please do not reply to this message using the "reply" address.
The information contained in this email is intended for the original recipient only.
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Row Labels Sum of Hours
Amada Bond 30
Ana Genkova 13
Bridgette Bryson 132.5
Elliot Jordan 51
Heleana Melendez 134.5
Jessica Dockstader 19
Joseph Hoereth 11
Laura Kunard 53.5
Laura McElroy 4.75
Lindsey Clancey 24
Melissa Gutierrez 58.5
Monique Jenkins 22.5
Norma Ramos 15.5
Rodney Monroe 88.5
Roy Rothschild 9.5
Stephanie Smith 53
Tammy Felix 56
Tom Christoff 30.5
Valerie Schmitt 49

Grand Total 856.25



Contractor Name Month/Year Date Description of Labor Hours
Amada Bond April 2024 4/1/2024 Reviewed 4ASRU Needs Assessment. 2.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/3/2024 Attended weekly IMT internal ISR meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/3/2024 Attended ISR meeting with 4ASRU. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/5/2024 Attended monthly IMT meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewed traffic stop data report. 0.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/9/2024 Reviewed Free 2 Move traffic stop report and traffic stop article. 1.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/9/2024 Typed up notes for Para. 835 Needs Assessment. 0.50

Amada Bond April 2024 4/10/2024 Prepared for weekly internal ISR meeting and sent Associate Monitor materials for review. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/10/2024 Discussion with SME about traffic stops, best practices, and LE perspectives. 1.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/10/2024 Attended weekly ISR meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/12/2024 Drafted Para. 843 plan for ISR team. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/13/2024 Reviewed ISR. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/15/2024 Planning for Para. 843 and follow up with the AM. 1.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/16/2024 Reviewed ISR methodology. 2.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/16/2024 IMT monthly ISR/UoF crossover meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/16/2024 IMT monthly ISR/Impartial Policing crossover meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/17/2024 Planning for Para. 843. 1.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT internal weekly ISR meeting. 1.00

Amada Bond April 2024 4/19/2024
Prepared for ISR meeting and sent discussion items and materials to AM for review ahead of the
meeting. 0.50

Amada Bond April 2024 4/24/2024 Reviewed impartial policing site visit notes and followed up with analyst with questions. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/24/2024 Reviewed CPD's meeting agenda and sent follow up items to AM. 0.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/24/2024 Reviewed ISR paragraphs and expected productions. 1.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/24/2024 IMT weekly ISR meeting. 1.00

Amada Bond April 2024 4/25/2024 CPD monthly IMT/OAG ISR meeting and dissemination of notes with summary afterwards. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/25/2024 Reviewed ISR data. 1.00

Amada Bond April 2024 4/25/2024
Prepared for CPD meeting and reviewed relevant paragraph requirements that were to be
discussed. 0.50

Amada Bond April 2024 4/26/2024 Monthly internal IMT analyst meeting. 1.00
Amada Bond April 2024 4/26/2024 Best practices review. 0.50
Amada Bond April 2024 4/30/2024 Started review of ISR informal production. 0.50
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/1/2024 NORC Survey Meeting 1.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/8/2024 NORC Survey Meeting 1.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/23/2024 Research Team Meeting about IMT Planning 1.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/25/2024 Analysis Planning 2.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/26/2024 Analysis Planning 2.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/29/2024 NORC Survey Meeting 1.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/29/2024 Analysis Planning 2.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/30/2024 Analysis Planning 2.00
Ana Genkova April 2024 4/9/2024 Internal Planning Meeting 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 Site visit planning 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 IMT Project Management 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 IMT/City weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 Public Hearing Prep 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 BIA bi weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 Training/RHP weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/1/2024 BIA eLearning paragraph review 1.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 IMT Project Management 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 Site visit planning 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 UOF weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/2/2024 Public Hearing prep with Parties and debrief 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 IMT Project Management 2.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 Weekly call with Casey McKenzie 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 IMT Leadership Weekly 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 Public Hearing Prep 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 IP weekly team call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 A&T weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 Check in with Rodney Monroe 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 UoC/SoC, OSS, PES monthly crossover call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/3/2024 Drafting A&T production comments 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 BIA eLearning paragraph review 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 Site visit planning 0.50



Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 IMT Project Management 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 IMT website discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 Supervision weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/4/2024 WFA SOW comment review 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT/OAG weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 Site visit planning 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 WFA comment development 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 Analyst monthly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/5/2024 Data weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/7/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit prep 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit: Impartial Policing, OCPR meeting 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit: BIA discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit: Impartial Policing, R&D/Training Meeting 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Meeting with Allyson 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit Debrief 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit: Impartial Policing Policy discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 668 Meeting and Debrief 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/8/2024 CCPSA Public Hearing 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Site Visit Prep 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Site Visit: Community Policing, OCPR Discussion 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Site Visit Debrief 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Settlement Conference and Debrief 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Public Hearing Prep and Hearing 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/9/2024 Site Visit: EIS Technical Assistance Discussion 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 Site Visit: Use of Force, Firearm Pointing Discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 Site Visit: Use of Force, Meeting with Commanders 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 CompStat 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 Site Visit: Community Policing, Public Safety Cabinet Meeting 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 OWS production discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/10/2024 Site Visit debrief 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/11/2024 IMT Project Management 3.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/11/2024 COPA monthly call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/11/2024 IMR9 discussion 1.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/12/2024 IMT Project Management 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/12/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/15/2024 Bi weekly Associate Monitor Meeting 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/15/2024 IMT/City weekly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/15/2024 IMT Project Management 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/15/2024 Leadership discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 Productions review and updating internal deadlines 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 UOF weekly team call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 ISR/UOF/Supervision monthly crossover 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 ISR/IP monthly crossover 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/16/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 Call with Casey McKenzie 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 Leadership weekly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 COPA Witness Reliability Training Observation 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 Comprehensive Assessment Discussion with Parties 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 A&T weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/17/2024 Reviewing production comments 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/18/2024 IMT Project Management 3.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/18/2024 Accountability Monthly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT Project Management 2.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 OWS monthly call 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 Check in with Laura and Anthony Ray 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 ISR weekly team call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/19/2024 Data weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/21/2024 IMT Project Management 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/21/2024 A&T IMR9 revisions 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/21/2024 Updating Responses tracker and internal deadlines 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/22/2024 IMT Project Management 2.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/22/2024 Website updates discussion 0.25



Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/22/2024 EISS Site Visit Debrief discussion 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/22/2024 Training/RHP weekly team call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/23/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/23/2024 IMT Project Management 1.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/23/2024 Reviewing A&T methodologies 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 IMT Project Management 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 Weekly call with Casey McKenzie 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 Leadership weekly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 COPA Fact Gathering Training Observation and debrief 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 OWS Parties discussion and debrief 2.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 A&T weekly call and debrief 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/24/2024 Site Visit: Community Policing, District 11 CAPS and DCOs 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/25/2024 IMT Project Management 2.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/25/2024 Supervision weekly team call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/25/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/25/2024 Labor discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT/OAG weekly call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT Project Management 1.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 WFA SOW discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 Associate Monitor Monthly Call 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 Documents and Productions bi weekly call with the Parties 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 Analysts monthly call 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/26/2024 Data weekly team call 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 IMT Project Management 1.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 Site Visit debrief 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 Productions discussion with IMT 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 Reviewing productions and disseminating to IMT team 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 Reviewing training paragraphs for A&T 3.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 A&T IMR9 revisions 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/29/2024 Training/RHP weekly team call 0.25
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 IMT Project Management 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 OWS weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 Site Visit: OWS/OPSA discussion 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 IMT website discussion 1.00
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 UOF weekly team call 0.75
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 CIT weekly team call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 CIT monthly call 0.50
Bridgette Bryson April 2024 4/30/2024 Reviewing training paragraphs for A&T 2.50
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/1/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/2/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/3/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/4/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/5/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/8/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/9/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/10/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/11/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/12/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/15/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/16/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 0.50
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/17/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 0.50
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/18/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/19/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/22/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/23/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/24/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 1.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/25/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/26/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 3.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/29/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 2.00
Elliot Jordan April 2024 4/30/2024 Website updates, maintenance, and new website development. 4.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/1/2024 IMT project management 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/1/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/1/2024 Review WFA scope 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/1/2024 UOF site visit prep 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/1/2024 Review UOF production responses 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/2/2024 IMT project management 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/2/2024 Attend UOF weekly check in 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/2/2024 IMT project management 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/2/2024 IMT project management 2.00



Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/3/2024 Review UOF production responses 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/3/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/3/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/4/2024 IMT project management 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/4/2024 IMT project management 3.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/4/2024 Attend IMT/OAG IMR 9 discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/4/2024 UOF site visit prep 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT project management 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 Review UOF questions for site visit 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 Attend UOF discussion with OAG 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 Attend OAG meeting debrief 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 Develop and review OAG meeting notes 1.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 Attend IMT analyst meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/7/2024 Prep interview questions for POs 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/7/2024 Prep interview questions for LTs 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/7/2024 Review D19 01 1.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/7/2024 Review ISR site visit notes for UOF overlap 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/7/2024 Review G03 07 1.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Interviews with patrol officers in 003 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Interviews with lieutenants in 003 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 District 003 interview debrief 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Interviews with patrol officers in 001 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Interviews with lieutenants in 001 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 District 001 interview debrief 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Attend 668 meeting 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 668 meeting debrief 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/8/2024 Attend CCPSA meeting 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Observe ABLE training 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Observe DNC training 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Training observation debrief 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Attend TOC 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Attend BWC compliance meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Review IMR 9 UOF comments from CPD and make revisions 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/9/2024 Review OIS BWC footage 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Attend firearm pointing incident policy 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Attend focus group with commanders 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Attend discussion on compliance performance 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Observe CompStat 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Attend focus group with captains 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Focus groups debrief 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Review G03 06 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/10/2024 Review OIS BWC footage 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/11/2024 Attend site visit debrief discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/11/2024 IMT project management 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/12/2024 IMT project management 1.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/12/2024 Attend IMT tracker updates discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/12/2024 IMT project management 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/12/2024 Review UOF tracker updates 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/12/2024 Review G02 02 policy production 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/15/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/15/2024 Review G02 02 policy production 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/15/2024 IMT project management 3.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/16/2024 Attend UOF weekly check in 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/16/2024 Review and develop firearm pointing incident policy notes 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/16/2024 Attend ISR/UOF/Supervision crossover meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/16/2024 Review NON and comments for UOF production 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/16/2024 Develop and review notes for UOF training observations 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/17/2024 Develop and review notes for UOF training observations 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/17/2024 Develop and review commander focus group notes 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/18/2024 Develop and review captain focus group notes 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/18/2024 Attend IMT/CPD UOF discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/19/2024 Review COPA feedback of S06 06 suite 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT project management 2.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/19/2024 Develop and review captain focus group notes 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Develop and review commander focus group notes 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Attend IMT website discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 IMT project management 2.00



Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Develop and review commander focus group notes 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Develop and review captain focus group notes 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Review UOF IMR 9 draft 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Develop and review firearm pointing policy notes 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/22/2024 Develop and review BWC compliance meeting notes 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/23/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/23/2024 IMT project management 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/23/2024 Attend UOF weekly check in 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/23/2024 Attend additional changes to IMR 9 UOF draft 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/23/2024 IMT project management 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/24/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/24/2024 Develop and review notes for BWC compliance meeting 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/24/2024 Develop and review notes for District 001 interviews 3.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/24/2024 Develop and review notes for District 003 interviews 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/25/2024 Develop and review notes for District 003 interviews 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/25/2024 IMT project management 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/25/2024 Attend foot pursuit audit meeting 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/25/2024 Develop and review foot pursuit audit notes 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/25/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Develop and review 668 meeting notes 2.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Review UOF best practices 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT project management 1.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT meeting prep 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Attend IMT analyst meeting 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Monthly CPD UOF meeting prep 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Review COPA Q1 2024 report 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/26/2024 Review 2020 foot pursuit audit 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/29/2024 IMT project management 3.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Review UOF training specific paragraphs 2.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Attend IMT website discussion 0.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Attend UOF weekly check in 1.00
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Attend CIT monthly meeting 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Develop and review CIT monthly meeting notes 0.75
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Review CIT training specific paragraphs 1.50
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Review OAG comments to Riot Shield training production 0.25
Heleana Melendez April 2024 4/30/2024 Review Riot Shield training production 0.25
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/2/2024 Internal weekly meeting with AM Deck Brown and Attorney 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/2/2024 Reviewing ICIOT production and looking for evaluations 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/2/2024 Reviewing workforce analysis OWS section 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/3/2024 Monthly crossover meeting Data, Supervision, OWS 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/5/2024 Internal monthly CNA IMT meeting 1.00
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/9/2024 Internal weekly IMT OWS meeting with AM Deck Brown and Attorney Lemley Laurich 1.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/9/2024 Developing questions for monthly meeting with OWS section on Annual Report to Superintendent 2.00
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/16/2024 Internal weekly OWS IMT meeting with AM Deck Brown and Attorney Lemley Laurich 2.00
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/17/2024 Supervision and OWS Analyst Discussion 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/17/2024 Discussion with PM Bryson about OWS Monthly Meeting 0.25
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/17/2024 Compiling OWS request for information document memo 0.75
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/17/2024 Reviewing compliance statuses and compiling productions for IMR 10 assessment 1.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/18/2024 Meeting with PD Kunard about Monthly OWS meeting 0.25

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/18/2024
Meeting with AM Deck Brown, Anthony Ray Sepulveda, Meredith DeCarlo, Bridgette Bryson, Laura
Kunard, and Gwen Lemley Laurich about Monthly OWS meeting 0.75

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/19/2024 Rescheduled March monthly OWS IMT/OAG/CPD monthly meeting 1.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewing meeting notes from Data Site Visit 0.25
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/22/2024 Cleaning and disseminating meeting notes for monthly meeting with CPD, OAG, and IMT 0.75
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewing OWS CPD Production Cordico Wellness SOW 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewing OWS CPD production Annual In Service Supervisor Training 0.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/23/2024
Internal weekly OWS IMT meeting with AM Deck Brown, Attorney Lemley Laurich, Project Manager
Bryson, Attorney Sepulveda 0.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/29/2024 Prepare for OPSA site visit 0.50
Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/30/2024 Monthly meeting between OWS IMT and OAG 0.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/30/2024
Weekly internal OWS IMT meeting with AM Deck Brown, Attorney Lemley Laurich, Deputy Monitor
Monroe, Attorney Sepulveda, and PM Bryson 0.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/30/2024 OPSA Site visit discussion on suicide data, fitness for duty, and equipment audit 0.50

Jessica Dockstader April 2024 4/30/2024
Debrief from OPSA site visit with Deputy Monitor Monroe, AM Deck Brown, and Attorney Lemley
Laurich 0.50

Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/1/2024 Check in with NORC on Community Survey 1.00
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/8/2024 Check in with NORC on Community Survey 1.00
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/15/2024 Check in with NORC on Community Survey 1.00



Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/29/2024 Check in with NORC on Community Survey 1.00
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/22/2024 CET Meeting 1.00
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/24/2024 District Council Meeting 9th District 1.00
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/26/2024 Associate Monitor Meeting 1.50
Joseph Hoereth April 2024 4/22/2024 Final prep for public release of Year 3 survey data 3.50

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/1/2024

IMT website revisions: 2
IMT weekly training call: .5
IMT site visits: .5 3.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/2/2024

Public Hearing meeting: .5
Crisis Intervention meeting: .5
UOF meeting: .5
RHP monthly meeting: .5 2.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/3/2024

IMT weekly leadership team meeting: 1
IMT ISR meeting: .5
IMR A&T meeting: 1
IMT communications and scheduling: 1
Court hearing prep: .5 4.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/4/2024

Preparation for public hearing: 1
IMT website updates: 2
IMT supervision meeting: 1
Leadership team calls: 1
Calls with Associate Monitors: .5
Calls with analysts: .5 6.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/5/2024

Site visit prep / reviews: 1
UOF discussion: .5
Analyst meeting: 1
IMT data call: .5
Comprehensive Assessment: 1 4.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/7/2024
Site visit prep / scheduling: 1
IMR 9: 1 2.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/8/2024

UOF site visit meetings: 1.5
Monthly 668 meeting: 2
CCPSA community meeting: 2
IMT site visit communications and scheduling: .5 6.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/9/2024

IMT site visit UOF meetings: 1
Monthly settlement conference: .5
Monthly status hearing: 1.25
Site visit community engagement meeting: 1.25
IMT communications and scheduling: 1
IMT meetings: 1.5
IMR 9: 1
Comprehensive Assessment: .5 8.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/10/2024

IMT CIT meeting: .5
IMT A&T meeting: 1
Site visit communications and scheduling: 1
IMR 9: 1.5
Comprehensive Assessment: 1.5 5.50

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/11/2024

IMT leadership team discussions: 1
UOF call: 1
IMR 9: 1 3.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/15/2024
Weekly check in call with City: .5
IMT leadership team calls: 1.5 2.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/18/2024

IMT administration: 1
IMT meeting re: OWS: 1
IMR 9: 1
IMT Communications and scheduling: 1 4.00

Laura Kunard April 2024 4/19/2024

Weekly check in call with OAG: .5
Community Policing IMT call: .5
IMT Leadership team calls: 1.5
IMR 9: 1
Comprehensive Assessment: .5 4.00

Laura McElroy April 2024 4/8/2024
Emailed Laura K and Maggie about media inquiry from CBS2. Call with the reporter. Updated
Maggie and Laura K. 0.75

Laura McElroy April 2024 4/9/2024 CIT status hearing 1.50

Laura McElroy April 2024 4/19/2024
Email exchanges with Bridgette, Maggie, and Laura K regarding Minneapolis reporting inquiry
regarding monitoring costs. 0.50

Laura McElroy April 2024 4/22/2024
CET meeting on community meeting at the district office, survey update. Call with Minneapolis
media on Consent Decree bills. 1.00

Laura McElroy April 2024 4/30/2024 Call with Secret Service PIO regarding Chicago Democratic National Convention 1.00



Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/3/2024 Webinar Observation for Alternatives to Policing/Communities United 1.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/3/2024 CIT Section Production Review 1.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/2/2024 IMR10 Site Visit Follow Ups 3.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/2/2024 CIT Analyst Meeting with Leadership 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/2/2024 CIT Section Internal Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/1/2024 CIT Section Meeting Prep and Production Review 1.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/4/2024 CIT Section Production Review and Follow ups 1.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/5/2024 Analyst Monthly Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/5/2024 CIT Section IMR10 Site Visit Follow Ups. 1.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/8/2024 Status Hearing Preparation for CIT section 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/9/2024 Virtual Public Status Hearing and Follow up for Crisis Intervention Section 2.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/10/2024 CIT Internal Weekly Meeting (prep, notes, and follow up). 1.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/12/2024 CIT Section Production Review. 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/14/2024 CIT Section IMR10 Follow Ups 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/15/2024 IMR10 Production Review for CIT Section 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/16/2024 IMR10 Site Visit Notes Follow Ups 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/17/2024 CIT Section Production Review 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/18/2024 CIT Section Production Comments 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/22/2024 CIT Section Internal Meeting Prep 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/23/2024 CIT Section Production Touch base and follow ups 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/24/2024 IMR10 Site Visit Follow Ups 0.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/25/2024 CIT Section Internal Meeting, Notes Clean up and Follow ups. 1.50
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT Analyst Meeting 1.00
Lindsey Clancey April 2024 4/26/2024 CIT Section Follow ups 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/26/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/26/2024 Monthly IMT meeting to discuss IMR10 updates and plans for IMT 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/26/2024 Meeting with AM and Attorney on updating methodologies for Data section 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/26/2024 Drafted comments for CPD D20 04 EISS Pilot Program 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/26/2024 Drafted RFI for Data team 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/25/2024 Discussion with Parties: Monthly IMT/OAG Supervision Meeting 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/25/2024 Discussion with Parties: Foot Pursuit Audit Meeting 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/25/2024 Meeting with AM and Attorney on outstanding IMR10 meeting requests for Data team 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/24/2024 Reviewed BWC S03 14 and S03 05 productions and comments 3.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/23/2024 Discussed and reviewed outstanding IMR10 meeting requests for Data team 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/22/2024 Cleaned and distributed IMR10 site visit notes 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/19/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/19/2024 Discussion with Parties: Informal CPD call with Data team 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed best practices on traffic stops and public safety 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed Data productions for IMR10 report 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed Par. 607 methodology 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/16/2024 Discussion with Parties: Meeting with OAG 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/16/2024 Meeting with AM and Attorney on TRED review analysis 0.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/16/2024 Reviewed TRED's evaluation policy 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/15/2024 Reviewed EISS Pilot Program policy 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/15/2024 Reviewed the history and status of the Data Review Policy Draft production 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/12/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/10/2024 Reviewed best practices on Use of Force 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/10/2024 Reviewed Training sections paragraphs for Data section overlap 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/10/2024 Reviewed Accountability team's notes on COPA's access 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 Developed and cleaned notes for IMR10 site visit day 2 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Discussion with Parties re: EISS/OSS Technical Assistance 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Meeting with Audit Division 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 Data meeting debrief on Pars. 606 and 607 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Meeting with Dan Casey 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Ride along in District 9 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/8/2024 Developed and cleaned notes for IMR10 site visit day 1 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/8/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Ride along in District 2 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/8/2024 Reviewed CPD's FRB policy 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/8/2024 IMR10 Site Visit: Discussion with Parties re: Par. 668 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed Supervision and Officer Wellness IMR10 site visit notes 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed agenda and meeting points for IMR10 site visit 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/5/2024 Weekly Data team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 1.50
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/5/2024 Monthly IMT meeting to discuss IMR10 updates and upcoming site visits 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/4/2024 Reviewed CPD Department Directives Issued March 2024 1.00

Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/3/2024
Monthly Supervision, Officer Wellness, and Data team meeting to discuss pilot status (EIS, OSS, PES,
UoC/SoC) 1.00

Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/2/2024 Reviewed IMR10 site visit meetings for site visit agenda preparation 1.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/1/2024 Reviewed outstanding items on IMT tracker for Data team 2.00
Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/30/2024 Debrief with Officer Wellness Section on Pars. 415, 416, and 417 1.50



Melissa Gutierrez April 2024 4/30/2024 Drafted RFI for Data team 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/3/2024 OSW/Data crossover call 0.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/3/2024 Internal call with AM Durham 1.00

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/4/2024
Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items and
follow ups 1.50

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/4/2024
Monthly IMT/OAG/City/CPD Call

1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/8/2024 Supervision production review 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/9/2024 Data Site Visit meeting re: EISS 1.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/10/2024 Weekly Internal call with AM Durham 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/10/2024 Review of Supervision production comments 0.50

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/16/2024
Watch Application Sheet Walkthrough Meeting

0.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/16/2024 Follow up with AM Durham 0.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/16/2024 ISR/UoF/Supervision Crossover 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/17/2024 Internal meeting with AM Durham 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/17/2024 Check In with OSW 0.50

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/18/2024
Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items and
follow ups 1.50

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/19/2024 Review of methodologies 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/23/2024 Watch Sheet Application Meeting and follow ups 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/24/2024 Internal weekly call with AM Durham 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/25/2024 Monthly IMT/OAG Supervision meeting 0.75
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/25/2024 review of methodologies 0.75

Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/25/2024 Weekly Supervision team meeting to discuss productions, requests, and outstanding items 0.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/26/2024 Review of IMR 10 methodologies 0.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/26/2024 Internal Supervision IMR 10 methodologies meeting 1.50
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/26/2024 Internal IMT analysts meeting 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/30/2024 Review of CIT production 1.00
Monique Jenkins April 2024 4/30/2024 Review of Supervision paragraphs 0.50
Norma Ramos April 2024 4/1/2024 Survey meeting with NORC 1.00
Norma Ramos April 2024 4/8/2024 Survey meeting with NORC 1.00
Norma Ramos April 2024 4/15/2024 Survey meeting with NORC 1.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/5/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan that includes: recruitment for
community liaisons, internal outreach on campus and building a list of potential community
engagement partners to host sessions. Including researching leads, communication
correspondences, and outreach. 1.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/8/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and hearing. 2.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/15/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and hearing. 2.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/22/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and hearing. 2.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/29/2024

Work on weekly tasks and assignments to support CET strategic plan. Including researching leads,
follow up on communication correspondences and action items from community engagement
sessions and hearing. 1.00

Norma Ramos April 2024 4/22/2024 Attend IMT CET bi weekly meeting 1.00
Norma Ramos April 2024 4/24/2024 Attend District Council 9 Community Engagement Session with Maggie and Joe 2.50
Norma Ramos April 2024 4/28/2024 Meeting with NORC 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/1/2024 Weekly meeting w/City 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/1/2024 Reviewed BIA Module 10 training 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/2/2024 RHP monthly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/2/2024 Meeting to discuss Public Hearing topics 0.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/2/2024 Reviewed notes from City/IMT meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/2/2024 Reviewed various productions submitted CP, CI, RHP 1.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/3/2024 IMT weekly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/3/2024 Reviewed CPD draft revised WFA 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/3/2024 ISR weekly meeting 0.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/3/2024 Reviewed additional productions submitted by CPD A&T, Training 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/3/2024 Meeting w/ Laura to discuss OW deliverables 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/4/2024 Supervision Monthly meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/4/2024 Weekly Supervision Internal meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/4/2024 Reviewed responded to various IMT emails 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/4/2024 Reviewed and responded to various IMT emails 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewed CPD latest draft WFA and IMT additional responses to CPD 1.25



Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewed agenda and script for Public Hearing 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewed Mike and Bridgette's responses to BIA Supplemental training 0.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/5/2024 Meeting w/OAG 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/5/2024 Reviewed additional CPD/City productions, Supervision, A&T, OW, made notes for AMs 2.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed Communities United report on Alternative Policing 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed and made notes on PCD Annual Report to Sup 1.50

Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed productions, meeting notes, agendas, interview questions in prep for site visit 4.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/7/2024 Meeting w/ Bridgette to discuss and revise IMT response to CPD WFA 1.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/8/2024 Site visit meetings 9.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/9/2024 Site visit meetings 8.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/9/2024 Team debrief to discuss interviews and meetings 1.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/10/2024 Site visit meetings 8.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/11/2024 Reviewed notes from various meetings and materials 4.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/11/2024 Monthly COPA meeting 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/11/2024 IMT meeting to discuss site visits 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/12/2024 Weekly OAG meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/12/2024 Reviewed Coalition Enforcement Motion 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/12/2024 Meeting to discuss par 247 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/15/2024 AM prep and meeting 1.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/18/2024 Reviewed CPD latest draft of WFA RFP 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/18/2024 Reviewed CPD Supervision UOC/SOC Audit proposal 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed notes from OAG/IMT weekly meeting 0.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed various City productions, Riot Shield training, OW App SOP 2.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewed notes and comments from Data meeting to discuss EIS 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Calls with Ams Evan, Medlock and Bowman to discuss DNC site visit 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Call w/Allyson and Novalez 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewed OW notes from Annual report meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Internal Training and RHP meeting 0.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/22/2024 Reviewed IMT tracking sheet, follow ups with Ams 1.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/23/2024 Reviewed OAG/City Confidentiality Agreement 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/25/2024 Meeting to discuss Foot Pursuit Audit 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/25/2024 Call w/Allyson to discuss 201 processing 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/25/2024 Reviewed notes from Labor meeting 0.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Reviewed CPD PPT for UOF monthly meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Weekly OAG/IMT meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Meeting w/T and Bridgette to discuss WFA 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Prep and AM monthly meeting 1.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Reviewed and responded to various emails from IMT/CPD 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Call with Allyson to discuss 201s and follow up to AM meeting 0.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/26/2024 Reviewed notes from Documents meeting for follow up. 0.25

Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/27/2024 Reviewed COPA’s Fact Gathering – Evidence Collection In Service Training and IMT comments 1.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/27/2024 Reviewed Allyson's recent comments on IMR9 draft report 1.00
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/29/2024 Reviewed 2023 BIA Annual Report 1.25
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/29/2024 Reviewed CPD Equipment and Property Control production 0.75
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/30/2024 OW weekly meeting 1.50
Rodney Monroe April 2024 4/30/2024 UOF weekly meeting 1.00
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/1/2024 Meeting with NORC about 2024 survey 1.00
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/8/2024 Meeting with NORC about 2024 survey 1.00
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/15/2024 Meeting with NORC about 2024 survey 0.50
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/15/2024 Finalize Y3 open data release 2.00
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/16/2024 Finalize Y3 open data release 1.50
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/18/2024 Finalize Y3 open data release 1.00
Roy Rothschild April 2024 4/19/2024 Finalize Y3 open data release 2.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/1/2024 Prepared and distributed meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/1/2024 Reviewed latest CPD productions 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/2/2024 Prepared and reviewed materials for April site visit 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/3/2024 IMT Impartial Policing Team meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT monthly internal meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/5/2024 Prep for CCPSA meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/5/2024 Drafted response to IP request 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/5/2024 Prepared and reviewed materials for April site visit 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed site visit agenda items 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/7/2024 Reviewed Impartial Policing paragraphs in preparation for site visit 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 Meeting with executive members of Office of Community Reform 1.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 R&D training meeting 1.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 Disabilities policies update meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 Language access meeting 1.00



Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 668 meeting with Superintendent Snelling 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 Observed CCPSA meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/8/2024 Compiled meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Data evaluation and measurement meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Observed TOC meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Paragraph 53 and 72 discussion meeting 1.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Community engagement plan meeting and discussion 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Reviewed OIS BWC footage and incident reports 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/9/2024 Reviewed and compiled meeting notes 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/10/2024 OEMC language line demo 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/10/2024 Compiled and transcribed meeting notes from written materials 3.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/10/2024 Reviewed best practices for impartial policing 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/10/2024 Coordinated meetings for Impartial Policing Section 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/11/2024 Cleaned meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/12/2024 Impartial Policing site visit debrief meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/15/2024 Cleaned and compiled site visit notes and materials for distribution to team 2.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/15/2024 Organized and updated document files on internal Impartial Policing SharePoint site 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/16/2024 IMT ISR/Impartial Policing Crossover meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/16/2024 Responded to information requests from ISR team 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/17/2024 IMT Impartial Policing Team meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/18/2024 Coordinated meetings for Impartial Policing Section 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT Analyst meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/19/2024 IMT Impartial Policing Analyst Attorney meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/19/2024 Reviewed IMT internal compliance tracker and related documents 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/24/2024 OAG IMT Monthly Meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/24/2024 IMT Impartial Policing Team meeting 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/24/2024 Reviewed media articles related to CPD activities to stay up to date 0.50
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/25/2024 Cleaned and distributed meeting notes 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/25/2024 Organized and updated document files on internal Impartial Policing SharePoint site 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/26/2024 IMT Analyst meeting 1.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/29/2024 Completed table of training specific paragraphs 2.00
Stephanie Smith April 2024 4/30/2024 Revised table of training specific paragraphs 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/1/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and planning for
upcoming site visit. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/2/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and planning for
upcoming site visit. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/3/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and planning for
upcoming site visit. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/4/2024
Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and planning for
upcoming site visit. 1.50

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/5/2024
Participated in weekly internal community policing status meeting. Worked with AM for
Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements and comprehensive assessment. 2.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/8/2024 Participated in Community Policing sites visit for meetings with various City and CPD components. 8.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/9/2024 Participated in Community Policing sites visit for meetings with various City and CPD components. 8.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/10/2024 Participated in Community Policing sites visit for meetings with various City and CPD components. 8.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/11/2024 Participated in Community Policing sites visit for meetings with various City and CPD components. 5.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/12/2024 Worked on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/15/2024 Worked on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/16/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/17/2024
Participated in IMT meeting with CPD and the parties to document key status updates. Worked
with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/18/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/19/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/22/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/23/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/24/2024
Held Zoom interview with District 11 DCOs and CAPS officers. Worked with AM for Community
Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/25/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 1.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/26/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.00
Tammy Felix April 2024 4/29/2024 Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR 10 review requirements. 2.50

Tammy Felix April 2024 4/30/2024
Held Zoom interview with District 11 Commander. Worked with AM for Community Policing on IMR
10 review requirements and revised comments for public hearing. 3.00

Tom Christoff April 2024 4/2/2024 Various phone calls and emails with IMT members. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/3/2024 Participate in monthly meeting with Supervisions and Wellness section leads. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/5/2024 Review EISS production and participate in meeting with IMT members. 2.00



Tom Christoff April 2024 4/5/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/8/2024 Prepare for and participate in site visit meetings. 6.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/9/2024 Participate and prepare in site visited meetings. Debrief with team members. 8.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/12/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/16/2024 Participate in EISS debrief with OAG. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/19/2024 Meeting with analyst regarding EISS and other paragraphs 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/19/2024 Participate in meeting with CPD regarding Data section 0.50
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/19/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/22/2024 Participate in EISS Site Visit Debrief with IMT members. 1.00
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/24/2024 Review ICC production review. Review prior reports and recommendations. 1.50
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/24/2024 Phone conference with IMT member. 0.50
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/26/2024 Participate in foot pursuit audit discussion 0.50
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/26/2024 Participate in monthly Associate Monitor meeting. 1.50
Tom Christoff April 2024 4/26/2024 Participate in weekly Data Team meeting 1.00

Tom Christoff April 2024 4/26/2024 Review methodologies document and participate in discussion with Data Team members. 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/1/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/1/2024 Training form revisions 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/2/2024 Monthly CPD RHP Meeting and Follow up 1.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/2/2024 Review Training Production Materials 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/5/2024 CNA IMT Coordination Meeting 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/5/2024 IMT/OAG Meeting 0.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/8/2024 Site Visit Preparation 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/8/2024 Training Materials Review 3.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/8/2024 RHP Materials Review 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit, Training Observations 3.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Training Meetings 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR 10 TOC Meeting 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/9/2024 IMR 10 TCAC Meeting 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/10/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Academy Meetings 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/10/2024 IMR 10 Training Focus Groups 3.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/10/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit RHP Meeting 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/10/2024 IMR 10 Training/RHP Coordination 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/11/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Training Meetings 3.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/11/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Follow up 0.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/11/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Notes 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/12/2024 IMR 10 Site Visit Notes Compilation 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/15/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/15/2024 Draft RHP response 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/17/2024 Monthly CPD Training Meeting and Follow up 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/18/2024 Review RHP production materials 1.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/22/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/23/2024 Review training production 1.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/24/2024 Draft response for training production 2.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/26/2024 Monthly CNA IMT meeting 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/28/2024 Review and revise IMR 9 comments 1.00
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/29/2024 Weekly internal Training/RHP team call and follow up 1.50
Valerie Schmitt April 2024 4/30/2024 Training records review 1.00







Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit - 4/7-4/10 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Stephanie Smith 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Airfare 463.20 463.20 0 
Travel Agency Fee 33.00 33.00 0 
Baggage Fee 40.00 40.00  
Other (Lodging) 792.48 792.48 0 
Other (Per Diem) 194.70* 176.63 18.07 
Ground Transp. 80.58 50 30.58 
Total 1603.96 (Total Expenses) 1555.31. 48.65 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 3 nights = $792.48  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 4 and 
$60 on days 2 - 3. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/7 - $41.64 (all direct) 
4/8 - $64.43 ($60 direct, $4.43 unbillable) 
4/9 - $45.64 ($32 direct, $13.64 unbillable) – because a meal was provided, per diem is capped at $32 
4/10 - $42.99 (all direct) 
 











































Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Tammy Felix: 4/8-4/11 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Airfare 437.20 437.20 0 
Travel Agency Fee 15.00 15.00 0 
Other (Lodging) 792.48 792.48 0 
Other (Per Diem) 191.11* 137 54.11 
Ground Transp. 359.03 50 309.03 
Total 1794.82 (Total Expenses) 1431.68 363.14 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 3 nights = $792.48  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 4 and 
$60 on days 2 - 3. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/8 - $59.25 ($45 direct, $14.25 unbillable) 
4/9 - $52.86 ($32 direct, $20.86 unbillable) 
4/10 - $79 ($60 direct, $19 unbillable) – because a meal was provided, per diem is capped at $32 
 





























































Chicago IMT Site Visit - Note that this project has project-specific travel guidance and allowances set 
forth by the City of Chicago. 
 
April Site Visit 
 
Notes: 

LODGING: Project follows City of Chicago's travel guidance of up to $225/base nightly rate.  
GROUND TRANSP.: Up to $50 allowable for duration of trip, this includes airport parking 
Dinner was paid for on Tuesday, 4/9 so per diem allowance is reduced by $28 ($32) 

 
Rodney Monroe 4/7/2024 - 4/11/2024 
 

Expense Amount Direct Unallowable 
Airfare 562.70 562.70 0 
Other (Lodging) 1056.64 1056.64 0 
Other (Per Diem) 223.00* 0 223.00 
Ground Transp. 325.67 50 275.67 
Total 2168.01 (Total Expenses) 1669.34 498.67 

 
Lodging - $225/room rate + $39.16/taxes x 4 nights = $1,056.64  
 
* City will reimburse for meals based on actuals/receipts up to the allowance of $45 on days 1 and 5 and 
$60 on days 2 - 4. Anything over the City’s per diem and up to the GSA per diem ($59.25 on travel days 
and $79 on full days will go to unbillable. Over GSA per diem is non-reimbursable. The calculations for 
per diem are: 
 
4/7 - $40.00 ($40 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
4/8 - $79.00 ($79 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
4/9 - $79.00 ($79 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
4/10 - $25.00 ($25 unbillable due to non-itemized receipts) 
 































































































Page 2 of 2

Certification:  By signing this invoice, I certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, 
and accurate, and the expenditures, disbursements, and cash receipts are for the purposes set forth in the terms and 
conditions of the contract.  I am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent, information or the omission of any 
material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil, or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims, or 
otherwise.  (US Code Title 18, Section 1001and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730). 

Cassandra Deck-Brown May 13, 2024 

Signature Date 


