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Billing Number: CNAC-D786-0004
Invoice Number: INV-227151 Invoice Date: 07/15/2019
 
Bill To: Remit To:

Schiff Hardin,LLP
Attn: Maggie Hickey, Monitor
233 South Wacker Drive
Suite 7100
Chicago, IL 60606

The CNA Corporation
c/o PNC Bank N.A.
P.O. Box 820661
Philadelphia, PA 19182-0661

 
Customer Number: SCHIFF
Prime Contract Number: Engagement Letter

 
Project Number: 1499.0000.D786 Cumulative Amount Billed: $337,680.46
Project Name: CPD Monitor Base Year
Terms: NET 30 Billing Period From: 06/01/2019
Due Date: 08/14/2019 To: 06/30/2019
VAT/Tax ID Number:
 

  Current Current Cumulative Cumulative
Hours Rate Amount Hours Amount

CNA Associate Monitor
Decker, Scott H 19.00 196.3900 $3,731.41 69.00 $13,550.91

CNA Deputy Monitor
Monroe, Rodney D 0.00 218.5300 0.00 77.00 16,826.81
Coldren, James R 30.50 237.4900 7,243.45 209.00 49,635.43

CNA Monitoring Team Support
Richardson, Keri F 44.50 82.8000 3,684.60 154.00 12,751.20
Omotoye, Titilola O 1.00 153.8600 153.86 3.50 538.51
Sun, Christopher M 7.50 162.7600 1,220.70 24.00 3,906.24
Felix, Tammy L 14.50 195.4200 2,833.59 47.50 9,282.45
Elliott, Vivian Y 30.50 209.2000 6,380.60 156.50 32,739.80

CNA Project Director
Kunard, Laura L 98.50 171.4400 16,886.84 356.00 61,032.64

V Adler Univ-Elena Quintana
Adler - Elena Quintana 41.20 165.5500 6,820.66 103.45 17,126.15
Elena Quintana 0.00 165.5500 0.00 18.25 3,021.29

V Deputy Monitor
R Monroe Public Safety Co 74.75 218.5300 16,335.12 222.00 48,513.67

V Laura McElroy
McElroy Media Group 32.25 165.5500 5,338.99 94.00 15,561.71

V SME
Thomas Christoff 25.50 107.6100 2,744.06 71.00 7,640.31

V Safer Foundn-Sodiqa Williams
Safer - Sodiqa Williams 17.00 165.5500 2,814.35 50.00 8,277.51
Safer Foundation 0.00 165.5500 0.00 19.50 3,228.23

V Subcontractor NSTE
UIC - Richard Rothschild 23.50 46.0000 1,081.00 93.00 4,278.00
UIC - Umair Tarbhai 20.50 48.0000 984.00 20.50 984.00
UIC - Matthew Sweeney 50.00 61.0000 3,050.00 124.75 7,609.75
UIC - Joseph K. Hoereth 16.00 145.0000 2,320.00 55.25 8,011.25

V UIC-Joseph K. Hoereth, PhD
Joseph K. Hoereth, PhD 0.00 141.9300 0.00 20.00 2,838.60

Professional Service 546.70 $83,623.23 1,988.20 $327,354.46

Consultants Travel $994.05 $3,692.64
Books and Supplies 0.00 0.00
Software 339.50 1,299.50
CNA Travel 0.00 5,333.86

Other Direct Costs $1,333.55 $10,326.00

 
Invoice Total $84,956.78 $337,680.46

  

 
Current Incurred Hours: 546.70
Cumulative Incurred Hours: 1,988.20
 





Chicago Police Department Independent Monitoring Team Project 
Summary of CNA Staff Hours 
Month: June 2019

Name Sum of Hours
Christopher Sun 7.50

6/3/2019 0.50
6/4/2019 1.50
6/5/2019 2.00
6/6/2019 2.50
6/10/2019 1.00

Elena Quintana 41.20
6/1/2019 0.25
6/2/2019 1.50
6/3/2019 0.45
6/4/2019 1.00
6/5/2019 1.50
6/6/2019 2.50
6/9/2019 1.00
6/10/2019 1.75
6/11/2019 3.00
6/12/2019 0.50
6/13/2019 1.50
6/14/2019 1.00
6/17/2019 2.75
6/18/2019 1.00
6/19/2019 2.00
6/20/2019 2.25
6/21/2019 7.00
6/22/2019 0.50
6/24/2019 2.00
6/25/2019 5.50
6/26/2019 0.75
6/27/2019 1.25
6/28/2019 0.25

James Coldren 30.50
6/3/2019 2.00
6/4/2019 1.00
6/5/2019 1.50
6/10/2019 3.50
6/11/2019 3.00
6/12/2019 1.00
6/14/2019 3.00
6/16/2019 1.00
6/18/2019 2.50
6/19/2019 4.50



6/20/2019 3.00
6/21/2019 1.00
6/24/2019 2.00
6/27/2019 1.50

Joseph Hoereth 16.00
6/1/2019 1.50
6/4/2019 1.00
6/6/2019 0.50
6/10/2019 1.50
6/11/2019 1.00
6/14/2019 1.00
6/17/2019 1.50
6/19/2019 1.00
6/21/2019 2.50
6/24/2019 2.00
6/25/2019 1.50
6/26/2019 1.00

Keri Richardson 44.50
6/3/2019 1.50
6/4/2019 5.00
6/5/2019 3.50
6/6/2019 3.50
6/7/2019 1.50
6/10/2019 5.50
6/11/2019 2.50
6/12/2019 1.50
6/13/2019 1.00
6/14/2019 2.50
6/17/2019 2.50
6/18/2019 2.00
6/19/2019 4.00
6/20/2019 0.50
6/21/2019 3.50
6/24/2019 2.00
6/26/2019 1.00
6/28/2019 1.00

Laura Kunard 98.50
6/3/2019 2.00
6/4/2019 2.50
6/5/2019 6.00
6/6/2019 2.00
6/7/2019 8.00
6/10/2019 3.50
6/11/2019 6.00
6/12/2019 10.00
6/13/2019 9.50
6/14/2019 3.00



6/16/2019 1.00
6/17/2019 3.50
6/18/2019 4.00
6/19/2019 3.00
6/20/2019 9.00
6/21/2019 4.00
6/24/2019 3.00
6/25/2019 6.00
6/26/2019 3.00
6/27/2019 6.50
6/28/2019 3.00

Laura McElroy 32.25
6/3/2019 1.50
6/9/2019 2.50
6/10/2019 4.50
6/11/2019 1.00
6/14/2019 3.50
6/15/2019 2.00
6/16/2019 3.00
6/17/2019 5.00
6/18/2019 1.25
6/19/2019 1.75
6/20/2019 3.00
6/21/2019 2.25
6/30/2019 1.00

Matthew Sweeney 50.00
6/3/2019 3.00
6/4/2019 2.00
6/5/2019 2.00
6/6/2019 2.50
6/7/2019 2.00
6/10/2019 2.00
6/11/2019 5.00
6/13/2019 4.00
6/14/2019 4.00
6/17/2019 3.00
6/18/2019 3.00
6/19/2019 5.00
6/20/2019 2.00
6/21/2019 3.00
6/25/2019 2.00
6/26/2019 2.00
6/27/2019 3.00
6/28/2019 0.50

Rodney Monroe 74.75
6/3/2019 2.50
6/4/2019 2.50



6/5/2019 4.00
6/6/2019 4.75
6/7/2019 2.50
6/10/2019 2.00
6/11/2019 0.75
6/12/2019 2.25
6/13/2019 7.00
6/14/2019 2.00
6/17/2019 4.00
6/18/2019 4.50
6/19/2019 5.00
6/20/2019 12.00
6/21/2019 7.25
6/24/2019 6.50
6/25/2019 0.75
6/26/2019 0.75
6/27/2019 2.25
6/28/2019 1.50

Roy Rothschild 23.50
6/3/2019 3.00
6/5/2019 2.00
6/6/2019 2.50
6/7/2019 2.00
6/10/2019 2.00
6/11/2019 2.00
6/17/2019 3.00
6/18/2019 3.00
6/21/2019 2.00
6/26/2019 2.00

Scott Decker 19.00
6/2/2019 2.00
6/3/2019 1.00
6/4/2019 2.00
6/5/2019 1.00
6/10/2019 2.00
6/11/2019 2.50
6/17/2019 2.00
6/18/2019 1.00
6/20/2019 1.00
6/21/2019 2.50
6/27/2019 1.00
6/28/2019 1.00

Sodiqa Williams 17.00
6/3/2019 1.50
6/4/2019 1.00
6/10/2019 1.50
6/12/2019 2.00



6/14/2019 1.00
6/17/2019 2.00
6/19/2019 1.00
6/21/2019 2.50
6/24/2019 1.50
6/25/2019 3.00

Tammy Felix 14.50
6/4/2019 1.00
6/5/2019 1.50
6/14/2019 0.50
6/17/2019 1.50
6/19/2019 2.00
6/20/2019 2.00
6/21/2019 2.00
6/24/2019 2.00
6/25/2019 1.00
6/27/2019 1.00

Titilola Omotoye 1.00
6/20/2019 1.00

Tom Christoff 25.50
6/5/2019 1.00
6/10/2019 1.50
6/11/2019 2.75
6/14/2019 1.50
6/17/2019 2.25
6/19/2019 1.00
6/20/2019 4.00
6/21/2019 3.25
6/24/2019 1.25
6/25/2019 4.00
6/28/2019 0.50

Umair Tarbhai 20.50
6/4/2019 4.00
6/6/2019 0.50
6/7/2019 6.00
6/17/2019 3.00
6/18/2019 3.00
6/21/2019 2.00
6/26/2019 2.00

Vivian Elliott 30.50
6/4/2019 3.00
6/5/2019 4.00
6/6/2019 4.00
6/7/2019 5.00
6/10/2019 2.00
6/11/2019 0.50
6/12/2019 0.50



6/14/2019 1.00
6/19/2019 1.00
6/20/2019 3.00
6/21/2019 3.00
6/24/2019 0.50
6/26/2019 1.00
6/27/2019 2.00

Grand Total 546.70



Contractor Name Month/Year Date Description of Labor Hours

Christopher Sun June 2019 6/3/2019 Review materials in preparation for Command Channel Policy Review Call on 6/4 (SO-08-01-03) 0.50
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/4/2019 Command Channel Policy Review Call (SO-08-01-03) 1.00
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/4/2019 Organize and clean notes from Command Channel Policy Review Call (SO-08-01-03) 0.50
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/5/2019 Monitoring Website Setup for Feedback Form E-mails 1.75
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/5/2019 Coordinating upcoming meetings and documents with Chief Medlock 0.25
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/6/2019 Review of SO-08-01-03 Additional Documentation Provided by CPD 1.00
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/6/2019 SO-08-01-03 Follow-Up Call with CPD 1.50
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/10/2019 Finalizing notes from SO-08-01-03 Call with CPD 0.75
Christopher Sun June 2019 6/10/2019 Travel arrangements for July IMT site visit 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/2/2019 IMT Weekly Meeting 1.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/6/2019 Village Leadership Academy 2.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/10/2019 IMT Weekly Meeting 1.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/14/2019 IMT Community Meeting Planning Session 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/17/2019 IMT Weekly Meeting 1.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/19/2019 IMT Community Meeting Planning Session 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/19/2019 IMT Walk Through Agenda For Community Meeting 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Call RE: Anticipated Questions for Community Meeting 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 IMT Update Call 1.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/24/2019 IMT Weekly Meeting 1.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/25/2019 IMT Quarterly Community Meeting 5.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/20/2019 Calls to book ASL interpreter 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Calls to book Spanish interpreter 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Efforts to book drummers 2.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/1/2019 Emails 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/3/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning, press review, emails 0.45
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/4/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning, emails 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/5/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/5/2019 Website material review 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/5/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning 0.75
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/6/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/9/2019 Emails and document review 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/10/2019 Emails 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/11/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning,  emails 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/11/2019 Document  Review 2.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/12/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/13/2019 Flier distribution 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/13/2019 FaceBook event page set-up 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/17/2019 Material Review for Quarterly Community Event/space contract, emails 1.00
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/17/2019 Call with Maggie re: press and media advisories 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/18/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/18/2019 Agenda and planning for Quarterly Community Event 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/19/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/20/2019 Emails 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/20/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/20/2019 Contract, insurance for venue 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Quarterly Community Event planning: marquee, slides, note takers 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Press message review for Quarterly Community Event 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/21/2019 Contacts to Laura M 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/22/2019 Quarterly Community Event  closing planning 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/24/2019 Emails and document review 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/25/2019 Emails 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/25/2019 Contract payment for event 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/26/2019 Emails 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/26/2019 Notes reviewed and follow-up with KKC about event 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/27/2019 Social media follow-up and media review 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/27/2019 Search and calls for next Quarterly Community Event planning 0.50
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/27/2019 Emails 0.25
Elena Quintana June 2019 6/28/2019 Emails and meeting prep for July IMT meeting 0.25
James Coldren June 2019 6/3/2019 Community Engagement Team weekly meeting and follow up 2.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/4/2019 Follow up to CET meeting 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/5/2019 Monitoring Leadership Team weekly meeting 1.50
James Coldren June 2019 6/10/2019 Community Engagement Team weekly meeting and follow up 2.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/10/2019 Phone call with Monitor 0.50
James Coldren June 2019 6/10/2019 Prepare for 6/25 community forum 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/11/2019 Prepare for and participate in monthly call with consent decree parties 3.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/12/2019 Prepare for 6/25 community forum 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/14/2019 Community Engagement Team call regarding 6/25 community meeting 1.50



James Coldren June 2019 6/14/2019 IMT  leadership meeting to discuss media strategy 1.50
James Coldren June 2019 6/16/2019 Meeting with Assoc. Monitor Steve Rickman 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/19/2019 Weekly IMT leadership meeting 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/19/2019 Meeting with Communty Engagement Team re: 6/25 meeting 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/19/2019 Meeting with CPD regarding community policing data request 1.50

James Coldren June 2019 6/19/2019 Meeting with community engagement team and IMT leadership team re: 6/25 community forum 1.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with IMT team and consent decree parties regarding methodology 3.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting with community engagement team re: 6/25 community forum 1.00

James Coldren June 2019 6/24/2019 Meeting with community engagement team and IMT leadership team re: 6/25 community forum 2.00
James Coldren June 2019 6/27/2019 Meeting to dicuss media strategy 1.50
James Coldren June 2019 6/18/2019 Prepare for and participate in methodology meeting with consent decree parties 2.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/1/2019 IMT CET Weekly Conference call 1.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/4/2019 CET Conference call to plan quarterly community meeting 1.00
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/6/2019 Contract discussion with NORC 0.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/10/2019 IMT CET Weekly Conference Call 1.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/11/2019 Meeting and walkthrough of meeting space at Kennedy King 1.00
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/14/2019 Chicago CET call to plan quarterly community meeting 1.00
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/17/2019 IMT CET Weekly Conference Call 1.50

Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/19/2019
Chicago CET call to walkthrough agenda of quarterly community
meeting 1.00

Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/21/2019 IMT Monthly CET Update Call [Full Team] 1.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/21/2019 Chicago CET call to prep for anticipated questions 1.00
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/24/2019 Call with Chip, Laura, and Vivian to discuss NORC contract 0.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/24/2019 IMT CET Weekly Conference Call 1.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/25/2019 IMT Quarterly Community Meeting 1.50
Joseph Hoereth June 2019 6/26/2019 Call with Elucd to discuss survey 1.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/3/2019 CET weekly meeting 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/4/2019 clean CET and community meeting notes 2.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/4/2019 CET website development and organization 2.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/5/2019 IMT internal group meeting 1.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/5/2019 IMT leadership meeting 1.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/5/2019 Website development and site visit preparation 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/6/2019 Website development 3.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/7/2019 Website development, IMT document development, note cleanup 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/10/2019 CET Meeting 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/10/2019 SharePoint Development, IMT Material Prep and Development 3.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/10/2019 Chicago Events List 0.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/11/2019 Chicago Flyer Edit, Meeting PowerPoint development, Chicago events list 2.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/12/2019 Chicago Leadership meeting, changes to community flyer, Scheduling CET meeting 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/13/2019 SharePoint Development, IMT meeting Prep 1.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/14/2019 CET Community Meeting planning 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/14/2019 Meeting document development; SharePoint management 0.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/17/2019 CET Meeting; Meeting follow items 2.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/18/2019 CET SharePoint development; CET correspondence, July meeting planning 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/19/2019 CET meeting planning call 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/19/2019 CET leadership call 0.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/19/2019 CET meeting note cleanup and sharepoint setup 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting preparation, site correspondence organization 0.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/21/2019 IMT monthly meeting 1.50
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/21/2019 Note cleanup, CET meeting preparation 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/24/2019 CET weekly meeting 2.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/26/2019 CET leadership call 1.00
Keri Richardson June 2019 6/28/2019 IMT document review and Adminsitrative setup 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/3/2019 Weekly CET conference call 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/3/2019 Plan IMR site visit 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/4/2019 IMT conference call on use of force 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/4/2019 Conference call with Parties on Command Channel Review 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/4/2019 CPD policy review coordination 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/5/2019 Weekly IMT meeting with Monitor and Deputy Monitors 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/5/2019 CNA team conference call re: staffing / hours 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/5/2019 CPD kickoff presentation: Crisis Intervention Team 2.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/5/2019 CPD kickoff presentation: Supervision 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/5/2019 CPD policy review coordination 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/6/2019 Conference call with Parties re: Command Channel Review policy 2.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019 Observe pre-service Sergeants' field training in District 9 station 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019 Observe pre-service Sergeants' field training in District 9 - ride along 4.00



Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019
Observe pre-service Sergeants' field training in District 9 - outdoor community meeting "clean 
sweep" 1.00

Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019 July site visit scheduling requests template 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019 IMT review deadlines template 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/7/2019 IMT data requests 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/10/2019 City/Monitor check-in call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/10/2019 IMT leadership call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/10/2019 Call re: marketing with Schiff and CNA   0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/10/2019 Weekly CET conference call 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/10/2019 CPD policy review coordination 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/11/2019 Monthly 668 meeting with Parties 2.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/11/2019 Meeting with Associate Monitor Julie Solomon 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/11/2019 Prep for Associate Monitor visit 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/11/2019 IMT data requests 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/11/2019 IMR-1 planning 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/12/2019 Weekly meeting with Monitor and Deputy Monitors 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/12/2019 Attend and observe CPD/Crime Lab Officer Wellness Summit (am) 3.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/12/2019 Meeting with OAG re: data requests/methodology 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/12/2019 Attend and observe CPD/Crime Lab Officer Wellness Summit (pm) 3.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/12/2019 Meeteing with Assoc. Monitors Will Johnson and Julie Solomon 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/13/2019 Attend and observe Day 2 of CPD/Crime Lab Officer Wellness Summit (am) 4.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/13/2019 Attend and observe Day 2 of CPD/Crime Lab Officer Wellness Summit (pm) 3.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/13/2019 IMT data requests 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/13/2019 Meeting with Associate Monitors Will Johnson and Julie Solomon 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/14/2019 Call with City/CPD re: data request 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/14/2019 Call with CET re: upcoming community meetings 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/14/2019 Call re: marketing with Schiff and CNA   1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/16/2019 Planning for IMR-1 and July site visit 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/17/2019 City/Monitor check-in call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/17/2019 OAG-IMT call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/17/2019 Weekly CET conference call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/17/2019 Call with Parties re: Sgt/Lt Field Training 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/17/2019 Planning for July site visit 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/18/2019 Meeting with Parties re: data requests / methodology 3.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/18/2019 Call with Associate Monitor Steve Rickman 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/18/2019 Call with Associate Monitor Paul Evans 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/19/2019 Weekly call with Monitor and Deputy Monitors 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/19/2019 Call re: IMT document requests - community policing 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/19/2019 Call re: upcoming IMT community meeting 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Parties re: data requests / methodology 4.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Monitor Hickey, Deputy Monitor Monroe, and Associate Monitor Medlock 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Police Board / Deputy Monitor, Associate Monitor 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Deputy Monitor Monroe and Associate Monitor Medlock 3.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/21/2019 Monthly IMT conference call 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/21/2019 Call with Parties re: foot pursuits 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/21/2019 Call with CET re: upcoming community meeting prep 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/24/2019 City/Monitor check-in call 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/24/2019 Communtiy meeting prep 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/24/2019 Discuss NORC subcontract for community surveys 0.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/24/2019 Weekly CET conference call 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/25/2019 Meet with policing project 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/25/2019 Community meeting at Kennedy King College 2.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/25/2019 Community meeting prep 2.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/26/2019 Weekly call with Monitor and Deputy Monitors 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/26/2019 Responses for emails coming in through IMT website 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/26/2019 Updates to IMT SharePoint 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 Attend and observe COPA transparency training 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 Call with Parties re: FOID roll call 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 Call with Parties re: COPA training 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 CET conference call 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 Planning for July site visit 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/27/2019 Community engagement team support 1.50
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/28/2019 Bi-weekly call with Parties re: Training 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/28/2019 Call with City/CPD re: July site visit scheduling 1.00
Laura Kunard June 2019 6/28/2019 Site visit meeting requests - updates 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/3/2019 Community Engagement Team Meeting to discuss specifics of the first quarterly meetings 1.50



Laura McElroy June 2019 6/9/2019 Began developing a draft news release on the IMT's first quarterly meeting 2.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/10/2019

 9:00 am - 12:00 pm
Continued drafting a news release on the first quarterly meeting and release of the first year 
monitoring plan. 3.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/10/2019

 4:00 pm - 5:30 pm ET
Community Engagement Team meeting to discuss location, time of the first quarterly meeting, 
discussed publicizing the event and logistics from the menu to comment cards, speakers, fact sheet, 
etc. 1.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/11/2019 Synchronized edits to the news release from team members and provided to CNA 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/14/2019
 12:00 pm - 1:00pm
Follow up Community Engagement Team meeting to discuss specifics of the quarterly meeting, 1.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/14/2019
 3:00 pm- 4:00 pm
Communications meeting to discuss promoting the first quarterly meeting 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/14/2019
 4:30pm
Began developing one-pager on how to contact the Independent Monitoring Team 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/15/2019
Finalized one-pager on how to contact the Independent Monitoring Team, distributed to CET team 
members and made suggested edits from the team 1.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/15/2019 Set up CPD email after multiple emails and issues with the password and email not working 0.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/16/2019
Converted emails of 120 legislators to the proper format and set up groups for distributing the 
quarterly meeting invite. 3.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/17/2019 Drafted invite options for legislators and shared with the leadership group for feedback. 0.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/17/2019 Community Engagement Team Meeting to discuss specifics of the first quarterly meetings 1.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/17/2019 Developed media logistics checklist for the quarterly meeting. 3.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/18/2019 Sent out a meeting invitation to multiple groups of legislators. 0.50

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/19/2019 Researched undeliverable emails of legislators and resent emails 0.75

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/19/2019 Participated in the walkthrough conference call to finalize logistics of the first monitor meeting. 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/21/2019
Full IMT Call to update the team on CET plans for the quarterly meeting. Discuss the July site visit 
and receive updates on other team members progress on data requests. 1.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/18/2019
Email correspondence and phone call with Linda Yun regarding media coverage of the first public 
meeting. 0.75

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/20/2019 Developed possible media Q & A in preparation for the quarterly meeting. 3.00

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/21/2019
Call with local CET team members to review possible media Q & A and ensure the material is 
comprehensive. Also reviewed the final logistics of the meeting. 1.25

Laura McElroy June 2019 6/30/2019
Daily monitoring of Chicago local news and social media discussion about the Chicago Police 
Department and reform efforts 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/3/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts
mandated to be studied by consent decree 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/3/2019

Survey design preparation: synthesize and document categorization
work that will be used to define concepts and support the selection of
survey questions 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/4/2019
Sampling design preparation: process and create tables using
investigatory stops data 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/5/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/6/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00



Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/6/2019
Participate in call on Sample Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 0.50

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/7/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts
mandated to be studied by consent decree 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/10/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/11/2019
Sampling design preparation: explore and compute measures of
internal consistency for the police contact composite measure 3.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/11/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts
mandated to be studied by consent decree 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/13/2019
Sampling design preparation: explore and compute measures of
internal consistency for the police contact composite measure 4.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/14/2019
Sampling design preparation: explore and compute measures of
internal consistency for the police contact composite measure 4.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/17/2019
Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Project Management and
Timeline 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/17/2019
Survey design preparation: Internal and external feedback process
design 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/18/2019
Survey design preparation: draft comprehensive list of survey
measures 3.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/19/2019
Survey design preparation: draft comprehensive list of survey
measures 3.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/19/2019
Survey design preparation: Build Qualtrics survey for the Internal
feedback process 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/20/2019
Survey design preparation: solicit and incorporate feedback on survey
measures and feedback process 2.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Survey Feedback Process 2.00
Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/21/2019 Survey design preparation: incorporate feedback on feedback process 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/25/2019
Survey design preparation: solicit and incorporate feedback on survey
measures and feedback process 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/25/2019
Survey design preparation: Update Qualtrics survey for the Internal
feedback process 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call on Study Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call with Elucd, Sabih Khan and IPCE Research Team on
Elucd's methodology 1.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/27/2019
Survey design preparation: Update Qualtrics survey for the Internal
feedback process 3.00

Matthew Sweeney June 2019 6/28/2019
Survey design preparation: Update Qualtrics survey for the Internal
feedback process 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/3/2019 Reviewed news articles written aboutour monitoring planand school resource officers 0.25
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/3/2019 Call with Harold Medlock to discuss Command Channel Review 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/3/2019 CET Conference call 1.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/4/2019 CC with CPD to discuss Command Channel Review process 1.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/4/2019 Reviewed Paul Evans update on use of deadly force review protocols 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/4/2019 Call with Paul Evans to discuss his review of Pointing of Firearm policies 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/4/2019
Call with Will Johnson to di.scu sshis concerns about upcoming site visit and request from CPD that 
he provide TTA during Officer Wellness Summit. 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/5/2019
Reviewed CPD SOP FRU Review of Pointing of Firearm and D19-01 Pointing of Firearm Training Guide 
for comments and review. 1.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/5/2019 IMT weekly CC 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/5/2019
Follow up call with Evans, Johnson and Medlock to discuss their final comments on Command 
Channel Review, Pointing of Firearms, and Wellness Summit. 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/5/2019 CC with CPD to discuss Supervision presentation 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/6/2019 Reviewed documents submitted by CPD on Command Channel Review process, January Audit 1.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/6/2019 Reviewed various CPD GO referencing Disciplinary Review Process 2.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/6/2019 CC with CPD to discuss Command Channel Review policy 1.25

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/6/2019 Call with Harold, Laura, and Anthony Ray to discuss our response to Command Channel call. 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/7/2019 Conducted another review CPD CCR Audit based on issues discussed on previous day CC 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/7/2019

Call with Harold Medlock to discuss unmet request for review of CCR policy, shared our notification 
letter to city extending our review
period. 0.25

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/7/2019 Initial reviewed methodology chart in prep for discussion with AG and City 1.25
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/10/2019 Reviewed Monitor website 0.50



Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/10/2019 CC with IMT team to discuss AG attendance, with IMT during wellness summit 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/10/2019 Call with Will to discuss having AG attend various meetings he will be hold ing during 6/14 site visit 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/10/2019 CET weekly call 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/11/2019 Reviewing and responding  to various emails 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/11/2019 Call with Medlock to discuss our site visit on the 20-21 0.25
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/12/2019 Reviewed documents submitted ref 336 presentation scheduled for next week. 1.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/12/2019 668 meeting cc 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 IMT CC 1.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Reviewed and submitted comments on Document request forwarded to parties. 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Reviewed CD to identify potential interview request for 6/20 site visit. 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019
Reviewed and discussed Harold's list of paragraphs he wants to identify persons to interview during 
upcoming site visit. 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Reviewed OIG report of SRO Audit, with attention to training update 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Reviewed COPA In Service Training plan and notes for upcoming meeting 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Call with Tina Anderson and Harold to identify persons to be interviewed during 6/20 site visit 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/13/2019 Developed questions and focus areas for various interviews scheduled during 6/20 site visit 2.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/14/2019
Reviewed the Fairley letter submitted as comments to the proposed rules changes submitted by 
Police Board 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/14/2019 CC with/ all parties to discuss document request 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/17/2019
Reviewed Policy Review Template submitted by Ariel, also added additional comments on Pointing 
of Firearm policy. 1.75

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/17/2019 CC w/ OAG to discuss various concerns, documents, and methodologies 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/17/2019 CC w/ CPD to discuss par 336 reference supervisory training 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/17/2019 Reviewed Lt Sgt and station sgt policies 1.25
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/18/2019 CC w/ Parties to discuss methodology 3.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/18/2019 Prepare and respond to various emails 1.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/19/2019 Weekly IMT Conference Call 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/19/2019 Travel to Chicago for site visit 2.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/19/2019 Reviewing of Command Channel policy and associated documents in preparation for site visit 1.75

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019 Conducted interviews with various COPA straff to discuss their operational procedures during OIS. 3.25

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019
Meeting w/Commander Godsel to discuss various processes associated with Office of Reform 
Management 1.25

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting w/Chief of BIA to discuss Command Channel review and associated policies. 2.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting w/ Information Technology to discuss new management system for tracking BIA cases 0.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019
Meeting w/ Police Board Executive Director and President to discuss training of Board member sand 
various aspects of Board operations rations 1.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Medlock and Kenard to discuss interviews conducted during 1st dayof site visit 2.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/20/2019 Meeting with Medlock and Kenard to discuss interviews conducted during 1st day of site visit 1.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting w/staff of Research and Development Division 1.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting w/ ORM and staff to discuss Foot Pursuit Training Bulletin 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting w/ Chief West to discuss the development of Foot Pursuit Policy 0.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/21/2019 Transcribed notes from various first day site visit interviews 2.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/21/2019 Travel from Chicago back to Charlotte 2.50
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/24/2019 Transcribed various notes from second day of site visit 2.00
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/24/2019 Reviewed and responded to various emails from IMT members 1.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/24/2019 Transcribed notes from 6/20-21 site visit 1.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/24/2019 Review policy task file submitted concerning command channel review 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/25/2019 Reviewed and responded to emails reference scheduling of presentations and Interviews 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/26/2019 IMT weekly conference call 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/27/2019 CC w/ OAG, COPA, IMT to discuss COPA training 0.75
Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/27/2019 Review of Training Needs Assessment 1.50

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/28/2019 CC with City, OAG, T, Maggie to discuss document request related to training needs assessment 1.00

Rodney Monroe June 2019 6/28/2019 Call with AM Paul Evans to discuss upcoming call with CPD to discuss Firearm Pointing g policy 0.50

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/3/2019

Survey design preparation: synthesize and document categorization
work that will be used to define concepts and support the selection of
survey questions 2.00



Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/5/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/6/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/6/2019
Participate in call on Sample Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 0.50

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/7/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/10/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts
mandated to be studied by consent decree 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/11/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members,
categorize over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by 
consent decree 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/17/2019
Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Project Management and
Timeline 1.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/17/2019
Survey design preparation: Internal and external feedback process
design 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/18/2019
Survey design preparation: draft comprehensive list of survey
measures 3.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Survey Feedback Process 2.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call on Study Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 1.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call with Elucd, Sabih Khan and IPCE Research Team on
Elucd's methodology 1.00

Roy Rothschild June 2019 6/3/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members, finalize
categorization of over 700 potential survey questions based on
concepts mandated to be studied by consent decree 1.00

Scott Decker June 2019 6/3/2019 Review Data Plan 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/4/2019 Develop Data Collection plan for Paragraphs 572 574 578 579 580 594 595 598 608 2.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/5/2019 Respond to IMT email 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/10/2019 Review Request  CPD Documents for Data Access plan 2.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/11/2019 Re-Read Consent Decree for areas of data analysis 2.50
Scott Decker June 2019 6/17/2019 Assess CPD responsibility for data release, formatting and analysisl 2.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/18/2019 Familiarize with Tableau 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/20/2019 Review Use of Force Paragraphs 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/21/2019 IMT Update Phone Call 1.50
Scott Decker June 2019 6/21/2019 Follow up to IMT Update Call with Dr. Kunard re Data Analysis 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/27/2019 IMT and CPD Conference Call regarding Data Analysis 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/28/2019 Follow up with  Dr. Christoff regarding data analysis 1.00
Scott Decker June 2019 6/2/2019 Data Analysis Plan; develop key questions 2.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/3/2019 Chicago IMT Community Engagement Team Call 1.50
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/4/2019 Call with CET Members 1.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/10/2019 Chicago IMT Community Engagement Team Call 1.50
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/12/2019 Meeting with Austin Coming Together - Community outreach 2.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/14/2019 Chicago IMT CET - Community Meeting Planning 1.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/17/2019 Chicago IMT Community Engagement Team Call 2.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/19/2019 Chicago IMT CET Quarterly Community Meeting Planning 1.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/21/2019 Chicago IMT Update Call 1.50
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/21/2019 CET Call re: anticipated questions 1.00
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/24/2019 Chicago IMT Community Engagement Team Call 1.50
Sodiqa Williams June 2019 6/25/2019 IMT Quarterly Community Meeting 3.00
Tammy Felix June 2019 6/4/2019 Reviewed revised draft monitor plan and spoke with AM for Community Engagement. 1.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/5/2019
Participated in the Chicago Police Department's presentation on Supervision. Additional time spent 
to prep for the meeting and to clean up notes taken during. 1.50

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/17/2019

Had a coordination call with AM Johnson to review Officer Wellness Summit and to discuss taskings 
for the week of 6/17. AM has requested analyst support in reviewing shared documents on 
Sharepoint and in reviewing the Wellness-related CPD briefings. 1.50

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/19/2019

Reviewd IMR plan specifically as it related to Officer Wellness and Support, at direction of AM 
Johnson. Looking to pull together a source list of referenced policies, plans, and data tracking 
sources. 2.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/20/2019
Continued work to identify sources and metrics for Officer Wellness and Support, and participated in 
internal IMT call. 2.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/21/2019
Continued work to identify sources and metrics for Officer Wellness and Support, and participated in 
internal IMT call. 2.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/24/2019 Continued work to identify sources and metrics for Officer Wellness and Support. 2.00



Tammy Felix June 2019 6/25/2019 Continued work to identify sources and metrics for Officer Wellness and Support. 1.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/27/2019
Continued work to identify sources and metrics for Officer Wellness and Support. Also discussed site 
visit needs with both Associate Monitors. 1.00

Tammy Felix June 2019 6/14/2019 Made travel arrangements for July site visit. 0.50
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/5/2019 Participate in CPD presentation regarding CIT 1.00
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/10/2019 CET weekly meeting 1.50

Tom Christoff June 2019 6/11/2019
Meeting with Crisis Intervention Associate Monitor and CPD Lt. regarding Crisis Intervention Team 
program 2.75

Tom Christoff June 2019 6/14/2019 CET meeting regarding community meeting planning 1.50
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/17/2019 CET weekly meeting 1.00
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/17/2019 Prepare one-page informational sheet and PPT slides for CET quarterly meeting 1.25
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/19/2019 CET meeting regarding first quarterly meeting agenda 1.00

Tom Christoff June 2019 6/20/2019 Prepare notes documents for use of force, accountability, and data systems presentations from CPD 4.00
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/21/2019 Entire IMT meeting 1.50
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/21/2019 Review survey document and provide comments. 0.75
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/21/2019 CET meeting regarding anticipated questions for quarterly meeting 1.00

Tom Christoff June 2019 6/24/2019
Prepare draft office hours location and month distribution proposal.  Provide to deputy monitor in 
email. 1.25

Tom Christoff June 2019 6/25/2019 CET First Quarterly Presentation. 4.00
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/26/2019 Prepare notes from all tables at CET First Quarterly Presentation 2.50
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/28/2019 Review community survey item feedback survey.  Provide notes and suggestions. 0.25
Tom Christoff June 2019 6/28/2019 Prepare correspondence to I Grow Chicago represenatative.  Send via text. 0.25

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/4/2019

Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members, analyze
over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to
be studied by consent decree 4.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/6/2019
Participate in call on Sample Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 0.50

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/7/2019
Survey design preparation: with IPCE Research team members, analyze
over 700 potential survey questions based on concepts mandated to be studied by consent decree 6.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/17/2019
Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Project Management and
Timeline 1.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/17/2019
Survey design preparation: Internal and external feedback process
design 2.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/18/2019
Survey design preparation: draft comprehensive list of survey
measures 3.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/21/2019 Meeting with IPCE Research Team on Survey Feedback Process 2.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call on Study Design with NORC and the IPCE research
team 1.00

Umair Tarbhai June 2019 6/26/2019
Participate in call with Elucd, Sabih Khan and IPCE Research Team on
Elucd's methodology 1.00

Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/4/2019 Call with Project Director on UOF sections and project activities. 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/4/2019 Review formal request process for documents provided by SH 0.25
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/4/2019 CPD IMT website development 0.75
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/4/2019 Review of other department pointing firearm policies for AM Paul Evans 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/5/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT leadership call 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/5/2019 Weekly Chicago CNA team call 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/5/2019 CPD IMT website development 2.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/6/2019 CPD IMT website development 2.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/6/2019 Assisted IMT team members with Sharepoint 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/6/2019 Worked on data call for UOF section with AM Paul Evan 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/7/2019 Call with AM Paul Evans to discuss UOF IMT activities 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/7/2019 CPD IMT website development 4.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/10/2019 Weekly Chicago CET team call 2.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/11/2019 Compiled and sent materials to AM Paul Evans from Sharepoint sites 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/12/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT leadership call 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/14/2019 Chicago IMT poroject marketing/social media call 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/19/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT leadership call 1.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/20/2019 Call with AM Scott Decker to set up IMT email and Sharepoint 0.50

Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/20/2019 Call with Anthony-Ray to prepare webinar presentations on SharePoint sites for 6/21 IMT call 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/20/2019 Monitoring Methodology discussion, participated via conference call 2.00
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/21/2019 Chicago IMT monthly team call 1.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/21/2019 IMT/OAG/CPD Initial Call p.170 (foor pursuit bulletin) 1.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/24/2019 Call with UIC to discuss subcontract with NORC 0.50
Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/26/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT leadership call 1.00

Vivian Elliott June 2019 6/27/2019 Review of foot pursuit bulletin and call with OAG  re CPD Foot Pursuit Supplemental Training Bulletin 2.00



Titilola Omotoye May 2019 6/20/2019 Updated the EAC spreadsheet with actuals hours and other costs 1.00





From: American Airlines no-rep y@not fy.ema .aa.com
Subject: Your tr p confirmat on-XHWEDF 19JUN

Date: June 7, 2019 at 6:15 PM
To:

 
 

 
Hello Rodney Monroe! Issued: Jun 7, 2019

 

 

Your trip confirmation and receipt
 

 
Record locator: 

 
                     Manage Your Trip                    

 

 

 

Wednesday, June 19, 2019

CLT   ORD 
 

6:15 PM
 

7:40 PM
Charlotte Chicago O'hare
 

American Airlines 2488 

Seats: 13C
Class: Economy (V)
Meals:

 
Free entertainment with the American app »

 

Friday, June 21, 2019

ORD   CLT 
  

Seats: 8F
Cl E  

SanchezA
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o-rep y@not fy.ema 

XHWEDF 19JUN



 

 

 

Your trip receipt
 
 

     American Express 

 
Rodney Monroe
 
FARE-USD $ 513.49
 

TAXES AND CARRIER-IMPOSED FEES $ 65.61
 

TICKET TOTAL $ 579.10
 

 
 

Hotel offers Car rental offers

 

Buy trip insurance SuperShuttle

 

 
 
 

 

4:09 PM
  

7:11 PM
Chicago O'hare Charlotte
 

American Airlines 583 

Class: Economy (L)
Meals:

Rodney Monroe AAdvantage # 
 

Ticket # 
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From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [Bus ness] Your Thursday morn ng tr p w th Uber

Date: June 20, 2019 at 8:55 AM
To:

Total: $19.17
Thu, Jun 20, 2019

We hope you enjoyed your ride this
morning.

Thanks for riding, Rodney

Switch

  

  

Total $19.17

Trip Fare $15.51

Subtotal $15.51

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $3.66

Amount Charged  

$19.17
NU O M
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From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [Bus ness] Your Fr day morn ng tr p w th Uber

Date: June 21, 2019 at 10:28 AM
To:

Total: $13.97
Fri, Jun 21, 2019

We hope you enjoyed your ride this
morning.

Thanks for riding, Rodney

Switch

  

  

Total $13.97

Trip Fare $10.31

Subtotal $10.31

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $3.66

Amount Charged  

$13.97
NU O M
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From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [Bus ness] Your Fr day morn ng tr p w th Uber

Date: June 21, 2019 at 1:46 PM
To:

Total: $54.18
Fri, Jun 21, 2019

We hope you enjoyed your ride this
morning.

Thanks for riding, Rodney

Switch

  

  

Total $54.18

Trip Fare $46.63

Subtotal $46.63

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $7.55

Amount Charged  

$54.18
NU O M
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HILTON GARDEN INN - CHICAGO DOWNTOWN 
SOUTH LOOP

55 E. 11TH STREET

CHICAGO, IL  60605     

United States of America

TELEPHONE 312-753-3100    • FAX 312-753-3101   

Reservations

www.hilton.com or 1 800 HILTONS

Medlock, Harold  Room No:      

Arrival Date: 6/19/2019  9:34:00 PM 

Departure Date: 6/21/2019  

Adult/Child: 1/0

     Cashier ID: BRPR

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA Room Rate: 204.82

AL:

HH #

VAT #

Folio No/Che

Confirmation Number: 3127272190

HILTON GARDEN INN - CHICAGO DOWNTOWN SOUTH LOOP 6/21/2019 
2:52:00 AM

DATE DESCRIPTION ID REF NO CHARGES CREDIT BALANCE

6/19/2019 GUEST ROOM BRPR 39127 $204.82

6/19/2019 RM -STATE TAX 4.5% BRPR 39127 $9.22

6/19/2019 RM -CITY TAX 11.9% BRPR 39127 $24.37

6/19/2019 RM -COUNTY TAX 1% BRPR 39127 $2.05

6/20/2019 GUEST ROOM BRPR 39430 $204.82

6/20/2019 RM -STATE TAX 4.5% BRPR 39430 $9.22

6/20/2019 RM -CITY TAX 11.9% BRPR 39430 $24.37

6/20/2019 RM -COUNTY TAX 1% BRPR 39430 $2.05

WILL BE SETTLED TO VS*4151 $480.92 

EFFECTIVE BALANCE OF $0.00 

Page:1
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