Sc h I ff Schiff Hardin LLP

Hardin 233 South Wacker Drive

Suite 7100
Chicago, lllinois 60606

T 312.258.5500
F 312.258.5600

schiffhardin.com

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involving the May 31, 2019
Chicago Police Department Invoice # 2353309
Matter # 51895-0000

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
THROUGH April 30, 2019 in connection with

CPD Monitor

Total Fees $79.,963.75
Total Disbursements/Charges $94.217.56
Total Current Invoice $174.181.31
Previous Balance from Last Billing Period $276,809.73
Less Payments Since Last Billing Period $0.00
Total Amount Due $450.991.04
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Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309

FOR OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH
April 30, 2019 in connection with CPD Monitor

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/2/19  Anthony- Call with CNA Vivian Elliott .50 395.00 197.50
Ray regarding compliance with the City of
Sepulveda Chicago's Travel Guidelines

4/2/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for .50 395.00 197.50
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/2/19  Anthony- Email to parties of the Consent 25 395.00 98.75
Ray Decree (the City of Chicago, the

Sepulveda Chicago Police Department, and the
Ilinois Attorney General's Office)
regarding SharePoint Extranet access
and instructions

4/2/19  Maggie  Review options and plan for 3.25 500.00 1,625.00
Hickey document management of the
Independent Monitoring Team
4/3/19  Anthony- Meeting with Maggie Hickey, 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray Rodney Monroe, CNA Laura Kunard,

Sepulveda and CNA Chip Coldren regarding the
City of Chicago's Proposed Protocols
for Monitor Access

4/3/19  Anthony- Consulting with Schiff Hardin's Chief .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Technology Officer regarding the
Sepulveda City of Chicago's Proposed Protocols
for Monitor Access
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HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/3/19  Anthony- First meeting with CNA's Laura 75 395.00 296.25
Ray Kunard and Vivian Elliott regarding
Sepulveda document sharing and compliance
with Consent Decree

4/3/19  Anthony- Second meeting with CNA's Laura .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Kunard and Vivian Elliott regarding
Sepulveda document sharing and compliance
with Consent Decree

4/3/19  Derek G. Review CPD consent decree .75 450.00 337.50
Barella materials.

4/3/19  Ryan Communicate with A. Sepulveda re .25 330.00 82.50
Darby providing technical assistance

regarding the collection of documents
and data by the police department and
consulting on the presentation of that
data for our review

4/3/19  Maggie  Plan and prepare monitoring team for 4.50 500.00 2,250.00
Hickey drafting of monitoring plan; executive
leadership telephone conference to
coordinate direction of team

4/4/19  Anthony- Preparing for Relativity meeting with .50 395.00 197.50
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/4/19  Anthony- Drafting and sending Preliminary 2.25 395.00 888.75
Ray Data Request
Sepulveda
4/4/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for .50 395.00 197.50
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

FEDERAL TAX m_ Page 3 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.



Schi
Haflfdin

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/4/19  Anthony- Reviewing the City of Chicago's 25 395.00 98.75
Ray Proposed Protocols for Monitor
Sepulveda Access

4/4/19  Anthony- Call with the parties to the Consent 1.50 395.00 592.50
Ray Decree (the City of Chicago, the

Sepulveda Chicago Police Department, and the
Ilinois Attorney General's Office)
regarding the City of Chicago's
Proposed Protocols for Monitor

Access
4/4/19 Derek G. Review CPD consent decree .50 450.00 225.00
Barella materials.
4/4/19  Maggie  Conference call with parties 5.25 500.00 2,625.00

Hickey regarding draft protocols; research,
review and gather materials for team
for drafting of first year monitoring
plan; review and discussion of
methods of document retention

technology.
4/4/19  Ryan Communicate with case team re .50 330.00 165.00
Darby logistics for a follow up meeting with
members of the IT department for the
CPD
4/5/19  Anthony- Research for the Monitoring Plan 25 395.00 98.75
Ray regarding Communities United v.
Sepulveda City of Chicago
4/5/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 25 395.00 98.75
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police

Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)
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HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/5/19  Anthony- Preparing for Relativity meeting with 75 395.00 296.25
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

4/5/19  Maggie  Review and research for draft 4.50 500.00 2,250.00
Hickey protocols; and coordinate with
leadership team regarding drafting of
the monitoring plan.

4/8/19  Maggie  Prepare for and meet with Coalition 3.75 500.00 1,875.00
Hickey member and their attorneys.

4/8/19  Derek G. Review CPD consent decree .50 450.00 225.00
Barella materials.

4/8/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 1.25 395.00 493.75
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

4/8/19  Ryan Communicate with A. Sepulveda re .25 330.00 82.50
Darby upcoming call with the City to
discuss data preservation and

collection
4/9/19  Anthony- Preparation for Relativity meeting 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray with the parties to the Consent Decree

Sepulveda (the City of Chicago, the Chicago
Police Department, and the Illinois
Attorney General's Office)

4/9/19  Maggie  Plan and prepare for a social media 2.75 500.00 1,375.00
Hickey strategy for Community Engagement
and talking points to educate
community regarding Consent
Decree.
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HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/9/19  Anthony- Preparing for next eDiscovery 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray meeting with the parties to the
Sepulveda Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

4/9/19  Maggie  Discuss and plan for document 2.25 500.00 1,125.00
Hickey transfers from CPD; re same for

document sharing amongst City.
CPD, AG and Monitoring team;

review protocols.
4/9/19  Anthony- Reviewing potential changes to the 2.25 395.00 888.75
Ray City of Chicago's Proposed Protocols

Sepulveda for Monitor Access and preparing for
upcoming, corresponding meeting
with the parties to the Consent Decree
(the City of Chicago, the Chicago
Police Department, and the Illinois
Attorney General's Office)

4/9/19  Anthony- Communications with CNA and the 1.25 395.00 493.75
Ray City of Chicago regarding
Sepulveda compliance with the City of
Chicago's travel guidelines

4/9/19  Anthony- Meeting with the parties to the 1.25 395.00 493.75
Ray Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
Sepulveda the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)
regarding procedures for Relativity
and other forms of eDiscovery

4/9/19  Ariel R.  Met with the parties to discuss IT 1.50 360.00 540.00
Hairston  questions regarding data sharing and
information governance. After
meeting, discussed next steps with R.
Darby and A R. Sepulveda. Prepared
a summary of the meeting.
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4/9/19  Ryan Meet with A. Sepulveda to discuss 2.50 330.00 825.00

Darby matter background and prepare for
our upcoming call with the City of
Chicago and IL Attorney General's
office; review protocol documents
and document production index;
attend call with the City of Chicago
and IL Attorney General's office;
phone cal with A. Sepulveda and A.
Hairston to discuss results of the call
and follow up items

4/10/19 Anthony- Reviewing potential changes to the .25 395.00 98.75
Ray City of Chicago's proposed Protocols
Sepulveda for Monitor Access

4/10/19 Maggie  Research, development, draft and 3.75 500.00 1,875.00
Hickey revise First Year Monitoring Plan.

4/10/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for .25 395.00 98.75
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

4/10/19 Ryan Communicate with A. Sepulveda re .25 330.00 82.50
Darby costs related to potential hosting of
electronic documents

4/11/19 Maggie  Research, development, draft and 1.50 500.00 750.00
Hickey revise First Year Monitoring Plan.
4/11/19 Maggie  Prepare for and meet with experts 1.50 500.00 750.00

Hickey from the Policing Project in the 25th
District, Dr. Friedman, et al.

4/11/19 Maggie  Prepare for and telephone conference .75 500.00 375.00
Hickey  with Dr. Jeff Bernstein regarding
police promotional exams
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HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/11/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 3.75 395.00 1,481.25
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/11/19 Ryan Communicate with case team re 25 330.00 82.50
Darby logistics for upcoming meeting re
data collection
4/12/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 3.75 395.00 1,481.25
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)

4/12/19 Anthony- Research and development for .50 395.00 197.50
Ray guidelines for Associate Monitors
Sepulveda regarding monitoring plan.

4/12/19 Maggie  Research, development, draft and 1.50 500.00 750.00
Hickey revise First Year Monitoring Plan.

4/12/19 Maggie  Research, development, draft and 4.50 500.00 2,250.00
Hickey  revise First Year Monitoring Plan.

4/12/19 Anthony- Preparing GoToMeeting tests for the 25 395.00 98.75
Ray parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/12/19 Maggie  Meet with T. Dixon, C. Anderson and 1.25 500.00 625.00
Hickey Commander Godsel re refinement of
protocols.
4/12/19 Anthony- Preparing for next eDiscovery 25 395.00 98.75
Ray meeting with the parties to the

Sepulveda Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)
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4/12/19 Anthony- Meeting with Maggie Hickey, the 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray City of Chicago, and the Chicago
Sepulveda Police Department; and meeting

review

4/12/19 Anthony- Reviewing Monitor identification .25 395.00 98.75
Ray cards and corresponding
Sepulveda communications

4/12/19 Ryan Complete eDiscovery conflict form .25 330.00 82.50
Darby and coordinate with vendor to do a

conflict check in advance of hosting
data in Relativity for our review

4/15/19  Anthony- Preparation for GoToMeeting test 25 395.00 98.75
Ray conference with the parties to the
Sepulveda Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

4/15/19 Anthony- Research for Monitoring Plan and 1.50 395.00 592.50
Ray corresponding timelines
Sepulveda

4/15/19 Maggie  Coordination and review of materials 3.75 500.00 1,875.00

Hickey for first year draft monitoring plan;
review draft protocols; review file
sharing materials; plan for and review
calendar standing monthly and

quarterly meetings.
4/16/19 Anthony- Preparation for GoToMeeting .50 395.00 197.50
Ray conference with the parties to the

Sepulveda Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

4/16/19 Anthony- Meeting with the City of Chicago and .75 395.00 296.25
Ray the Illinois Attorney General's Office
Sepulveda regarding GoToMeeting test
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4/16/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 25 395.00 98.75
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

4/16/19 Maggie  Review research materials and data 3.75 500.00 1,875.00
Hickey for first year draft monitoring plan;
and review and respond to team
questions regarding first year draft

monitoring plan.
4/17/19 Anthony- Preparation for and corresponding 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray call with the parties to the Consent

Sepulveda Decree (the City of Chicago, the
Chicago Police Department, and the
Illinois Attorney General's Office)
regarding Chicago of Police
Department's data and Tableau

system
4/17/19  Anthony- Research for Monitoring Plan and 2.75 395.00 1,086.25
Ray corresponding meeting with the
Sepulveda Independent Monitoring Team
4/17/19 Anthony- Preparing for Consent Decree .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Paragraph 668 meeting with the

Sepulveda parties to the Consent Decree (the
City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office) and the
Superintendent Chicago Police
Department
4/17/19  Anthony- Call with Ryan Darby regarding .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Chicago Police Department's data and
Sepulveda Tableau system
4/17/19 Derek G. Review CPD consent decree 1.00 450.00 450.00

Barella materials.
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4/17/19 Maggie  Conference call with IG J. Ferguson; 3.25 500.00 1,625.00
Hickey conference call with leadership team
regarding draft first year monitoring
plan; review draft protocols and
monitoring materials; preparation for
first monthly meeting with Sup.
Johnson, et. al

4/17/19 Ryan Review notes from call with CPD and .50 330.00 165.00
Darby discuss issues related to data
preservation and collection with A.
Sepulveda
4/17/19 Ryan Conference all with representatives 1.00 330.00 330.00

Darby from the Chicago Police regarding
their IT environment, data retention
and collection procedures

4/18/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for .50 395.00 197.50
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/18/19  Anthony- Drafting memo for the Independent 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray Monitoring Team regarding Chicago
Sepulveda Police Department's data and Tableau
4/18/19  Anthony- Call with CNA Laura Kunard and 75 395.00 296.25
Ray Vivian Elliott regarding the City of

Sepulveda Chicago's updated Proposed
Protocols for Monitor Access

4/18/19 Derek G. Review CPD consent decree .50 450.00 225.00
Barella materials.
4/18/19 Maggie  Discussions and response to inquiries 1.25 500.00 625.00

Hickey  regarding draft monitoring plan.
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4/19/19 Anthony- Preparing for Consent Decree 75 395.00 296.25
Ray Paragraph 668 meeting with the
Sepulveda parties to the Consent Decree (the
City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office) and the
Superintendent Chicago Police
Department
4/19/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 3.00 395.00 1,185.00
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney
General's Office)

4/19/19 Ariel R.  Met with the team to discuss the 1.25 360.00 450.00
Hairston  monitor plan and updates related to
document management and the
community engagement team.

4/19/19 Anthony- Preparation for and corresponding 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray weekly Independent Monitoring
Sepulveda Team conference call

4/19/19 Derek G. Review CPD consent decree 1.50 450.00 675.00

Barella materials; participate in IMT update
conference call.

4/19/19 Maggie  Prepare for and lead conference call 2.75 500.00 1,375.00
Hickey with executive team, associate
monitors and rest of team regarding
draft monitoring plan and future sites

visits.
4/22/19 Anthony- Reviewing the City of Chicago's .25 395.00 98.75
Ray Proposed Protocols for Monitor

Sepulveda Access
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4/22/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 1.00 395.00 395.00
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/22/19 Anthony- Preparing for Paragraph 668 meeting .50 395.00 197.50
Ray with the Superintendent of the

Sepulveda Chicago Police Department and the
parties to the Consent Decree (the
City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/22/19 Maggie  Review and respond to inquiries 1.25 500.00 625.00
Hickey regarding draft first year monitoring
plan.
4/23/19 Maggie  Meet with Deputy Monitor Rodney 4.25 500.00 2,125.00
Hickey Monroe regarding Superintendent
meeting and draft First Year

Monitoring Plan; prepare for and
attend meeting with Superintendent
Johnson, CPD personnel , City staff,

and OAG staff.
4/23/19  Anthony- Correspondence with the Independent .75 395.00 296.25
Ray Monitoring Team regarding the

Sepulveda Paragraph 668 meeting with
Superintendent of the Chicago Police
Department and the parties to the
Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

FEDERAL TAX m:- Page 13 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.



Schi
Haflfdin

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309

HOURS RATE AMOUNT

4/23/19 Anthony- Preparing for Paragraph 668 meeting 1.00 395.00 395.00
Ray with Superintendent of the Chicago
Sepulveda Police Department and the parties to
the Consent Decree (the City of
Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/23/19 Anthony- Reviewing the City of Chicago's .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Proposed Protocols for Monitor
Sepulveda Access
4/23/19 Anthony- Paragraph 668 meeting with the 2.50 395.00 987.50
Ray Superintendent of the Chicago Police

Sepulveda Department and the parties to the
Consent Decree (the City of Chicago,
the Chicago Police Department, and
the Illinois Attorney General's Office)

4/24/19 Maggie  Review Community Engagement 3.75 500.00 1,875.00
Hickey Plan; Conference call with OAG S.
Pryor and C. Wells and A. Sepulveda
and R. Monroe; and Review School
Resource Officer materials.

4/24/19 Anthony- Conference call with members of the 75 395.00 296.25
Ray Independent Monitoring Team and
Sepulveda the Illinois Attorney General's Office
4/24/19 Anthony- Preparation for call with the Illinois 25 395.00 98.75
Ray Attorney General's Office
Sepulveda
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4/24/19 Anthony- Developing Independent Monitoring 3.50 395.00 1,382.50
Ray Plan after the Paragraph 668 meeting
Sepulveda with the Superintendent of the
Chicago Police Department and the
parties to the Consent Decree (the
City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/24/19 Anthony- Correspondence with the Independent 1.00 395.00 395.00
Ray Monitoring Team regarding the

Sepulveda Chicago Bar Association's panel
regarding "Policing in Chicago Under
the Consent Decree" and research
regarding the Monitoring Plan

4/25/19 Maggie  Prepare for and conference call with 2.25 500.00 1,125.00
Hickey Deputy Monitors and A. Sepulveda
regarding analysis of protocols and
draft monitoring plan.

4/25/19  Anthony- Editing the City of Chicago's 1.25 395.00 493.75
Ray Proposed Protocols for Monitor
Sepulveda Access

4/25/19 Anthony- Meeting with the Independent 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray Monitoring Team
Sepulveda

4/26/19 Derek G. Review CPD consent decree .75 450.00 337.50
Barella materials.

4/26/19 Maggie  Meeting with T. Dixon, T. Anderson, 2.50 500.00 1,250.00

Hickey Commander Godsel and A.
Sepulveda regarding draft protocols,
deliverables within the First Year
Monitoring Plan.

4/26/19 Maggie  Plan and prepare for first year of 2.75 500.00 1,375.00
Hickey monitoring deadlines.
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4/26/19 Anthony- Meeting with the Independent 2.75 395.00 1,086.25
Ray Monitor and members of the City of
Sepulveda Chicago and Chicago Police
Department
4/26/19 Anthony- Correspondence with Independent .50 395.00 197.50
Ray Monitoring Team regarding

Sepulveda Monitoring Plan and meeting with the
City of Chicago and Chicago Police

Department
4/28/19 Anthony- Correspondence with members of the 25 395.00 98.75
Ray Independent Monitoring Team

Sepulveda regarding the City of Chicago's
Protocols for Monitor Access

4/29/19 Maggie  Review materials for First Year 4.50 500.00 2,250.00
Hickey Monitoring Plan; discussions with
Coalition members; correspondence
with GAPA lead; coordinate with
team to respond to outstanding issues
and development of monitoring plan

and methodology.
4/29/19 Maggie  Telephone conference with 1.00 500.00 500.00
Hickey Community Engagement Team
4/29/19  Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 2.25 395.00 888.75
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the

Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/29/19 Anthony- Correspondence with members of the 2.00 395.00 790.00
Ray Independent Monitoring Team
Sepulveda regarding the Monitoring Plan
4/29/19 Anthony- Meeting with Monitor and members 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray of the Independent Monitoring Team

Sepulveda regarding Monitoring Plan
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4/30/19 Maggie  Coordination and analysis of draft 4.25 500.00 2,125.00
Hickey monitoring plan; review plans for
website and office hours.

4/30/19 Anthony- Developing SharePoint Extranet for 2.75 395.00 1,086.25
Ray the parties to the Consent Decree (the
Sepulveda City of Chicago, the Chicago Police
Department, and the Illinois Attorney

General's Office)
4/30/19 Anthony- Correspondence with the Independent 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray Monitoring Team regarding the

Sepulveda Independent Monitoring Team's
Monitoring Plan

4/30/19 Anthony- Preparing for site visits and 1.75 395.00 691.25
Ray preliminary presentations by the
Sepulveda Chicago Police Department

4/30/19 Anthony- Research regarding Consent Decree .50 395.00 197.50
Ray deliverables from the Civilian Office
Sepulveda of Police Accountability

4/30/19 Anthony- Reviewing and researching for the 3.50 395.00 1,382.50
Ray Independent Monitoring Team's

Sepulveda Monitoring Plan

TOTAL FEES $79,963.75
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Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309
DISBURSEMENTS/CHARGES:
DATE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AMOUNT
04/25/19 Color Copies Sepulved USER DEFINED 1: Sepulved 20.00 13.00
04/23/19 Color Copies Sepulved USER DEFINED 1: Sepulved 101.00 65.65
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: 0 Sender: 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Julie Solomon,
Address:
argaret Hickey USER
DEFINED 2: (Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill Sender: 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Paul Evans,
SU Address:
Margaret Hickey USER
Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: Sender: 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Rodney Monroe,
Margaret Hickey
USER DEFINED 2 (Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Will Johnson
Margaret Hickey USER
Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/15/19 1.00 23.92
04/15/19 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey USER
Federal Monitor ID Badge)
FEDERAL TAX m_ Page 18 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.



Schiff

Hardin

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi

May 31, 2019

CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309
DATE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AMOUNT
04/16/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: Sender: 1.00 17.37

Margaret Hickey Recipient:
Margaret Hickey USER
Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/17/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: 1.00 16.28
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Vivian Elliott
Margaret Hickey USER DEFINED 2:
(Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/17/19 Delivery services/messengers Air Bill: Sender: 1.00 21.02
Margaret Hickey Recipient: Scott Decker,
: Margaret
9 (Federal Monitor ID
Badge)
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Invoice Number: 9169-116 USER 1.00 8.00
DEFINED 1: 9169-116 (Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/15/19 Delivery services/messengers Invoice Number: 9169-123 USER 1.00 8.00
DEFINED 1: 9169-123 (Federal Monitor ID Badge)
04/23/19 Duplicating and Binding Sepulved USER DEFINED 1: Sepulved 1.00 0.15
04/25/19 Duplicating and Binding Sepulved USER DEFINED 1: Sepulved 2.00 0.30
05/20/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: CNA CORPORATION, THE 1.00 76.961.74
CNA HOURS AND TRAVEL COSTS INCLUDE 461.5 HOURS
AND COSTS OF $1.610.83 TOTALING $76,961.74
05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: DENNIS P ROSENBAUM 1.00 5.000.00
FhERFRFFFPAY BY ACH****+*%++% NIONITORING 040119-
042219 40 HOURS
05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: JULIE SOLOMON 1.00 1.906.25
FhEFRERFIPAY BY ACH**##*%**+%% NIONITORING 040519-
042419 15.25 HOURS
05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: MEDLOCK ENTERPRISES 1.00 3.437.50
LLC MONITORING 041819-043019 27.5 HOURS
05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: PAUL F EVANS JR 1.00 1,031.25
FhEFRERFIPAY BY ACH**##*%**+%% NIONITORING 040419-
041919 8.25 HOURS
FEDERAL TAX ID: [ Page 19 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE

ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.



Schi
Haf{din

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309
DATE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY AMOUNT
05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: STEPHEN E RICKMAN 1.00 4,062.50

FEREFEFFPAY BY ACH***¥+*x%% NJONITORING 040119-
042919 32.25 HOURS

05/21/19 Professional Services - VENDOR: THERON L BOWMAN INC 1.00 250.00
FEREFFFFFPAY VIA AHCH*#HF*x¥+4%% MJONITORING 041819,
042419 2 HOURS

05/21/19 | Professional Services - VENDOR: WILBER DOYLE JOHNSON 1.00 1.062.50
[II ***kkxk5:4PAY BY ACH******kk%%% MONITORING
041419-043019 8.5 HOURS

04/25/19 Readyconference Plus Audio; total minutes 436 USER DEFINED 1.00 15.15
1: Anthony-Ray Sepulved

04/16/19 Readyconference Plus Audio; total minutes S0 USER DEFINED 1: 1.00 1.75
Anthony-Ray Sepulved

03/21/19 Travel Expenses (Except Meals) - VENDOR: THERON L 1.00 210.13
BOWMAN INC *¥*¥¥¥¥*¥*¥pAY VIA AHCH*****¥*4%%k HOTEL
EXPENSE 032119 NOT SUBMITTED WITH ORIGINAL BILL

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS/CHARGES $94,217.56
TOTAL INVOICE $174,181.31
FEDERAL TAX m:- Page 20 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.



Schi
Haf{din

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309
SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

FEE
TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS RATES AMOUNTS
Maggie Hickey Equity Partner 82.25 500.00 41,125.00
Derek G. Barella Income Partner 5.50 450.00 2,475.00
Ariel R. Hairston Associate 2.75 360.00 990.00
Anthony-Ray Sepulveda Associate 84.75 395.00 33,476.25
Ryan Darby Other - eDiscov 5.75 330.00 1,897.50
TOTALS 181.00 $79,963.75

FEDERAL TAX ID: [ Page 21 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.
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Ha@din

Maggie Hickey as Independent Monitor Involvi May 31, 2019
CPD Monitor Invoice # 2353309
MATTER SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $79,963.75
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS/CHARGES $94.217.56
TOTAL INVOICE FOR INVOICE # 2353309 $174,181.31

Wire Instructions
Payment may be wired to For Payment Via ACH:
(Including International Transactions):

FEDERAL TAX m:- Page 22 DUE UPON RECEIPT

THIS STATEMENT CONTAINS INFORMATION PROTECTED BY THE
ATTORNEY-CLIENT AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGES.
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CNA

ARELYLID B BTGNS
Billing Number: CNAC-D786~0002
Invoice Number: INV-224800

Bill To:
S¢chiff Hardin,LLP
Attn: Maggie Hickey, Monitox
233 South Wacker Drive
Suite 7100
Chicago, IL 80806

Customer Number: SCRIFF
Prime Contract Number: Engagement Letter

Project Number: 1495.0000.D786
Project Name: CPD Monitor Base Year
Terms: NET 30

Due Pate: 06/14/2019

VAT/Tax 10 Number:

CNA Associate Monitor
Decker, Scott H

CNA Deputy Monitor
Monroe, Rodney D
Coldren, James R

CNA Monitering Team Support
Richardson, Keri F
Omotoye, Titilola ©
Sun, Christopher M
Felix, Tammy L
Bliiott, Vivian Y

CNA Project Director
Xunard, Laura L

Vv Adler Univ-Elerna Quintana
adler - Blena Quintana
Elena Quintana

YV Deputy Moniter
R Monroe Public Safety Co

Y Laura McElroy
McElroy Media Group

¥V SME
Thomas Christoff

V Safer Foundn-Sodiga Williams
Safer - Scodiga Williams
Safer Foundation

V Subcontractor NSTE
LIC ~ Richard Rothschild
UIC ~ Matthew Sweeney
GIC - Joseph K. Heoereth

V DIC-Joseph K. Hoereth, Phd
Joseph K. Hoereth, PhD

Professional Service

Consultants Travel
Software
CNA Travel

Other Rirect Costs

Invaoice Total

Current Incurred Hours:
Cumulative Incurred Hours:

Invoice Date: 05/15/201¢

Renit To:
The CHA Corporation
c/o PNC Bank N.A.
P.O. Box 820661
Philadelphia, PA 19182-06¢61

Cumulative Amount RBilled: $16%,878.21

Billing Pariod From: 04/01/2019
To: 04/30/2018

Page 1 0f 25

Current current Cumuiative Cumulative
Hours Rate Amount Hours Amount
i0.00 196.3%00 $1,963.50 35.00 $6,873.65
0.00 218.530C 0.00 77.00 16,826.81
50.50 237.450¢0 11,9983.25 126.00 28,%23.75
30.50 82.8000 2,525.40 75.00 6,210.00
1.50 153.8600 230.79 1.50 230.79
3.00 162.7600 488.28 3.50 569.66
20.50 195.4200 4,008,111 20.50 4,006.11
45.00 209.200¢ 9,414.00 101.00 21,129.20
47.00 171.4400 8,057.68 141.00 24,173.04
38.350 185.5500C 6,373.68 38.50 6,373.68
$.00 165.5500 2.00 18.25% 3,021.28
65.50 218.5300 15,187.84 69.50 15,187.84
20.75 185,5500 3,435.16 55.25 9,146.64
14.25 107.6100 1,533.44 14.25 1,533.44
22.50 165,5500 3,724.88 22.50 3,724.88
0.00 165.5500 .00 19.50 3,228.23
36.50 46.0000 1,675.00 36.50 1,679.00
32.50 61.0000 1,982.50 32.50 1,982.50
16.00 145.00C0 2,755.00 19.00 2,7%5.00
0.00 141,9300 0.00 20.00 2,838.6¢C
461.50 $75,350,81 926.25 $161,414.11
$650.83 $2,170.24
960.C0 960.00
0,80 5,333.86
$1,610.83 $8,464.10
$76,981.74 $169,878.21
461,50
926.25



At wits & Loy Ih“_-:*;
Billing Numper: CNAC-R786-0202 Project Number: 1485.0000.D786
invoice Humper: INV-224300 Project Name: CPR Monitor Base Year Invoice Date: 05/15/2018

I certify that this involce is correct and in acecerdance with the terma of the contract and that the costs includec
herein have peepn incurred, represent payments made by the contractor except as cthevrwlse authorized in the payments
provision of the Contrach, and properly reflect the work performed. If you have any questicns regarding this
irvoice, please contact Felicia Jordan at (703)824-2509 or jordanflcna.orq.

gt (ot

Wanda Cook Date
Corporate Controller
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AMALYSIS & SOLUTIONS

Non-Labor Supporting Schedule
Invoice Number: INV-224800 Project ID: 1499.0000.D786
Bill Number: CNAC-D786-0002 Project Name: CPD Monitor Base Year Invoice Date: 05/15/19
... kneDescription 1 Vendor/Vendor Employee  : CurrentAmount | Notes ¢
Consultants Travel R Monroe Public Safety Co 528.10 American Flight Charlotte to Chicago
35.00 Airport parking - Charlotte, NC
45.61 Uber airport to City Hal}
41.12 Uber City Hall to airport

Subtotal for Consultants Travel 650.83
Software Microsofi 960.00
Subtotal for Software 960.00
Total Non-Labor 1,610.83
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Chicago Police Department Independent Monitoring Team Project

Summary of CNA Staff Hours
Meonth: April 2019

Name o Sum of Hours
Christophersun 3.0
e
4/18/2019 1.00
4/19/2019 1.00
ElenaQuintana 3850
4/1/2019 150
4/2/2019 1.00
4/4/2019 1.00
4/5/2019 3.00
4/8/2019 3.00
4/9/2019 2.25
4/10/2019 0.50
4/11/2019 1.50
4/12/2019 4.00
4/15/2019 1.50
4/17/2019 2.50
4/18/2019 2.00
4/19/2019 4,00
4/20/20198 1.00
4/22/2019 3.75
4/24/2018 2.50
4/26/2019 1.50
4/29/2019 1.25
4/30/2019 0.75
JamesColdren 5050
© 4/1/2019 ’ 2.50
4/2/2019 2.00
4/3/2019 6.50
4/4/2019 3.00
4/5/2019 1.50
4/7/2019 3.00
4/8/2019 6.00
4/9/2019 0.50
4/10/2019 0.50
4/11/2019 2.50
4/12/2019 2.50
4/15/2019 2.50
4/16/2019 0.50
4/17/2019 3.00
4/18/2019 1.00
4/19/2019 2.00
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Name oo SumofHours

4/22/2019 4.00
4/23/2019 2.00
4/24/2019 1.00
4/25/2019 2.00
4/28/2019 1.50
4/21/2019 0.50
KeriRichardson 30.50
4/1/2019 3.00
4/2/2019 0.50
4/3/2019 1.00
4/8/2019 1.00
4/11/2019 1.00
4/15/2019 2.00
4/16/2019 1.00
4/17/2019 1.00
4/18/2019 1.50
4/19/2019 4.50
4/22/2019 3.50
4/23/2019 0.50
4/24/2019 3.00
4/25/2019 3.00
4/26/2019 1.50
4/29/2019 1.50
4/30/2019 1.00
leuraKunard - 47.00
4/1/2019 600
4/3/2019 6.00
4/4/2019 4.00
4/5/2019 4.00
4/10/2019 0.50
4/11/2019 0.50
4/17/2019 4.00
4/18/2019 4.00
4/19/2019 3.00
4/22/2019 3.00
4/27/2019 1.00
4/28/2019 3.00
4/29/2019 6.00
4/30/2019 2.00
_Rodney Monroe 6850
4/1/200 125
4/2/2019 3.25
4/3/2019 3.00
4/4/2019 1.00
4/5/2019 3.50
4/8/2019 2.00

Page 50f 25



Name . SumofHours

4/11/2019 5.75
4/12/2019 3.50
4/15/2019 6.00
4/16/2019 2.50
4/17/2019 3.00
4/18/2019 3.75
4/19/2019 1.50
4/22/2019 0.75
4/23/2019 12.00
4/24/2019 1.75
4/25/2019 1.50
4/27/2019 2.00
4/30/2019 5.50
ScottDecker 1000
4/17/2019 ” 2.00
4/18/2019 2.00
4/19/2019 3.00
4/22/2019 2.00
4/21/2019 1.00
Sodiga Williams e 2230
R e 222D
4/2/2019 1.00
4/8/2019 3.00
4/11/2019 1.50
4/12/2019 2.00
4/15/2019 1.50
4/19/2019 4.00
4/22/2019 3.50
4/24/2019 2.50
4/29/2019 2.00
TammyFelix 20.50
e e
4/4/2019 2.00
4/5/2019 1.00
4/11/2019 1.00
4/12/2019 1.00
4/15/2019 4.00
4/16/2019 2.00
4/17/2019 2.00
4/18/2019 2.00
4/19/2019 2.00
4/30/2019 1.50
TomChristoff  .....1425
- a/4/2019 ' - 1.00
4/5/2019 1.00
4/8/2019 4.50
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Name . SumofHours

4/12/2019 2.00
4/15/2019 1.00
4/18/2019 2.25
4/22/2019 . 1.50
4/26/2019 1.00

. UlC-loseph Hoereth 1900
4/1/2019 150
4/2/2019 1.00
4/5/2019 1.00
4/8/2019 1.50
4/11/2019 1.50
4/12/2019 2.00
4/15/2019 1.50
4/22/2019 1.50
4/23/2019 1.00
4/24/2019 2.50
4/29/2019 1.50
4/30/2019 2.50
UiC-Matthew Sweeney  32.50
e 222
4/5/2019 6.00
4/8/2019 4.00
4/9/20189 2.00
4/16/2019 2.00
4/18/2019 1.00
4/23/2019 1.00
4/24/2019 3.00
4/25/2019 2.00
4/26/2019 3.00
4/29/2019 3.00
4/30/2019 1.50
UIC-Roy Rothschild ~  36.50
4/2/2019 400
4/4/2019 5.00
4/5/2019 3.00
4/8/2019 2.00
4/9/2019 4.00
4/11/2019 4.50
4/22/2019 3.00
4/23/2019 1.00
4/24/2019 2.00
4/26/2019 3.00
4/29/2019 2.50
4/30/2019 2.50
VivianElliett 4500
- 4/1/2019 150

Page 7 of 25



Name ... SumofHours

4/2/2019 3.00
4/3/2019 2.50
4/4/2019 3.00
4/5/2019 1.00
4/8/2019 2.50
4/9/2019 2.00
4/10/2019 1.00
4/11/2019 1.00
4/12/2019 2.00
4/15/2019 4.00
4/16/2019 3.00
4/17/2019 4.00
4/18/2019 2.00
4/19/2019 1.50
4/22/2019 2.00
4/23/2019 1.00
4/24/2019 1.00
4/25/2019 4.00
4/29/2019 1.50
4/30/2019 1.50
Titilola Omotaye  ~  .....1%30
4701 0.50
4/25/2019 1.00
lauraMcEroy 2075
4/1/2019 150
4/2/2019 5.25
4/3/2019 6.00
4/5/2019 1.00
4/15/2019 1.50
4/18/2019 2.00
4/19/2019 1.00
4/20/2019 1.50
. A[9p019 100
Grand Total 461.50
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clons Guinans
Elena Guintana

Elens Quintana

Elena Quintana
Elera Quintana

Elena Quintana
Elena Quintana
‘Elena Quintang )

na
Elena QUlﬂtan?._ i

:Elena Qu

‘Elena Quintené
Elena Qumta"a —
:Elena O.Ulntana_

E:Elena Qumtanarﬂ_ﬁ ‘

éEtena Quintana
EE!ena Quintana
‘Elena Quintana _

j'Elena Quintana

:Eiena Quintana
‘Elena Quiptana
‘Elena Quintana

_Elena Quintana

Elena Qumtana_-_ _' _
‘Elena Quintana
Elena Quintana

tlena Quintana_
Elena Quintanz____
James Coldren

James Coldren

James Coldren

James Coldren

James Coldren
James Coldren

James Caldren
James Coldren

James Coldren
James Coldren
James Coldren

James Coldren
James Coldren
James Coldren

‘lames Coidren

‘james Coldren '
‘James Coldren

‘James Cold_;en
-James Coldren

“James Coldren o
James Coldren o
James Coldren o
Hames. Coldren o
‘James Coldren

'James Coldren
James Coldren
James Coldren

tames Coldren
‘James ¢ Coléren .

James Coldren

James Coldren

April 2019

April 2019_ ..
Apriizgig

April 2039

April 2(]39_.

April 2029

April 2039
April 2019
April 2009

Apil2019

_Aprll 2019_ -

Apnl 2018
T
B R Ty
... Peril 2019

~ April 2019

" Aprii2018”

April 2019

April2019

April 2019

Apri12019

] _/5/2019 Mon ing In rodu ion Call for Analysts o
) 4/18/2019 Mowtormg Check-in Call WI'(h CNATeam
.4/19/2019 Fuli M

s/1/2015 CETWeekiy Meeting e S AT
41512019 Emails week of 411545715 e e e e
Rewew/edlt documents--Talking Point for Commvnlty Meetmgs cer T T
4/4/2019 Social Media Proposal o . ) 1.00
4/5/2019 Review document-Community Engagement Philosophy 7" " as0
| 4/8/2019 Meetingat Schiffwith LawsvitPorties 300
_4/12/2019 Emails week of 4/8/19-4/12/19 S X
4/3/2019 Interview w/Crlstal Noel - ] "~ 100
4/10/2019 Complete and submit W9, EFT form, Consultant form e -

4/11/2019 Debrief on Coalmon Meetmg
4/2/2019 Conference cal w/loe and odlqa

B 4/12/2019 Conference c | Sodiga
__4/15/2019 IMT CET Weekly Meeting

'_'0‘4/19/2019 Dacument Ed|ts --Chicago lf\.'lT Monitoring Plan Draft ‘ i
_4/20/2019 Docu}menthRewew-{hlcago IMT Manitoring Plan Draft i
4/17/2019 Police Reform Discussion o ' '
__4/22/2019 TET Meetlng with GAPA Leadershlp I
' 4/22/2019 MT CET Weekiy Meeting.
"a/26/2019 Emails Week of 4/22/19-4/26/19 '
4/22{2019 Document Review/Edit--GAPA Meeting Notps

‘Aprilzo19

April 2819
April 2019

Caprizie T
U Aprilzols
April2018

April 2019

April 2018 S

April 2019

April 2019

_ April 2019

April 2019

April 2019

_4f24f2019 Meeti ith WAPS Group (Crista Noel)
4/5/2019 Conference Callw/CET S
_4/9/2019 Dac t(_‘reataon -Notes from Cristal Noel Meetmg o
) 4/9/2019 GAPA Admlnlstratlon
4/3 /2018 £ Emalls N -
4/28/2019 Socument Rewew/Edlt--Subcontract for CPD Project
4/28/2019 Bocument Creation--Mema CPD Community Meeting suggestloﬂs
4/1/2019 _‘_lnternal C. N A. team staﬁ"ng aliocation plannmg

4/1/201%

Community Engagement Team weekly call, planning for outreach, team organization discussio
Review and draftmg of the 1st Year Momto ng Pl .. 200
Monitoring plannlng with Crisis Intervention Team Assaciate Monitor and Commumtv Engagement

Team

Weekly T Ieadershlp planning meetlng

4/3/2018
_4/3/2019

4/4/2019
47472019 :
" 4/aj201% Worked on draft of 1st year monitoring plan
4/5/2019 Condcut p;o]ect orlentatlon for CN.A. analysts

Caprii2019

April 2019

CAprii2013
] AprliZUlB____ )
April2019

April 2019

' ) 'Aprll 2019
April 2018
April 2019
ppril2018

April 2019

April 2019_” .
April2009
Al 2019

) __Apn! 2015

April2ois

April 2019

April 2{]19 )
April | 2019
April 2019

4/5/2019

4/7/2019 P
_4/8/2019___ B
Afgfa019

_ 4/10/2018 ,'
- 4/11/2018
"4/11/2013_'

) Reviewed plans for the Chicago iMT websme
‘Worked on draft of 1st year momtorang plan

a/15/2019
4/15/2019 Me
 4/16/2019
. 4{17/2019
4{17/2019
_4/17/2019
i 4/18/_26;9__ ) Worked on draft of 1st vear mon]tonng plan
4/19/2019 " Full Monitoring Team monthly meeting
4/19/2019 _‘?:epare for 4/23 Commumty Engagement Team meeting
4/21/2019
Af22/3019 Commumw meetmg with GAPA
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James Coldren

James Coldren
James Coldren

James Coldsen
James Coldren
-James Coldren

Keri Richardson

Keri Richardson

Ker Rlchardson._. o

Kert Richardson

Kert chhardson_i._.

Keri Richardson

‘Keri Richarg

Keri Rlchardson u

?,Ke,r.i Richardson
:Kert Richardson

‘Keri Rlchardson' 3
Kel’i Richardson
Ker: Richardson
Keri Richardson
Keri chhardson_ )

Keri Richardson

Kerz Rschardson' B

Keri Richardsan

Kerr chhardson_-_i_"_'j

‘Laura Kunard
‘Laura Kunard_
Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard_'u _' ) )

Laura Kunard
Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard
Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard__'_ '

Laura Kunard
Laura Kunard'_ }
(Laura Kunard
Laura Kunard,

Laura Kunard o

Laura Kunatd

lavra Kunard

‘Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard Q: o

Laura Kunard_
Laura Kunard

Lauza Kunardn_ i

Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard
Laura  Kunard

Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard B

Laura Kunard )

LouraKunard

‘Laura Kunard
Laura Kunard

Laura Kunard .
LauraK nard

‘Laura Kunard

‘Laura Kunard.__‘__ ) ._

‘Laura Kunard
Laura McEIroy

 April 2013

April 2013

' 4/23/2019 Monthly call with Consent Decree parties

4/22/2019 Worked on draft of 15t yaar monitoring plan

“_‘Apr||2919 o
April 2018

April 2018

. _”Apni 2019:.

Aprit 2019

Aprit2018

April2019

Aprit 201

April2019

April2019

April 2019

Apilz01s

April2019 ..

April201g
April2019
~ April 2019
April 2 2019

April 2019

April2019

April 2019

 Aprif 2019
Aprii 2019
 Aprii 2015

Apris 2015

April 2019

April 2013
April 2018

Lohpilaods
April 2015

April 2019
April 2(?19

CApril 2019

April 2018
Aprilzels
April 2018
April2018

April 2018

Apri 2019: [

Aprli 2013

"Aprli 2019
April 2019_ o
JApril2eie

April 2018

April 2019_ )
April 2018
April 2018
April 2018
April 2018
April2618 4
April2018

April 2019

April2019
4/28/2019 Worked on Monitoring Plan excel file re: methodology

April 2019

April 2019

hpni 2015
April 2019

April 2019

 April2019

4/24/2019  Phone cali wn:h 0AG

4/28/2019

tos, rese sforiMTwebsute - “MMM_ A 050
4/3/2019 IMTwehsste research and development o ) 71,00
) CNAIRB Exemptlon determrnatlon form — X 00
4/11/2019 DeVElOning-SCW |3ng“358 for analyst . . e L0
4/15/2019 Meeting with CEY to discuss website developing and other community engagement activities 2,00
of webmte de\relabment and other project task e L00
4/17/2019 Meetsng with IMT' CAN leadershlp to dsscuss momtonng plan and weh5|te next steps o 1 00

" Meetmg with Chrcago momtors and [Rodnev s) associate monitors to discuss momtorlng plan

‘__"4/22/2019 Weekl\r CET Monitoring Team conference call

”4/19/2019 Call wnh Deput-\'jMomtor Ccldren re Mnnltorlng plan struczure e
4/18/2019 Discussed |nterna| commumcat:ons and data sharing

Laura McElroy  April2019

4/24/2019

4/25/2018  IMT Leadership meetmg_ _' T

C'E’I'"“meet'ing' fb'sfrateéif'énga'g'ernent"a(:t'iv'ities H Internal IMT meeting to discuss manitariﬁg ptlan
4f1/2019 strategy )
4/1/2019 lnternal IMT meetlng to discuss monltorlng p[an strategy

4/18/2019 RE"E'W‘“E wordmark and cantent for .‘!‘,’St?s‘..tf*:,,.v S

4/22/2019 Track and Cansolsdate'lMT Momtorlng Team comments T

4/23/2019 Clean rneet]ng notes; develop website content
4/24/2019 IMT Intema[ meeting; IMT website content development
4/25/2019 IMT meetmg monitors;

4!3/2019 Dlscuss mternal IMT commumcatmns
_4/3/2019 CNA team IMT meeting re web;lte

j'4/5/2019 Facmtated-outreach to Coalil on for in mput on Monltormg Plan '_
_A/5/2018 F Rewewed and commented on'proposed pratoce] for manitor access e
_4f5/2018 Reviewed i |mages for IMT wordmark (Iogo} and websn:e desrgn R

_u4/11/2019 Rewewed Momtonng Plan input from IMT
4/17/2019 Weekly IMT meeting with Monltor Deputy Mcmtors
4/17/2019 Worked on Monltorlng Plan

4/27/2019 Worked on Momtarlng f’lan excel f’le re methodolong_

4/29/2019 Conference call wzth Communltv Engagement Team

4/30/2919 Fmallzed r

4/17/2019 IMT call wn;h CNA team

_ 4/1/2019 Weekly CETM ) -
Follow up “call with Shodiga and loe of CET Team to discuss develop mg

4/2/2019 talking points for the first Coali tion meeting and additi onal public meedings 1,25
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‘Lavra McElroy

éLaura McElray

.Lavra McElroy

iLaura McElroy
;Laura McElroy

tauraMcEloy

Laura McElroy
Laura McElroy

.!,aura'Mc_Elroy
‘Laura McElroy

‘Laura McElroy

‘Laura McElray
Rodney Monroe
:Radney Monroe
‘Radney Monroe
‘Rodney Monroe
Radney Monroe

Radney Monroe
‘Rodney Monroe
‘Rodney Monroe _

[Redney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

‘Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

:Rodney Monroe

[Rodney Monarge

Aodney Manrog

‘Rodney Monroe

iRodney Monrog

‘Rodaey Monroe
Rodaey Monroe

‘Rodney Monroe

Radney Monroe
jRocney Monroe

Redney Monroe

'‘Rodney Monrge

Rodney Monroe

:Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

Rodney Monroe

April 2019 4/2/2019 philo sophy for developing talking points
“april 2019. <t draftof talking points f .
Continued drafting ta}kmg pomts first draft of social media pIan
_ April 2019 _ 4/3/2019 T:30am- 10:30am 3.00
~ April 2 2{319 . 4&f3/2019 Flnah zed talkmg pomts and fmallzed soaai medla plan ] ) ) N ' 3.00
April 2019 4/2/201% rnaﬂ correspondence regardllng'tal'kln'g po]nts and SRCJ?[[nngH plan o s
Synthesued edits from CET members on both documents to creste ) e
April2019  4/5/2019 final draft. e A0
Weekly CET Meetmg debriefed en first coaltion i meetlng and requests, e AE
April 2018 ~4/35/2019 congerns of the coalition. Webex ta review the website - o 1.50;
April 2019 4/18/2019 Reviewed monitoring plan B - 1)
MonltormgTeam Meeting toTeview websute ‘discuss Ioglstlcs, discuss T
~April 2019 __4/49/2019 coalition concerns, first site visitetc o o
April 2019 4/20/2013 Submitted suggested adizs on the monitonng plan T o -
Email correspnndencemth the CET Team regarding edits ta the
April 2019 4/18/2019 monitoring plan, tracking meetings and additional team logistics 930
CET Weekly Call to discuss upcoming meetings and managing the
Aprl 2019 4/29/2019 logistics of the m eeting and discussion about ensuring community input to the monitoringplan 1.
hprl201 4/1/2019 Rewewed lst draft of |tor=ng plan and submitted comments 3
April 2019 4/1/2019 F Revlew of emails and respanses o o :
April 2019 . &/1/2019 Ca!l wlth W|I| Johnson to discuss asmgnments and Inudent w1th Eiena i ‘Q.'S'Qz
April 2019 . 4ny2019 Rewew Chicago travel reqmremeats ) . R 'D,.SO'
April2013 __allwlth CET to discuss community n\eetmgs, rewewad questlons all _' ;.'50
_April2019 " ""4/1/2019 Call with Laura to discuss st draft of monitoringplan o 00
“April 3019 4/2/2019 Reviewed and commented on 2nd draft monitoringplan T T T 908
Aprit2019  4/3/2019 Reviewed and commented on Ind draft monitoring plan T
; Confarence Call with IMT to discuss Monitoring Plan and ather tapics of concern, Data request,
April 2013 4/3/2018 policy review, SharePoint sites. 200
' Cail with Associate Monitor Paul Evans to discuss prctocols for notification, respense , and review of
critical incident regarding uses of
April 2019 | 4/3/2019 deadly force against subject. OO ..
' Follow Lipmz:ﬂaﬂll'wnth Paul Evans 1o discuss notification from CPD ) o
April 2019 a/a/2019 regarding use of force cases. e 100
Updating monitoring plan spreadsheet Adding resources neaded to
. Aprit 2019 _ 4/5/2019 establish compliance levels, S-S .
Updated monitoring plan actnutv spreadsheet “added Use of Force
April 2019 4/8/2019 sections R -
Updated momturmg p[an actwity spreadsheet ‘added Use of Force
April 2019 [4/12/2019 sections B .-l
April 2019 '4/11/2039 Review ed aotes from CET meeting w/Coalition members o 250
Updated activity spreadsheet and monitoring plan captured ' ' !
April 2018 - 4/12/2019 documents needed B . 350
April 2019 . 4/15/2019 Review raft plan sentto AM, updated 3 varmus secuons f pl n e 3.90;
scheduled conference cail and drafted agenda for meeting w/ -
JApril2019  4/15/2019 Associate Monitors . )
Conferance call and webinar with CET, discussed new website and ) )
April2018  4/15/2013 other business e LT
Prep with Harold Medlock for call with ¢:|tv “and CPD to discuss him -
Aprl 2018 4/15/2019 joining our team, Reviewed several documents with him, e - |
Confarence call with Medlock, City and CPD to discuss adding Harald o
 April 2018 4/16/2019 to team as an Associate Monitor. I
_April 2019 4/17/2019 CC with IMT team to discusss/ 23 meeting wnth Supermtendent . 150
Finalize AM agenda, reviewed list of documents requested by AG ta -
APl 2019 4/17/2019 CPD e 150
‘Reviewed Mediock comments and recemmendations, also rewewed )
Aprit 2019 4/18/2019 his trackmg system AT : L
Aprii 2019 “4/18/2019 R dnlt 5, € comments from Chlp an Laur
- April 2019 ) _4/18/2019 cc wnth Assoclate Monltors to discuss draft plan.
_ﬁ_;?r_!__!__gg__ls . _4/18/2019 Revnewed and responded to emalls
Reviewed and commented cr: agenda for 4/19/ 19 CC with entire monltormg team, made notes 1o
April 2019 4/18/2019 discuss T . ... 050
April 2015 4/19/2019 R Rewewed and respunded to emalls ) S - a0
April 2615 4/19/2019 ¢ CC with entxre mcnitonngteam to discuss d T '“ L0
Reviewed final agenda for 668 meetlng Reviewed and commented on proposal for communlcatmg N
April 2019 4/22/2019 w/parties , e _ 075,

Cne-on-gne call withloe Hoereth to continue discussion on CET
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:Rodney Manroe

.Radney Monroe
‘Radney Monroe o

‘Rodney Mosroe

;Rodney Monroe '
‘Rodney Monroe

-Radney Manroe

‘Rodney Munroe__ -
‘Rodney Monroe

‘Scott Decker
iScott Decker

Scott Decker e

Scott Decker
‘Scot: Decker
Scott Decker
Scdiga Williams
fSodlqa Wlillams
ESodlqa Witllams

‘Sediga Williams

‘Sodlqa williams

-Sodiga williams

iSodiga Wzlhams

Sodiga W;Iham; ]

Sodiga Welhamsl

Sodiqa Willizms

Tammy Felix

Jammy Felix

Tammy Felix

Tammy | Fellx
Tamray Felix

Tammy Felix

Tammy Felix
Tammy Felix

Tammy Felix
Tammy Felix

TammyFelx

Tammy Felix

Titilola Omotoye
Titilola Omotoye

?Rodnev Monroe
odney Monroe
Rodney Monroe

S diga Williams _
.Sodtqa williams

April 2018

April2018
April 2019

. Aprsl 2019_.

April 2619

LApri2019
April 2019
.AWH w18

April 2019

“hprii 2019

April2013

April 2019

2o
) Apnl 2018

April 2018

" ppril 2018
April 2015
April2018
april2o1s

Cmprit2og

April 2019

April2019

_April 2029

 April 2029

April 2019

__ April 2019

April 2049

April 2038

April 2018
April 2019

April2019
April 2018

April2018

Apri 2019

Aprit 2019

Aprit 2019

April 2019
April 2019
Aprif 2019
April 2019

" Aprit 2015

Aprit2019

Aprii201s

..4/12/2019 Deputy Manitor e 200
a/15/2019 Chicago IMT CET weekly mesting "7 T T T T T 50
, 3.00
o 4/22/2019 CET Meeztng W|th GAPA Leadershlp 2.00
_.4/22/2018 Chrcago IMT CET weekly meetmg 1.50
. v Belletn 2'50
_4/29/2019 Chlcago IMT Commumty Engagement (CET) ! Weekly Meetlng 2.00
Received an email containing several documents related to the CD, and Dal‘tll:lpated ln acallwith
the project PM to discuss developing searchable index fer all documents. Spent time reviewing
4/3/2019 documents and researching metheds for indexing documents, o 2.00
‘Continued to research products and talked to internal staff to determine best methads for
4/4/2013 searching/indexing documents. e 200
4/5/2019 Participated in the Chicago Analyst Introductlon conference call 1.00
Beganworkon a spreadsheet showing results of keyword searches as they relate to the functions
4/11/2(}19 assigned to the Associate Monitors. .00
spreadsheet ~1.00
Completed the keyword spreadsheet, designed to provide 2 quick-reference for the AMs to use in
reviewing investigatory reports, and results of commusity group issues and recommendations.
Developed an email summarizing the significance of the spreadsheet - and describing challenges
4/15/2013 with using this method. Researched methods for creating a master table of contents. A
Reviswed the document master file and dynamic table of contents, developed an email to explaln
4/16/201% the content and use, and sent file to project management, 2.00
_ 417/2018 Rewewed the ltems related to community policing, officer wel?ness, and superwsmn - '2.00
Reviewed the prellmmary inputs irom the Associate Monitor for officar wellness, and supervision :
_4/18/2019 regarding how to measurg and set compliance with CD. B0
4/15/2019 Fartldpated in the Chlcago IMT Update Call. 2.00;
Held an initial call between the Analyst and Associate Monitor for Officer Wellness and Supervision
to discuss nature of roles and responsibilities. Laid out three priorities: 1) SME Identification and
processes for requesting and monitoring their levet of effort; 2) Determine processes for requesting
,reviewing and tracking documents; and 3} Determine processes for sending assignments to other
Associate Monitors for those issues that cross funcgonal areas {e.g., revigw of training curriculum
4/30/2019 related to supervisory training and poficy}. ) Y £
Develo)ped awritten call summary, and identified | prehmlnary roles and FESIJOI"ISlbI“tIES for the '
Analytic support to the AM for Officer Wellness and Supervision, Sent email to the AM with notes,
4/30/2019 and also to the FM reques}lng |n_format|on on processes, 0.75

412342019 foliow up questions for parties. o R e 400
4/23/2019 Meeting w/iudge Coar and Maggie, introductions and update on the teams progress to date, 200
4/23/2019 Meeting w/partses at QPD ref 668 meeting 2.00

' 4/30/2019 Rewewed MOA wath Coalltlnn n

_4/30/2019 against IMT plan ~ R 2,25
~ 4/30/2019 Reviewed Tinal draft of Communication prutncuis ) o - 050
43072019 R Revrewed various paragraphs of CD identify missing prsonty due dates o 3 - 250

4/17/2019 F ReviewofIMT P!an notate document L 2'.'00

IMT Plan, Createresponse. .. ... 200

] 4/19/2019 Phone rneetmg

e /21/2019 Read iMT documents, anaotate X ' ) . 100
] 4/22/2019 ‘Read T documents annotate o 200
_4f1/2019 Chlcago IMT Communlty EngagementTeam (CET) weekly meetmg e o 150
4/2/2019 CET with loe H. & Elena H. 1.00

Travel Charlotte to Chicago for meeting w/Judge Coar and CPD ref par £68, review of agenda and

Travel Chlcago ta Chariott g, reviewed notes and documents from T
4/23/2019 meeting
4/24/2019 Responded to emalls from IMT team . i
4/24/2019 IMT CC with AG to follow up on meetlng with partlgs e
4/25/2019 IMT CC to discuss AG concerns , protocols for communlcatlon '

4/27/2019 Reviewed 3rd verslon of draft manitoring plan

Reviewed priority list of paragraphs submitted by CPD, compared o

4/13/2019 Review Noteson IMTPlan

4/8/2019 IMT meetlng with the Coalltlon
4/11/2019

"CET call to discuss coalition meetlng with extended CET and

‘Waorked on the Estimate at Compladion (EAC) spreadsheet that is used to plan and monitor the
4/17/2019 hudget

4/25/2013 Updated the EAC spr  ctuals hours and other costs
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Tom Christoff
Tom Chrlstoff i

pri

Tom Chnstqff ) )
“Tom Christoff Aprll 2019 )
Tom Christoff  April 2019
“Tom Christoff April 2013 4/13/2019 Conduct analysis of COPA data. Identlfy trends by Distrlct. Prepare emall to CET to disseminate T
Tom Christoff ~ April 2019 o ﬁ@gﬁg}g li‘v:IT CET meating regarding SharePoint, time submission S|te, and tracig!ng IMT progress usinga s
Tom Chrlstuff April 2019 4/26/2019 Research and develop suggestions for tracking meetlngs/znformatlon \Tsfﬁg QOneNote and
UiC Joseph Hoereth‘ April2c1e 4/1/2019 Chlcago IMT Community Engagement Team (CET) weekly meeting -
UiC -joseph Hoereth  April 2015 4/2/2019 CET caII W|th Sodiqa Wiiliams and Laura McElroy,
uic- -loseph Hoereth A'p_ril' 2015
UIC-Joseph Hoereth  April 2015
UIC-joseph Hoareth  April 2015
UiC-Joseph Hoereth _ April 2018
UiC-loseph Hoereth  April 2019
UIC-Joseph Hoereth _ April 2019
UIC:Joseph Hoereth  Apri 2019
UiC-Joseph Hosreth  Apri| 2019
UIC-Joseph Hoereth  Apri 2019
UlC-Joseph Hoereth  April 2019 4/30/201S Meeting with Tom Christoff ta discuss survey 250
UIC-Matthew Review consent decree survey instruments and methodologies used | in other citles, to assist survey :
Sweeney  April2019  4/2/2019 design 400
UIC-Matthew Populatecommunlty surveys ‘database with information about survey methodologms used in other :
Sweeney Aprit 2019 4/5/2019 cities under consent decree 6.00
UIC-Matthew ‘Populate community surveys database with information ahout survey methadolagies used in other
Sweeney  April 2019 4/8/2019 cities under consent decree 200
Ulc-Matthew Compute summary inforrmation on survey methodologles used across 55 surveys from 24 different
Sweeney VAprdl 2019 #/8/2019 cities under consent decree e e 1200
‘Uic-Matthew ' Meetlng with IPCE Research team and. survev ‘vesearch advisor to explore samplmg de51gn and '
Sweeney ~ April 2019 4/8/20189 survey design options 1.00
o Draft categorization of putennal survev questsons based on concepts mandated to be studied hv
consent decree; overail police services, trustworthiness, community engagement, effectiveness, E
UIC-Matthew responsiveness, handling of misconduct complaints and investigations, interactions with members :
Sweeney  Apdl 2019 4/9/2019 of the Chicago community . 2,00
‘UIC-Matthew '
iSweeney _April 2019 .. 4/16/2019 Review technical documentation for select survey data collection service providers 200
‘UIC-Matthew . '
Sweeney CAprit2019  4/18/2019 Review technical documentation for select survey data collection service providers 100
_UIClMaithew NEVIEW . coreeHon Ay
Sweeney ~ Aprlt 2019 4/23/2019 Paruclpate in call with NORC aboui éata coilechon methods 1.60
:UIC-Matthew ' Sampling design preparatma review measures of pollce contact and |dent|fy saurces of pollce :
Sweeney  April2018  4/24/2019 contact datain Chicaga 3.00
e Mt ectrete In hcas i
:Sweeney ) April 2019 4/25/2019 Sampling design preparation: Identify sources of palice contact datain Chicage 2,00!
UIC-Matthew Samp%mg design preparation: Process and merge polsce contact data sets such as arrests,
Sweeney  April2019  4/26/2019 investigatory stops, crimes and calls for service. . 300
“Utc- Matthew
Sweeney  Aprll201S 4/29/201% Sampling design preparation: Visualize and map merged pofice contact data set 3.00
Ulc-Matthew '
Swaeney April 2018 ~4/30/201% Meeting with Tom Christoff to revlew ‘sampling and survey design 150
R ' Initial background research into consent decree. surveys in other cities for use in bunding databases, T
UiC-Roy Rothschild  April 2019 '4/2/2019 including; identifying and creating a list of consent decrees 2400
initial background research into consent dacree surveys in other cities for use in bulldmg databases,
UIC-Roy Rothschild  April 2019 4/2{201% including: locating monitor websites and relevant documents 2.00:
Research: Cleaning and preparing PDF's of the consent decree surveys in: Seattle, Baltimore,
UIC-Roy Rothschitd _ April 2019
UiC-Roy Rothschild  April2019
Research; Populate database with information on consent decrees including: information about
UIC-Roy Rothschild ~ April 2019 4/5/2019 consent decree, monitar, dates, types of surveys, survey methodofogy o
UIC-Roy Rothschild — April2013 o1 .
UIC-Roy Rothschild  April 2018 4/8/20.‘19 REViEW emalls and gmdance from Denms Rosenbaum on survey de5|gn and content 1o
R Research: Data entry of surveys into Consent Decrae Survay Questions database: Seattle, Baltimare,
UIC-Roy Rothschild  Apdil 2019 4/9/2019 LACounty 4.00
g “Research: Data entry of surveys into Comsent Decree Survey Questions database: Cieveland, New
\UIC-Roy Rothschild  Aqril 2019 4/11/2019 Orleans, Puerto Rico, Cincinnati . e e 3150

April 2015
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UIC-Roy Rothschild

‘UIC-Roy Rothschild

UIC-Roy Rothschild

:UIC-Roy Rothschild
UIc-Roy Rothschild

UIC-Roy Rothschild

“Vivian Elliott
“iyian £ Ellrott i
'Vrvran Elllott
Vlvran Elhott
Vrvlan Ellrott_ =

EVivian Elliott
VVMan Elliott

‘Vivian Ellrott o
Vrvran EIIrott

Vwran E!Izott

‘Vivian Elliott ' i

Vrvran Elliott
Vwran Elliott
“Vivian Eliott
'Vw:an Eliiott
Vr\r_zan‘El_lr_o,tt

Vivian Elliott
Vivian Elliott

Vwran E[Irott'_j_ '_

Vlvran Eillott
Vivian EIIrott -
lean Elhott_ )

Vivian Elliott
VMan Elliott
’eran Elliott
Vivian EIIrott )

vivian Elliott

Vivian Elliott
Vivian Elliott
Vivian Elliott

eran Ellrott

V:vran Elfiott
st;an Elliott

vivien Ellott

‘Vivisn Elliott

Vivian Elliott

Vivian Efiot:

=V|vran Elliott o

April 2019

‘Aprll 2019 PP

April 2019

April 2019
"4/20/2019 Research: Complete first draft of cadebook in advance of meeting with Tom Chrrstoff a0

April 2019

 April 2019
_ April 2019
ot
Aprili2019

a0

April 2019

April 2019

April 2019
-
April z019
April 2019
April 2019~

April 2019

Aprit 2019 _' o
_Aprit 2 2019 i
_April 2019_ ’
CApril2019
 April 2 2019

Apri 2019

April 2018

April 2018

April 2018
Aprll2019
April2019
April 2019

April 2019

T aprizons

April 2019

April 2019

April 2019
_ 019
__Aprll 2019 o

A;}l‘

(A/30/2019 design . e 230

Meeting with IPCE Research Team and Tom Christoff re: survey design, cadebock, and samplrng

4/3/2019 Weekly CNA Chlcagc |

4/3/2019 Call W|th analystTammv Felix to drscuss document rewew N _4 4' _' - N

| 4/4/2019 Project managemant activities (budgetingd
“"_4/5/2019 intre. call far Chlcago IMT

v4/4/2019 Work on establish

er_nall account

4/8/2019 Prorect management ar:trvrtses (coatractrng, budget management)
4/8/2019 Weekly CETcall

' 4/9/2019 Work on Chicago IMT websrte - o
.4/10/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT feadershipcall

__4/10/2019 Project management at:tsvrtles (prorect admmrstratrcn}

Af12/2015 C Data storage inguiry | research for Schrff Hardin
4/12/2019 Work on Chicago iMT websne
_ 4/15/2019 Weekly CET call
_4/16/2019 Call with Deputy PM Keri Richardson to discuss project management asttivities for theweek .50
4/17/2018 Weekly Chicago. IMTIeaders%}lp eal -

4/17/2019 Weekly CNA Chrcago IMT meetlng
4/17/2019 Project management activiti

_4/9/2019 Project management actlvrtres [contractmg, budget management, mvercrng)

4/10/2019 IMT Relativity/IT call

4/11/2019 Cali with Chip to discuss content for the Chicago website and working on website development

4/12/2018 ?roject management actrvltles {set up team call work on team emaris)

4/15/2019 Frorect management actrv;tres (set up team r:al! invoice for Schrff Hardrn, contractrng)

4/16/2019 Project management actwrtres (f‘rnrsh rnvorce for Schiff Hardin, contracting)

4/17/2019 CPD data call with Schlff Ha:dm and pames

_4/18/2018 Se:  up accounts for te

April 2019 ] :_'__4/18/2019 Project management acw&ies [respand tO emalls} e R
Cali with Deputy Manitor Rodney Monroe and AMs regardmg mnnrtorrng plan development and .
Aprit 2019 4/18/2019 other Issues of Interest ~ © : T C.....Lao
Aprit2019 '4/19/2019 Chicago IMT update call e e e e OO
 Apri{2019 4/19/2019 Clean up notes for Chicago IMT update call e Q.50
AP(12018  4/22/2019 Project management activities [respond toemalls) o 050
L Apil2019 T Ta/22/2008 Weekly CETcall T T 80
~April 2019 4/23/2019 Finish setting up accounts for team emails and drafting team guidance far emails and SharePoint 1.00
April2013  4/24/2019 WeeklyCNAChlcaguIMTmeetlng _____ S T .-
April 2018 _6/25/2019 Weekly Chicago IMT leadershipcali 1.50
April 2018 4/25/2019 Project management activities {respand to emails, contracting, set up team SharePoint site}
_April2019 T 4/29/2019 Weekly CET call e 222
Project management activities (respand to emalls, end of the month team timekeeping reminder,
LAprl2018 .. 4/30/2018 wark on SharePointsite) U =+
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From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com @&
Subject: [Business] Your Tuesday morning trip with Uber
Date: April 23, 2019 at 11:28 AM
To:

Total: $45.61
u ber Tue, Apr 23, 2019

Thanks for riding, Rodney

We hope you enjoyed your ride this
morning.

Total $45.61

5 3£ 1 R R R T PR G S

Good news - you've been refunded a portion |
of your original upfront price on this trip
because of a change to the anticipated route. |
Please see the receipt breakdown for details.

o e ot

Trip Fare $38.06
Subtotal $38.06
Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees @& $7.55
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Amount Charged

-Switch $45.61

You rode with Alwajud

4.89 % Rating

Alwajud is known for:

Excellent Service

How was your ride?

Transportation Network Company: Uber Technoiogies, Inc.

Every rideshare trip starting in lllinois is insured by Allstate.
Allstate Learn more.

vies 18.07 mi | 37 min
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Kluczynski Federal Bldg,

Chicago, IL

Invite your friends and family.

Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to try

Uber. Share code: ([ lEGcGczB
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" 2044089

ARER T R

Valet & Parking Managemaent
< Speciol Events % Hotels
¥ Restaurunts @ Nedical Facllities
<% Ratall Centers % Oftice Bulldings
For information call
$66-2-AMFARK Or £04.364-0342

FEEDBACK? B850 AMPARK

e T T

e]] ROERCONEY

Chs s
:").’g(_-) 535 )

Blvice #1 ACCsSO 00

@ Rate. 5g.0p - CMAILTR
fax 950,

Tt Srve Chirgs

[ 7
Totai sgﬁﬁgg
Amount:  ggg o0
Dup: %0 00
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From: Uber Receipts uberus@uber.com &
Subject: [Business] Your Tuesday afternoon Irip with Uber
Date: April 23, 2019 at 4:55 PM
To:

Ub Total: $41.12
er Tue, Apr 23, 2019

Thanks for riding, Rodney

We hope you enjoyed your ride this
afternoon.

otal $41.12

Trip Fare $33.42
Subtotal $33.42
Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees & $7.55
Wait Time & $0.15
Amount Charged

A temporary hold of $40.97 was placed on your payment method [ 2t the start of the trip. This
is not a charge and has or will be removed. [t should disappear from your bank statement shortly. Learn
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You rode with Edgardo

4.96 % Rating

Edgardo is known for:

Excellent Service

How was your ride?

Transportation Network Company: Uber Technologies, inc.

@ Every rideshare trip starting in Hllinois is insured by Allstate.
A"state Learn more.

17.93 mi | 48 min
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, map_ebb71474-

H

&

H

8¢38-...67ah3d

H
i
i
1
¢
i
H
i

W IBEB L
Invite your friends and family.
Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to try
Uber. Share code:_

URCET LOST HEM 3 CONTACT BUPPORT >

VY TP 3

IR DAL

Read about our zero iolevancs podicy. Report a zero
tolerance complaint by visiting hedp aber.corm,

Uber Technolcgies
1455 Market St
San Francisco, CA 984103
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From: American Airlines no-reply@notify.email.aa.com
Subject: Your trip confirmation-MXCYP| 23APR

Date: i
To:

» ¥ . .&
AmericanAirlines ¢

Hello Rodney Monroe! Issued: Apr 16, 2019
Your trip confirmation and receipt
Record Iocator:-
Manage Your Trip l

Tuesday, April 23, 2019
CLT ORD Seats: 29F

ey Class: Economy (V)
745 am 9:13 am Meals:
American Airlines 1668
ORD . CLT Seats: 16D

s Class: Economy (V)

6:20 pm ’ 0:23 pPm Meals:
American Airlines 483

Free entertainment with the American app »

Page 22 of 25



Rodney Monroe

SAchisntag § _
Ticket # |

Your trip receipt

Rodney Monroe

Hotel offers Car rental offers Buy trip insurance SuperShuttie

Up 10'35% off base
rates + 500 miles
AVIS

 miles while
- you sleep;

Search now

Contact us | Privacy policy

(3ot tha Ameriran Airlinac ann
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Invoice

¢ April 2019
MgchSGﬁ Invoice Date: 04/19/2019
Invoice Number: EQ40080B0E

Due Date: 05/19/2019

960.00 USD
Sold-To gill-To Service Usage Address
CNA CNA CNA
3003 Washington Blvd 3003 Washington Blvd 3003 Washington Bivd
Arlington VA 22201 Arlington va 22201 Arlington VA 22201
United States United States United States

i . . ._ i g
Product: Online Services Charges:
Customer PO Number: Discounts: (.00
Order Number: b06991e5-0352-4389-3a5d-52e533846437 Credits: .00
Billing Period: 04/18/2019 - 04/18/2019 Tax: 0.00
Payment Terms: Net 30 Total: 960,00
Due Date: 05/19/2019

Payment Instructions Please pay 860.00 eference Invoice Number EQ40080B0E on the payment remittance.

£ 5
- A-_ ” . .
Payee: Microsoft
Mailing Address: Standard Mail: PO Box 842103
Dallas, TX 75284-2103
Express Mail: Lockbox 842103, 1950 N.
Stemmons Frwy, Ste, 5010
Daltas, TX 75207-2103

Billing or service question? Call 1-800-865-9408 or visit https://faka,ms/Office365Billing,
Microsoft Carporation, One Microsoft Way Redmond, WA 98052 United States
US FEIN §1-1144442
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SanchezA
Rectangle
Bank:

SWIFT CODE:

ABA/Routing Number:

Account Number:

Account Name:

gia!

Bank of America 

BOFAUS3N 

111 000 012

4426587954

Microsoft


Invoice
Microsoft Aprl 2019

Invoice Date: 04/19/2019
Invoice Number: EO40080B0OE
Due Date: 05/19/2019

&

SD i At
Service Period .- Days Qty . AnnualPrice Charges - Discounts ;.:--: o ﬁfédits: "+ SubTotal Tax%** . " Tax W “Total
04/18/2019-04/17/2020 . -~ 366 15 7 60,00 ©..960.00- 000 T .00 e 080,007 0.00% T L 0000 660.00
SubTotal 960.00 0.00 0.00 960.00 0,00 960.00
Grand Total 960,00 0.00 0.00 960,00 0.00 960.00

** Taxes may include lllinois ROT, SOT, or Chicago Personal Property Lease Transaction Tax, or a combination of the foregoing, for the business located in Chicago, 1L, USA,

Billing or service question? Call 1-800-865-9408 or visit https://aka.ms/Offlce3658illing.
Microsoft Corporation, One Microsoft Way Redmond, WA 98052 United States
LS FEIN 31-1144442
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INVOICE

Vendor Name: Dennis P. Rosenbaum Invoice Date Invoice Number
Rermnit to Address: 57172019 0002
City: State:CA  Zip: 91355 Billing Period From: Billing Period To:
Contact Name: Dennis P. Rosenbaum 4/1/2019 4/30/2019
Phone: _ Email— Remittance Type Requested: ()Check (®EFT
Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100; Chicago, IL 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com
LABOR (The description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the revlewer to determine why it was necessary.)
Date of Date of . Hours
Service(From) Service(To) Description {use 25 he Incremarts) Add/Delete
41172019 4/1/2019 Reviewed prior community surveys 2 Add Del
4/1/2019 4/1/2019 Reviewed prior contact surveys 2 Add Del
4/2/2019 4/2/2019 Developed new susvey questions and new response options 3.5 Add Del
4/3/2019 4/3/2019  |Prepared 8-page meme with analysis of survey methods and content 3.5 Add Del
4/4/2019 4/4/2019  |Prepared plan for collecting new data to assess impartial policing 3 Add Del
4/4/2019 4/4/2019 {F;n::s;;z:ed methods of outreach and qualitative inquiry with protected 2 Add Ol
4/4/2019 4/4/2019  |ldentified high priority protected classes for data collection 2 Add Del
4/5/2019 4/5/2019 [dentified possible SMEs and arganizations knowledgeable about 35 i Def
these groups
A/5/2019 4/5/2019 Prepared 9-page memo summarizing proposal for data coltection with 315 Add Cel
protected classes
4/16/2019 4/16/2019  jReviewed Draft Monitoring Plan for completeness 3 Add Del
4/17/2019 4/17/2019 Reviewed Impartial P'ollcung paragraphs of Consent Decree to identify 3 Add Del
sources of data, metrics, and methods
4/18/2019 4/18/201¢  |Completed monitoring plan for par. 58, 60, 61, 63 and 64 3 Add Del
4/19/2019 4/19/2019  |Completed monitoring plan for par. 65, 66, 67,70 and 71 3 Add Del
4/19/2019 4/19/2019  |Participated in IMT conference call 1 Add Del
4/22/2019 4/22/2019 Prepared additioqal paragraphs for the Monitoring Plan per request , Add Del
from Deputy Maonitor
Add Cel
Add Del
Add Del
Add Del
Total Hours 40 lRate $125.00
TOTAL LABOR: $5,000.00
Check here if you are not billing for any travel
INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $5,000.00
Invoice Comments/Notes:
Reset Form J Save Form




INVOICE

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate,
and the expenditures, dishbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
contract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. {U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections

3729-3730.) )
/é/—// Vot 5/ /200 7

Signature Date /

r Reset Form J Save Form




INVOICE

Vendor Name: Julie Solomon Invoice Date Involce Number
Remitto Address:E 5/5/2019

City: State S Zip: Billing Period From: Billing Period To:
Contact Name: Julie Solomon 4/1/2019 04/30/2019

etone: (L <

Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP c/o CNA; 3003 Washington Blvd; Arlington, VA 22201; acctspayable@cna.org

Remittance Type Requested: () Check (®EFT

LABOR (7he description should cfearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why It was necessary.)

Date of Date of Hottrs
Service(From) | Service(To) Description e 25t maementg| | Add/Delete
4/5/2019 4/5/2019 Read Pages 1-25 of CPD Investigative Findings 2
4/9/2019 4/9/2019 gz:{:rzz;cDe Call with Chip re: baseline data and procedure for reaching 0.75

Conference Call with Tom Christoff, SME, re: background infarmation
on Chicago £D CD and collaboration strategy

4/11/2019 4/11/2019  |Revlew Pages 50-99 of CPD Investigative Findings 2
Review reports and begin to develop data sources/metrics and

4/9/2019 4/9/2019

415120139 a/15/2019 methodology for year 1 monitoring plan 3
Continue development of data sources/metrics and methodology on

416/2019 N6/2019 draft of year 1 monitoring plan 2

4/17/2019 4/17/2019  |Read pages 100-161 of CPD Investigative Findings 1.5

4/18/2019 4/18/2019  |IMT Monltoring Conference Call with Schiff 1.25
Review of Consent Decree and investigative Reports to develop formal

4/22/2013 42212019 baseline data request for Crisis Intervention 1

4/26/2019 4/26/2019 Conference Call with Anthony Ray re: process for baseline data request 0.25

with Chicago PD and to schedule CPD briefings

Conference Call with Dr. Christopher Ivany, SME, re: Innovative use of
4/24/2019 4242019 |technelogy to meet the behavioral health needs of military with 1
potential innovative use for Chicago PD

Total Hours 15,25 Rate $125.00
TOTAL LABOR: $1,906.25

k Check here if you are not biliing for aﬁy travel

INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $1,906.25

Invoice Comments/Notes:

CERTIFICATION: By signing thls involce, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate,
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
contract. 1am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S, Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections
3729-3730.)

v 14l




INVOICE

Vendor Name: Paul Evans invoice Date Invoice Number

rRemit to Address GG May1,2019 Chicago#2
o - Il Billing Period From: Billing Period Ta:
Contact Name:Paut Evans Aprit1,2019 April 30,2019
Phong:‘_ Remittance Type Requested: ()Check  (®)EFT

Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S, Wacker Drive, Suita 7100; Chicage, IL 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com

|LAB OR (The description should clearly state the nature of the task pesformed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

Date of Date of . Hours
Service(From) : Service({To) Description {use.25 Rt Tncrements){ AddiDelete
Phone Call with Deputy Monitor Mcnrce regarding Deadly Force PO
4/4/2019 4/4/2019 Notificatins 025 Add Oal
Review consent decree notice protocols, draft a recommended process R :
4/4/2019 4/4/2019 for notifications 2.25 Add Osl
4/18/2019 4/18/2019  |Review materials sent by Laura Kunard, document production, agenda 1.25 add. [+ Dol
4718/2015 4)18/2019 Confe'rence cagl and Agenda with Deputy Monitor Monroe and : ada | e
associate monitors L
4/19/2019 4/19/2019  IMT conference call with all IMT and agenda 1 el
4/16/2019 4/16/2019  (read and review first year monitoring plan 125 el
Review consent decree on use of force and pravide comments and ;
411912019 41972019 additions to nthe first year monitoring plan 123 1t Sy
Total Hours 8.25 Rate  15125.00
TOTAL LABOR: $1,031.25
[R Check here if you are not billing for any travel
INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $1,031.25

Involce Comments/Notes:

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invaice is true, complete, and accurate,

and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts ara for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
cantract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent informatien, or the omisslon of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,
civil ar administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections

3729-3730.}

Sighdture o




Vendor Name: Medlock Enterprises, LLC.
Remit to Address:

City.

INVOICE

Invoice Date

invoice Number

5/3/2019

ME CPD 2019-1

State

Billing Period From:

Billing Period To:

Contact Name: Harold Medlack 4/17/2019 04/30/2019
Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP c/o CNA; 3003 Washington Blvd; Arlington, VA 22201; acctspayable@cna.org
LABOR (The description should clearly state the natura of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.}
Date of Date of - Hours
Service(From) Sel’ViCe(TO) Descnpt‘on (use 25 hr increments} AddfDelete
4/18/2019 4/18/2019  |Read CPD Consent Decree and Judge's Order (0800-1200) 4 Add Del
4/18/2019 4/18/2019  {Review IMT Year One Draft Monitoring Plan {1330-~1530) 2 Add Del
IMT Conference Cafl - Discuss Year One Draft Monitoring Plan
4/18/2019 4/18/2019 (1530-1630) 1 Add Oel
IMT Conference Call - Discuss Year One Draft Monitoring Plan, Site Visit,
4/19/2019 4/19/2019 Proper Invoicing Procedures (1000-1130) 15 el Del
Read CPD Consent Decree, draft Monitor Communications Standards,
4/19/2019 152019 Sample of Documents Produced, CPD Strategic Plan 1300-1700 + Add el
4/22/2019 4/22/2019  |Begin development of A&T Work Plan for Year one (0800-1200) Add Del
4/25/2019 4/25/2019  jDevelop A&T Document Request for Year One (0900-1300) 4 Add Del
Research AG Document Drop to determine A&T Document Needs/
4/29/2019 4/29/2019 Request {0800-1200) 4 Add Del
4/30/2019 4/30/2019  [Develop A&T Document Request (0900-1200) 3 Add Del
Total Hours 27.5 Rate $125.00
‘ TOTAL LABOR: $3/437.50
[ Check here if you are not billing for any travel
Purpose of Travel: -
TRAVEL/QDC'S - (ftemize and provide raceipts as specified on your contract}
Travel TrovélDate Expense Type Description QTY Rate Total Add/
Date(From) (To) Delete
Addj Del
i Subtotal Travel/OD(C's:
Privately Owned Vehicle Mileage Reimbursement
Date of . . s . . . . . Add/
Expense Description: {Include starting location and ending location) Miles Rate Total Delete
| Addl Del
4 Subtotal Mileage (rounded); S0
TOTAL TRAVEL: $0.00
, INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $3,437.50
Invoice Comments/Notes:
Reset Form Save Form




INVOICE

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate,
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
contract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,

civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statemants, false claims or otherwise, (U.S. Code Title 1 8, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections
3729-3730.) .

M&W/ May 3,2019

Signature { Date

Reset Form Save Form




Phone:
Email:
Invoice Date : 5/1/2019
Invoice Number : 0002
Billing Pericd: 4/1//2019 to 4/30/2019

Vendor Name: Stephen Rickman
Contact Name :Stei en Rickman

Bill to: Schiff Hardin LLP;Wacker Drive ,Suite 7100;Chicago, IL. 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com

Chicago Consent Decree
Date of service. Description of work. Hours

4/1/19. CET weekly meeting discussing talking points, community meetings
And next steps 1.0

4/5/19. Review and comments on talking points for Coalition mtg and
Developing anticipated questions for that group 1.25
Telephone mtg. With comms. Specialist re view final edits
For talking points .50

4/10/ 19. Reviewed notes from DM meeting with Coalition and developed/
Distributed comments on issues raised by Coalition. 1.5

4/12/19. Per request tracked data storage utilization from previous
Monitoring projects to help develop data storage estimates for
Manitoring team 3.25

4/15/19 . Participation in CET team to discuss Coalition mtg. outcome
Compensation for Coalition, and press announcement of team. 1.0
Identification and feedback for scheduling of July site visit. 25

4/16/19. . Review of CPD background information regarding community
Policing and scan to identify prospective data sources for
All of the assigned community policing paragraphs as part

Information for the monitoring plan. - 40
4/17/19. Review and identification and submiss;ion for data sources, data
Compliance metrics, and methodology for all assigned community
Paragraphs for the monitoring plan. . 5.5

Review of plan narrative and submission of comments 1.0



Review of agenda and participation in MT team meeting for

4/18/18.
Updates and next steps.

1.25

Review of complaint data and other related data provided
Concerning stops, arrests ,etc by Police District to prioritize
Areas for community engagement and areas of monitoring
Focus and comments provided to CET members.

4/20/19.

4.0

Review of agenda and participation in CET meeting covering

4/22/19,
Share point, team communications and meeting minutes

1.25

Review of state AG memo regarding School resource officer
Use of force and implications for monitoring priorities and
Review of relevant consent decree paragraphs and CPD
Requirements prior to 2015-2020 school year,

4/24/189.

2.0

Identification of relevant paragraphs for school resource officer
Selection criteria, and training and supervision; and identification
Of data sources, compliance metrics, methodology for revision

Of monitoring plan submission, 2.5

Identification and review of research/article regarding community
Meetings with Chicago police oversight board and summarizing
And sharing of findings with CET members.

4/26/19.
1.25

Preparation and participation in weekly CET team meeting with

4/29/19.
With updates from the Monitor.

75

Total Jabor hours — 32.25 hours Rate :$ 125.00 an hour

Total lzbor - $4062,50

Total amount Due: $4062.50

Certification: By signing this invoice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is
true, complete, and accurate; and the expenditures, disbursements, and cash receipts are for the
purposes set forth in the terms and conditions of the contract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or
fraudulent, information or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal, civil, or
administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims, or otherwise. (US Code Title 18, Section

1001 and Title 31, Sections 3729-3730).

r::::.!é_ ) .
Signatur‘{ Date
Stephen Rickman



Hyatt Place Chicago Downtown - The Locp
28 North Franklin Street

L 1 Chicago, IL 60606
Tel: 312-955-0950
HYATT Fax: 312-955-0951
PLACE"®
INVOICE
Room No. -
Arrival 03-21-2019
Departure 03-22-2019
Page No. 10of1
Folio Window 1
Confirmation No. Folio No. e
Booking No.
Date Description Charges Credits
03-21-2019 Accommodation 179.00
03-21-2019 Chicago City Occupancy Tax 23.07
12.89%
03-21-2019 lllinois State Tax 4.5% 8.06
03-22-2019 Master Card _ -210.13
Total 210.13 -210.13
Guest Signature Balance 0.00

t agree that my liability for this bitl is not waived and | agree
to be held persanally liable in the event that the indicated
person, company or association fails to pay for any part or
the full amount of these charges.

World of Hyatt Summary

Summary Invoice, please see front desk
for eligibility details.



INVOICE

Vendor Name: Theron L. Bowman, Inc. Invoice Date Invoice Number
Remit to Address 5/6/2019 2019075
City:i State- Zip: -_ Billing Period From: Billing Period To:
Contact Name: Theron L. Bowman, Ph.D. April 1,2019 April 30,2019
Phone:—ﬁ_: Remittance Type Requested: (O)Check (®EFT
Bill To:

LABOR (The description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

Date of Date of e o
Service{From) | Service(To) Description

4/18/2019 4/18/2019

Add/Delete

{use .25 krincrements)

Reviewed the orientation message, agenda and powerpoint delivered

by Laura (0.25). Prepare for and participate in the AM call (.75). !

Prepared a response to the plaintiff's request regarding SRO training
4/24/2019 4/24/2019 |and policies {.75). Reviewed and responded to 2 messages ref AG's 1
office correspondence (0.25).

Total Hours 2 Rate $125.00

TOTAL LABOR: $250.00
Check here if you are not billing for any travel
INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $250.00

Invoice Comments/Notes:

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invoice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate,
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
contract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections
3729-3730.)

Digitally signed by Theror L. Bowman 5r., Ph.D.
Theron L. Bowman Sr., Ph.D. §.201005.05 18:09:48 0590 05/06/2019

Signature Date

. ResetForm:i‘




Vendor Name: Will Johnson

INVOICE

Invoice Date

Remit to Address:_

Invoice Number

5/1/2019

002

City:_ State. Zip: - Billing Period From:

Contact Name: Will Johnson

Billing Period To:

4/1/2019

04/30/2019

Bill To: Schiff Hardin LLP; 233 S. Wacker Drive, Suite 7100; Chicago, [L 60606; MHickey@schiffhardin.com

Remittance Type Requested: (OCheck  (®)EFT

LABOR (the description should clearly state the nature of the task performed sufficient to allow the reviewer to determine why it was necessary.)

Date of Date of o Hours
Service(From) | Service(To) Description e 2Shrincrementy]  NO0/Delete

4/14/2019 4/14/2019  |Overall review of IMT First Year monitoring plan draft report 1.25
Review consent decree requirements for Supetrvision and provide

41412019 414/2019 guidance for IMT First Year monitoring plan draft report 15
Review consent decree requirements for Officer Wellness and provide

4/14/2019 A48 guidance for IMT First Year monitoring plan draft report 175

4/18/2019 4/18/2019  |Monitor & Associate Monitors Conference call 1

4/19/2019 4/19/2019 IMT Moqthly conference call. Discussion about the first year 125
monitoring report.
Telephone conference with analyst to prepare for Associate Monitor

4/30/2019 4/30/2019 team taskings and SME identification 0.75

4/30/2019 4/30/2019 Revngwe_d consent decree for documentation requests for first year :
monitoring plan

85 Rate $125.00

Total Hours
TOTAL LABOR: $1,062.50
Check here if you are not billing for any travel
INVOICE TOTAL DUE: $1,062.50

Invoice Comments/Notes:

CERTIFICATION: By signing this invaice, | certify to the best of my knowledge and belief that the invoice is true, complete, and accurate,
and the expenditures, disbursements and cash receipts are for the purposes and objectives set forth in the terms and conditions of the
contract. | am aware that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent information, or the omission of any material fact, may subject me to criminal,
civil or administrative penalties for fraud, false statements, false claims or otherwise. (U.S. Code Title 18, Section 1001 and Title 31, Sections

3729%-3730.)

~'Reset Form- .

, Digltally signed by Will Johnson
edone
‘A/"’(//% e Date: 2019.04.30 20:52:56 -05'00'

Signature

Date

T Swerom






